

Pace

RFQ# 420391

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	IOC	P&G Keene	Vehicle Maintenance	Battery Service	Eldorado National	Suburban Truck	Prevost	Kirks Auto	Area Diesel	Battery Systems	Aftermarket Parts	Neopart	Muncie Transit	Gillig	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
5	70629	0.77						1.15					0.83		0.84	1.99	0.77	
Mohawk		-						stock					stock		stock	stock	stock	
8	72079	192.67		193.39					258.28	227.00			225.27	192.67	215.99	196.75	254.40	
Neopart		-		stock					stock	stock			stock	stock	30d	stock	3w	
1	72125	70.15					70.15											
Eldorado National		-					4w											
5	71875	5.00						16.15	7.31				5.10		5.00		5.24	
Aftermarket Parts								stock	60d				stock		min 12, need 6		stock	
4	72121	62.00						91.75					68.27		62.00	62.19		
Gillig		-					stock						5w		min order qty	4w		
5	71441	6.38						26.95					7.55		6.38	6.99	7.10	
Muncie Transit		-					4w						5w		30d	no lead given	21d	
5	70220	7.95						32.35					17.51		11.30	16.25	7.95	
Mohawk		-					stock						stock		30d	stock	stock	
5	72057	3.37			3.37								3.55		9.38	7.15	3.62	
Vehicle Maintenance		-			stock								stock		min order qty	stock	stock	
6	72143	10.43						21.55	13.28				10.43	10.62	11.15	10.50		
Availability - Gillig		-					6w		60d				7w	7w	42d	stock		
3	71357	9.29						15.07					9.29					11.40
Aftermarket Parts								stock					stock					2w
5	72142	9.50						18.85					9.50	9.63	9.55	10.08		
Aftermarket Parts							6w						14w	7w	42d	6w		
4	71964	1.77								3.37			1.77		4.99	4.75		

Pace

RFQ# 420391

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	IOC	P&G Keene	Vehicle Maintenance	Battery Service	Eldorado National	Suburban Truck	Prevost	Kirks Auto	Area Diesel	Battery Systems	Aftermarket Parts	Neopart	Muncie Transit	Gillig	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
Aftermarket Parts										stock			stock		stock	stock		
5	71175	0.50											0.75		0.82	1.47	0.52	0.50
Hydraulic Electric													stock		min 50, need 20	stock	stock	14d
6	72058	3.83			4.96		107.95						5.21			17.75	3.83	35.00
Vehicle Maintenance		-			stock		6w						stock			stock	unapproved part	14d
5	72056	10.75						26.28					19.52		20.91		10.75	
Aftermarket Parts								stock			stock		stock		42d		unapproved part	
6	72094	14.91			14.91		26.95		15.05				22.41		21.75		24.75	
Vehicle Maintenance					stock		stock		stock				stock		30d		3w	
1	72120	97.15					97.15											
Eldorado National		-					stock											
7	72078	1,761.68		1,761.68			2,582.95		2,584.94	2,061.77			2,229.50		2,099.10	1,901.17		
P&G Keene		-		stock			8w		60d	stock			13w		30d	2w		
6	72109	600.00	1,083.82				620.84						1,261.82		1,217.05	1,000.00		600.00
Hydraulic Electric		-	8w				stock						5w		84d	4w		14d
1	72144	26.95					26.95											
Eldorado National		-					stock											
1	72163	26.95					26.95											
Eldorado National		-					stock											
4	72164	1,050.00	1,150.14										1,384.18		1,322.00	1,050.00		
Gillig		-	8w										14w		90d	2w		
3	72170	18.85					18.85						41.04		33.20			
Eldorado National		-					stock						8w		70d			

Pace

RFQ# 420391

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	IOC	P&G Keene	Vehicle Maintenance	Battery Service	Eldorado National	Suburban Truck	Prevost	Kirks Auto	Area Diesel	Battery Systems	Aftermarket Parts	Neopart	Muncie Transit	Gillig	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
4	72171	18.85					18.85		29.36				38.33		38.64			
	Eldorado National	-					stock		60d				9w		42d			
4	72172	18.85					18.85		33.80				37.09		37.09			
	Eldorado National	-					stock		stock				7w		min 10, need 4			
4	72216	147.25					291.55		210.00				148.34			147.25		
	Gillig	-					6w		120d				stock			stock		
5	72295	25.91					32.35		42.60				43.75		30.98		25.91	
	Mohawk	-					stock		60d				stock		30d		stock	
2	72301	245.00										245.00						
	Battery Systems	-							2w				3w					
4	72342	3.66					3.66						6.69		7.41	4.40		
	Eldorado National	-					4w						3w		21d	2w		
6	72384	6.99					11.37		20.42				9.62		14.75	6.99	10.42	
	Gillig	-					4w		60d				7w		stock	stock	5w	
7	72388	36.75					63.00		78.80				52.37	63.15	64.95	38.75	36.75	
	Mohawk	-					6w		60d				9w	7w	42d	stock	4w	
1	710021	43.15					43.15											
	Eldorado National	-					stock											
7	710043	256.04		256.04					341.93	322.00			316.00		288.78	276.50	328.26	
	P&G Keene	-		stock					60d	stock			14w		30d	2w	2w	
1	710140	43.77					43.77											
	Eldorado National	-					4w											
5	710168	442.90							564.71	499.00			522.76		485.00	442.90		

Pace

RFQ# 420391

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL																
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																		
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	IOC	P&G Keene	Vehicle Maintenance	Battery Service	Eldorado National	Suburban Truck	Prevost	Kirks Auto	Area Diesel	Battery Systems	Aftermarket Parts	Neopart	Muncie Transit	Gillig	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
Gillig		-							60d	stock			7w		30d	2w		
5	<b>710260</b>	395.04	395.04	398.42									508.54		449.99	415.00		
IOC		-	8w	stock									10w		56d	2w		