Pace RFQ# 420321
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Triangle |RomeTruck| CBM US | Interstate Vehicle Midwest Neopart | Suburban | Hydraulic Prevost Eldorado | Kirk's Auto Gillig Area Diesel | Aftermarket Muncie Mohawk | Coffman
Radiator | Parts-NO Power | Maintenance Bus Transit | Truck Parts | Electric National Parts Transit Truck
NO # of Bids BID
7 130613 2.78 14.26 12.80 17.69 14.76 13.70 2.78 12.55
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock 7d 2w stock 30d part stock
1 81297 43.15 43.15
Eldorado National 230973 - 2w
8 130611 172.00 256.67 172.00 220.00 291.66 317.71 246.40 240.66 255.86
unapproved
MW Bus 230970 - stock 7d 14d 4w 3w stock part stock
1 110135 3235 3235
Eldorado National 230973 stock
7 81298 48.25 48.25 61.28 80.41 53.40 67.90 53.68 58.98
CBM US 230969 - stock stock stock stock stock stock stock
1 81374 70.15 70.15
Eldorado National 230973 - Aw
1 81375 86.35 86.35
Eldorado National 230973 - Aw
4 81377 2.75 2.81 3.62 3.25 2.75
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock Sw 21d stock
4 81378 18.89 75.55 36.21 22.42 18.89
Mohawk 230978 - 1w stock 30d stock
2 120526 425.00 425.00 485.16
Triangle Radiator 230968 5d 7w
6 81409 26.99 33.00 35.97 44.81 26.99 33.80 35.37
unapproved
Muncie Transit 230978 14d stock stock stock part stock
2 81423 21.89 43.15 21.89
Aftermarket Parts 230976 stock stock
6 81441 41.00 41.00 53.71 53.31 43.82 55.38 41.86
unapproved
Hydraulic Electric 230972 14d 45d stock stock part stock
4 100247 2.70 3.66 2.99 3.85 2.70
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock stock 3w stock
3 81518 5.96 6.35 6.07 5.96




Pace RFQi#t 420321

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
|
Sku Winning bid | Triangle |RomeTruck| CBM US | Interstate Vehicle Midwest Neopart | Suburban | Hydraulic Prevost Eldorado | Kirk's Auto Gillig Area Diesel | Aftermarket Muncie Mohawk | Coffman
Radiator | Parts-NO Power | Maintenance Bus Transit | Truck Parts | Electric National Parts Transit Truck

NO # of Bids BID
Coffman Truck 230980 stock 21d 5d

8 81533 11.50 11.89 25.64 76.10 41.81 27.31 11.50 11.55 41.12
Muncie Transit 230978 stock stock 45d stock stock 21d stock stock

3 81534 33.25 57.21 33.25 38.02
Aftermarket Parts 230976 - iw 6w 21d

1 81536 490.00 490.00
Eldorado National 230973 - 4w

5 810010 325.00 500.00 405.00 325.00 630.00 529.87
Area Diesel 230975 - stock stock stock 21d 7d

2 1010002 6.62 7.51 6.62
Kirk's Auto 230974 - stock stock

1| 1010005 279.18 279.18
Eldorado National 230973 - stock

7| 1010003 21.76 26.00 59.75 27.24 41.96 29.99 21.76 26.96

unapproved

Hydraulic Electric 230972 - 14d stock stock stock 21d part stock

8| 1010011 890.00 1,112.80| 1,065.90 1,611.22 890.00 1,099.99 960.60 | 1,150.00 915.23
Kirk's Auto 230974 - stock stock 60d stock stock 21d 1od stock

3| 1210016 637.15 637.15 647.06 801.76
Eldorado National 230973 - stock 6w 10w

4 810026 875.69 875.69 | 1,095.92 1,070.70 878.72
Area Diesel 230975 - stock 4w 21d stock

4 810027 486.50 495.94 590.17 584.25 486.50
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock 9w 21d stock

8| 1010014 5.80 5.91 14.04 7.00 7.67 5.80 8.83 6.25 7.50

unapproved

Aftermarket Parts 230976 - stock 45d stock stock stock 21d part stock

4| 1010016 2,119.60 2,120.29 | 2,936.97 2,544.44 2,119.60
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock 7w 21d stock

6 810048 15.48 19.31 15.48 26.44 24.20 23.63 15.49
Area Diesel 230975 - stock stock stock stock 3w stock




Pace RFQi#t 420321

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
|
Sku Winning bid | Triangle |RomeTruck| CBM US | Interstate Vehicle Midwest Neopart | Suburban | Hydraulic Prevost Eldorado | Kirk's Auto Gillig Area Diesel | Aftermarket Muncie Mohawk Coffman
Radiator | Parts-NO Power | Maintenance Bus Transit | Truck Parts | Electric National Parts Transit Truck
NO # of Bids BID
4 810049 103.05 104.12 136.83 120.50 103.05
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock Sw stock stock
4 810064 2,841.92 3,576.19 5,605.44 4,540.00 2,841.92
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock 7w 21d stock
3 810071 641.50 641.50 747.50 642.23
Area Diesel 230975 - stock 21d stock
5 1010024 54.12 54.12 71.55 63.00 67.42 56.69
Area Diesel 230975 - stock 7w 21d 2w stock
7 810078 368.00 368.00 737.15 374.67 546.13 449.95 566.84 368.95
Hydraulic Electric 230972 - 14d 45d stock 5w 21d 2w stock
6| 1010028 9.05 19.13 12.50 1431 11.92 9.05 10.26
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock stock stock stock part stock
8| 1010032 80.34 80.34 82.99 189.80 108.15 125.91 110.00 92.59 106.32
unapproved
Neopart Transit 230971 - stock stock 45d stock 6w stock part stock
5 810110 297.69 297.69 506.51 370.88 463.37 333.37
Area Diesel 230975 - stock Sw 21d 3w stock
5 810130 372.66 799.00 376.45 561.91 438.20 372.66
Coffman Truck 230980 - 14d stock Sw 21d stock
6 810141 26.25 57.00 65.69 76.52 56.28 26.25 59.00
unapproved
Muncie Transit 230978 - 21d stock 3w stock part stock
4 810152 497.25 498.91 660.92 585.00 497.25
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock Sw 21d 5d
4| 1210078 340.75 599.35 350.00 340.75 344.25
Aftermarket Parts 230976 - 6w 8w 10w 60d
2| 1210086 133.20 172.75 133.20
TP101 230977 - 4w 3w
6 810179 42.98 43.00 42.98 52.95 52.89 58.17 44.85
Area Diesel 230975 - stock stock stock 21d 3w stock
5 810182 63.00 63.00 101.38 142.94 118.33 99.92




Pace RFQi#t 420321

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Triangle |RomeTruck| CBM US | Interstate Vehicle Midwest Neopart | Suburban | Hydraulic Prevost Eldorado | Kirk's Auto Gillig Area Diesel | Aftermarket Muncie Mohawk | Coffman
Radiator | Parts-NO Power | Maintenance Bus Transit | Truck Parts | Electric National Parts Transit Truck

NO # of Bids BID
Hydraulic Electric 230972 - stock stock stock stock stock

4 810206 9.81 11.15 13.20 11.68 9.81
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock Sw 21d stock

5 1210090 520.00 520.00 609.69 702.83 640.16 543.25
Hydraulic Electric 230972 - stock stock 5w 21d stock

6 810208 0.16 0.18 1.25 1.54 1.45 0.16 1.32

unapproved

Hydraulic Electric 230972 - stock stock 5w 21d part stock

5 810213 54.19 68.06 66.72 64.30 60.99 54.19
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock 7w 21d 3w 5d

5 810225 540.00 540.00 623.69 805.63 742.60 620.22
Hydraulic Electric 230972 - stock stock 7w 21d stock

4 810231 218.84 218.84 303.88 245.45 229.01
Availability - Coffman no lead
Truck 230980 - given 5w 21d stock

4 1010060 2,156.51 2,169.69 2,843.81 2,535.99 2,156.51

no lead

Coffman Truck 230980 - given 7w 21d stock

8 1010061 898.00 984.40 993.30 898.00 1,144.69 1,750.19 900.00 915.00 936.80
Kirk's Auto 230974 - stock stock stock stock 9w stock stock stock

4 1210109 470.16 510.84 546.76 528.08 470.16
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock Sw 21d stock

5 810245 212.52 225.00 239.97 247.14 253.00 212.52
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock stock 7w 21d stock

5 810276 1,373.60 1,400.00 1,875.12 2,709.11 1,745.09 1,373.60
Coffman Truck 230980 - 14d stock 6w 21d stock

6 810277 29.90 37.03 44.75 42.31 34.96 38.25 29.90
Coffman Truck 230980 - stock 4w 7w 21d 35d stock

4 810282 529.39 576.39 716.86 585.22 529.39

2stock, no lead

Coffman Truck 230980 - on bal of 2 7w 21d 5d

5 810292 269.41 420.00 279.25 642.14 310.87 269.41
Coffman Truck 230980 - 14d stock 8w 21d stock




Pace RFQi#t 420321

WHITE=NO BID ----

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Triangle |RomeTruck| CBM US | Interstate Vehicle Midwest Neopart | Suburban | Hydraulic Prevost Eldorado | Kirk's Auto Gillig Area Diesel | Aftermarket Muncie Mohawk Coffman
Radiator | Parts-NO Power | Maintenance Bus Transit | Truck Parts | Electric National Parts Transit Truck
NO # of Bids BID
1 810299 273.62 273.62
Eldorado National 230973 - 6w




