

Pace		RFQ# 420361																				
WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																					
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0		
Green=Disqualified	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Triangle Radiator	Rome Truck - NO BID	Prevost	Suburban Truck	Kirk's Auto	Midwest Bus - NO BID	Coffman Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Area Diesel	Muncie Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Gillig	Rex Sales	Rex Welding	Transit Parts 101	Eldorado National	
NO # of Bids																						
1	110135	32.35																			32.35	
Eldorado	231008	-																			stock	
3	110100	2.48													2.48	3.60	2.50					
Aftermarket Parts	231005	-													stock	stock	stock					
10	110136	68.89	81.29			129.35	69.58	75.00		73.88					84.99	68.89	107.90	148.00			107.90	
Eldorado National	231008	-	14d			45d	stock	stock		5d					21d	not bidding requested qty	7w	3w			stock	
3	120498	395.00		395.00															395.00		2,490.00	
Triangle Radiator	231009			5d															10d		6w	
1	140076	604.75																			604.75	
Eldorado National	231008	-																			stock	
4	120542	44.40								44.41		44.40	53.79			60.99						
Area Diesel	231003	-								stock	stock	21d			11w							
2	1410000	657.14															657.14				669.55	
Aftermarket Parts	231005	-															12w				stock	
4	1010002	3.75						6.56									5.82				3.75	7.51
Aftermarket Parts	231005	-						stock							21d		stock				stock	
1	1010006	20.95																			20.95	
Eldorado National	231008	-																			stock	
7	1010012	1,219.00						1,219.00		1,828.67		1,766.31	1,404.34			2,591.32	1,264.90		1,350.00			
Mohawk	231006							no lead given	stock	stock	stock	30d			5w	stock		no lead given				
3	1210016	599.35														790.63		647.06			599.35	
Eldorado National	231008															10w		6w			stock	
7	1010013	8.88								15.40	25.00	28.11	30.99			8.88	32.96	11.40				
Coffman Truck	231007									stock	stock	stock	21d	unapproved part	stock	unapproved part						
8	1010014	3.50				14.04		6.50		7.50			8.94	5.91	5.80	6.25		3.50				
Rex Sales	231014					45d		stock		stock			21d	stock	stock	unapproved part		stock				
7	1010015	894.00						894.00		955.58		1,163.85	1,246.01			2,465.18	1,040.00		1,225.00			
Kirk's Auto	231011	-						stock		stock	stock	45d			5w	1w		stock				

Pace

RFQ# 420361

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																				
Green=Disqualified	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Triangle Radiator	Rome Truck - NO BID	Prevost	Suburban Truck	Kirk's Auto	Midwest Bus - NO BID	Coffman Truck	Hydraulic Electric	Area Diesel	Muncie Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Gillig	Rex Sales	Rex Welding	Transit Parts 101	Eldorado National
3	1010060	2,156.51								2,156.51			2,535.00		2,837.60						
	Coffman Truck	231007	-							stock			21d		7w						
6	1010061	894.00						894.00		946.20			900.00		1,739.95	915.00		995.00			
	Kirk's Auto	231011	-					stock		stock			stock		9w	stock		stock			