

Pace

RFQ# 420360

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

Sku

Winning bid

Prevost

Midwest

Bus - NO

Kirk's Auto

Gillig

Neopart

Transit

Hydraulic

Electric

Vehicle

Maintenance

Area Diesel

Muncie

Transit

Aftermarket

Parts

Mohawk

Coffman

Truck

Eldorado

National

NO # of Bids

5

81061

33.36

Mohawk

231006

-

5

81183

9.76

Coffman Truck

231007

-

5

81352

73.34

Area Diesel

231003

-

5

81372

2.18

Coffman Truck

231007

5

81376

1.56

Area Diesel

231003

-

5

81422

1.51

Coffman Truck

231007

-

5

81430

281.44

Mohawk

231006

-

6

81444

57.00

101.43

72.34

72.08

75.57

76.62

57.00

Mohawk

231006

-

stock

stock

4w

21d

stock

stock

1

81536

490.00

490.00

Eldorado National

231008

-

6w

Pace

RFQ# 420360

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

| NO # of Bids       | Sku    | Winning bid | Prevost | Midwest Bus - NO BID | Kirk's Auto | Gillig | Neopart Transit | Hydraulic Electric | Vehicle Maintenance | Area Diesel | Muncie Transit | Aftermarket Parts | Mohawk          | Coffman Truck | Eldorado National |
|--------------------|--------|-------------|---------|----------------------|-------------|--------|-----------------|--------------------|---------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------------|-----------------|---------------|-------------------|
| 4                  | 810008 | 57.31       |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 57.31       | 67.45          | 74.91             |                 | 59.35         |                   |
| Area Diesel        | 231003 |             |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | stock             |                 | stock         |                   |
| 6                  | 810010 | 376.46      |         |                      | 405.00      |        | 500.00          |                    |                     | 376.46      | 629.55         | 803.66            |                 | 563.69        |                   |
| Area Diesel        | 231003 |             |         |                      | stock       |        | stock           |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | 5w                |                 | stock         |                   |
| 5                  | 810026 | 878.22      |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 885.69      | 1,070.65       | 1,089.47          | 1,182.21        | 878.22        |                   |
| Coffman Truck      | 231007 |             |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | 4w                | 3w              | stock         |                   |
| 4                  | 810027 | 486.50      |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 487.95      | 584.25         | 588.88            |                 | 486.50        |                   |
| Coffman Truck      | 231007 |             |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | 9w                |                 | stock         |                   |
| 6                  | 810030 | 1.53        | 4.40    |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 2.40        | 2.64           | 2.98              | 1.53            | 2.38          |                   |
| Coffman Truck      | 231007 | -           | stock   |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | stock             | unapproved part | stock         |                   |
| 6                  | 810031 | 1.81        | 14.44   |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 8.11        | 8.87           | 9.88              | 1.81            | 8.06          |                   |
| Coffman Truck      | 231007 |             | 60d     |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | 4w                | unapproved part | stock         |                   |
| 7                  | 810046 | 360.00      | 695.42  |                      |             |        | 381.33          | 360.00             |                     | 374.97      | 438.55         | 564.91            |                 | 374.63        |                   |
| Hydraulic Electric | 231001 |             | 60d     |                      |             |        | stock           | 14d                |                     | stock       | 21d            | 7w                |                 | stock         |                   |
| 6                  | 810060 | 33.00       |         |                      |             |        |                 | 33.00              |                     | 35.96       | 35.84          | 42.58             | 33.80           | 34.62         |                   |
| Hydraulic Electric | 231001 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 | stock              |                     | stock       | stock          | stock             | stock           | stock         |                   |
| 4                  | 810063 | 149.69      |         |                      | 229.85      |        |                 |                    |                     | 149.69      | 182.20         | 336.65            |                 |               |                   |
| Area Diesel        | 231003 | -           |         |                      | stock       |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | 7w                |                 |               |                   |

Pace

RFQ# 420360

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

|                     | Sku    | Winning bid | Prevost | Midwest Bus - NO BID | Kirk's Auto | Gillig | Neopart Transit | Hydraulic Electric | Vehicle Maintenance | Area Diesel | Muncie Transit | Aftermarket Parts | Mohawk          | Coffman Truck | Eldorado National |
|---------------------|--------|-------------|---------|----------------------|-------------|--------|-----------------|--------------------|---------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------------|-----------------|---------------|-------------------|
| NO # of Bids        |        |             |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     |             |                |                   |                 |               |                   |
| 7                   | 810066 | 93.11       |         |                      |             |        |                 | 101.00             | 93.11               | 162.75      | 154.80         | 170.37            | 106.43          | 143.21        |                   |
| Vehicle Maintenance | 231002 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 | stock              | stock               | stock       | 21d            | 6w                | unapproved part | stock         |                   |
| 6                   | 810070 | 859.37      |         |                      |             |        |                 | 870.00             |                     | 859.37      | 1,019.85       | 1,063.90          | 1,125.31        | 866.50        |                   |
| Area Diesel         | 231003 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 | stock              |                     | stock       | 21d            | 7w                | 3w              | stock         |                   |
| 3                   | 810073 | 102.50      |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     |             | 102.50         | 124.48            |                 | 104.56        |                   |
| Muncie Transit      | 231004 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     |             | stock          | 6w                |                 | stock         |                   |
| 7                   | 810078 | 368.00      | 737.15  |                      |             |        |                 | 368.00             |                     | 374.21      | 449.95         | 546.13            | 566.84          | 378.62        |                   |
| Hydraulic Electric  | 231001 | -           | 60d     |                      |             |        |                 | 21d                |                     | stock       | 21d            | 5w                | 2w              | stock         |                   |
| 5                   | 810079 | 370.00      |         |                      |             |        |                 | 370.00             |                     | 374.21      | 449.95         | 577.52            |                 | 378.62        |                   |
| Hydraulic Electric  | 231001 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 | 14d                |                     | stock       | 21d            | 7w                |                 | stock         |                   |
| 4                   | 810084 | 641.69      |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 641.69      | 907.33         | 1,255.73          |                 | 724.95        |                   |
| Area Diesel         | 231003 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | 6w                |                 | no lead given |                   |
| 5                   | 810093 | 21.74       |         |                      |             |        |                 | 22.00              | 21.74               |             | 36.75          | 40.88             |                 | 31.60         |                   |
| Vehicle Maintenance | 23100  | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 | stock              | stock               |             | 21d            | 7w                |                 | 5d            |                   |
| 5                   | 810098 | 235.90      | 373.94  |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     |             | 262.10         | 279.35            | 288.88          | 235.90        |                   |
| Coffman Truck       | 231007 | -           | 60d     |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     |             | 21d            | stock             | stock           | stock         |                   |
| 4                   | 810123 | 52.96       |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 53.21       | 61.92          | 69.48             |                 | 52.96         |                   |
| Coffman Truck       | 231007 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | stock          | 5w                |                 | stock         |                   |

Pace

RFQ# 420360

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

|                    | Sku    | Winning bid | Prevost | Midwest Bus - NO BID | Kirk's Auto | Gillig | Neopart Transit | Hydraulic Electric | Vehicle Maintenance | Area Diesel | Muncie Transit | Aftermarket Parts | Mohawk          | Coffman Truck | Eldorado National |
|--------------------|--------|-------------|---------|----------------------|-------------|--------|-----------------|--------------------|---------------------|-------------|----------------|-------------------|-----------------|---------------|-------------------|
| NO # of Bids       |        |             |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     |             |                |                   |                 |               |                   |
| 6                  | 810125 | 42.00       |         |                      |             |        | 80.47           |                    |                     | 91.48       | 105.95         | 107.61            | 42.00           | 94.72         |                   |
| Neopart Transit    | 231000 | -           |         |                      |             |        | stock           |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | stock             | unapproved part | stock         |                   |
| 5                  | 810141 | 26.25       |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 59.99       | 56.28          | 75.62             | 26.25           | 59.00         |                   |
| Muncie Transit     | 231004 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | stock          | 3w                | unapproved part | stock         |                   |
| 4                  | 810143 | 9.32        |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 10.47       | 10.30          | 11.64             |                 | 9.32          |                   |
| Coffman Truck      | 231007 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | 3w                |                 | stock         |                   |
| 2                  | 810165 | 1,083.21    |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     |             |                | 1,083.21          |                 |               | 1,092.00          |
| Aftermarket Parts  | 231005 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     |             |                | 6w                |                 |               | stock             |
| 5                  | 810174 | 2.67        |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 2.70        | 3.06           | 3.53              | 4.90            | 2.67          |                   |
| Coffman Truck      | 231007 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | stock             | 3w              | stock         |                   |
| 5                  | 810180 | 5.97        |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 6.03        | 6.95           | 8.09              | 8.53            | 5.97          |                   |
| Coffman Truck      | 231007 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | stock          | stock             | 3w              | stock         |                   |
| 4                  | 810181 | 2.32        |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | 2.35        | 2.58           | 3.07              |                 | 2.32          |                   |
| Coffman Truck      | 231007 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 |                    |                     | stock       | 21d            | 6w                |                 | stock         |                   |
| 5                  | 810182 | 63.00       |         |                      |             |        |                 | 63.00              |                     | 101.35      | 117.93         | 139.27            |                 | 99.71         |                   |
| Hydraulic Electric | 231001 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 | stock              |                     | stock       | stock          | stock             |                 | stock         |                   |
| 5                  | 810184 | 58.69       |         |                      |             |        |                 | 58.75              |                     | 58.69       | 69.19          | 74.91             |                 | 62.24         |                   |
| Area Diesel        | 231003 | -           |         |                      |             |        |                 | stock              |                     | stock       | 21d            | 4w                |                 | stock         |                   |

Pace

RFQ# 420360

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

0

Green=Disqualified

Sku

Winning bid

Prevost

Midwest  
Bus - **NO  
BID**

Kirk's Auto

Gillig

Neopart  
Transit

Hydraulic  
Electric

Vehicle  
Maintenance

Area Diesel

Muncie  
Transit

Aftermarket  
Parts

Mohawk

Coffman  
Truck

Eldorado  
National

NO # of Bids

|   |                     |          |   |  |  |  |  |  |          |          |          |          |       |          |  |
|---|---------------------|----------|---|--|--|--|--|--|----------|----------|----------|----------|-------|----------|--|
| 4 | 810197              | 136.98   |   |  |  |  |  |  |          | 150.75   | 150.54   | 169.52   |       | 136.98   |  |
|   | Coffman Truck       | 231007   | - |  |  |  |  |  |          | stock    | 21d      | stock    |       | stock    |  |
| 4 | 810211              | 2,494.96 |   |  |  |  |  |  |          | 2,494.96 | 2,981.25 | 4,217.13 |       | 2,505.44 |  |
|   | Area Diesel         | 231003   | - |  |  |  |  |  |          | stock    | 21d      | 9w       |       | stock    |  |
| 6 | 810216              | 4.07     |   |  |  |  |  |  | 4.07     | 4.34     | 4.75     | 5.57     | 7.44  | 4.29     |  |
|   | Vehicle Maintenance | 231002   | - |  |  |  |  |  | stock    | stock    | 21d      | 5w       | 3w    | stock    |  |
| 4 | 810234              | 190.94   |   |  |  |  |  |  |          | 216.98   | 222.02   | 235.27   |       | 190.94   |  |
|   | Coffman Truck       | 231007   | - |  |  |  |  |  |          | stock    | stock    | stock    |       | stock    |  |
| 5 | 810236              | 8.15     |   |  |  |  |  |  |          | 8.15     | 8.92     | 10.04    | 12.25 | 8.44     |  |
|   | Area Diesel         | 231003   | - |  |  |  |  |  |          | stock    | 21d      | 5w       | 21d   | stock    |  |
| 5 | 810276              | 1,300.00 |   |  |  |  |  |  | 1,300.00 | 1,487.83 | 1,745.09 | 2,659.25 |       | 1,373.60 |  |
|   | Hydraulic Electric  | 231001   | - |  |  |  |  |  | stock    | stock    | 21d      | 6w       |       | stock    |  |