

Pace

RFQ# 420294

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

| | | TOTAL | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|--------------|-------------------|-------------|-------------------|----------|----------------|----------------|-----------------|------------------|---------|-------------------|--------|-------------|--------------------|--------|---------------|----------------|-------------|
| | | 0 | | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 |
| NO # of Bids | Sku | Winning bid | Triangle Radiator | Eldorado | Suburban Truck | Vehicle Maint. | Neopart Transit | Interstate Power | Prevost | Aftermarket Parts | Gillig | Area Diesel | Hydraulic Electric | Mohawk | Coffman Truck | Muncie Transit | Kirk's Auto |
| 4 | 81378 | 18.59 | | 75.55 | | | | | | 36.21 | | | | 18.59 | | 22.42 | |
| | Mohawk | 230874 | | 1W | | | | | | stock | | | | stock | | 30D | |
| 2 | 120526 | 425.00 | 425.00 | | | | | | | 485.16 | | | | | | | |
| | Triangle Radiator | 230878 | - | 3D | | | | | | 7W | | | | | | | |
| 4 | 81397 | 534.20 | | | | | | | | 765.79 | | 535.95 | | | 534.20 | 625.20 | |
| | Coffman Truck | 230873 | | | | | | | | 5W | | stock | | | stock | 30D | |
| 6 | 81444 | 57.00 | | | | | 72.08 | | 101.43 | 76.71 | 72.34 | | | 57.00 | | 75.59 | |
| | Mohawk | 230874 | | | | | 4W | | stock | stock | 1W | | | stock | | 30D | |
| 5 | 120541 | 45.21 | | | | | | | | 56.37 | | 45.76 | | 55.20 | 45.21 | 52.65 | |
| | Coffman Truck | 230873 | | | | | | | | 5W | | stock | | 2W | stock | 30D | |
| - | 81497 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | BLANKET PO 229022 | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 4 | 100247 | 2.73 | | | | | | | | 3.66 | | 2.73 | | 3.95 | 2.75 | | |
| | Area Diesel | 230880 | | | | | | | | stock | | stock | | 3W | stock | | |
| 3 | 81534 | 33.25 | | 57.21 | | | | | | 33.25 | | | | | | 38.02 | |
| | Aftermarket Parts | 230876 | | 2W | | | | | | 6W | | | | | | 21D | |
| 4 | 1310001 | 577.96 | | | | | | 577.96 | | 1,080.50 | | | 850.00 | 973.36 | | | |
| | Interstate Power | 230879 | | | | | | stock | | stock | | | 10D | 3W | | | |
| 6 | 810010 | 325.00 | | | | | 540.00 | | | | | 325.00 | 640.00 | | 563.69 | 631.20 | 340.00 |
| | Area Diesel | 230880 | | | | | stock | | | | | stock | 14D | | 2D | 30D | stock |
| 5 | 1010002 | 3.75 | | 7.51 | | | | | | 3.75 | | | 3.85 | | | 5.90 | 6.51 |
| | Aftermarket Parts | 230876 | | stock | | | | | | stock | | | stock | | | 21D | stock |
| 6 | 1010003 | 27.10 | | | | | | | 59.75 | 41.96 | | 27.20 | 27.20 | 33.76 | 27.10 | | |
| | Coffman Truck | 230873 | | | | | | 60D | stock | | | stock | 14D | 4W | stock | | |

Pace

RFQ# 420294

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

| | | TOTAL | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|--------------|--------------------|-------------|-------------------|----------|----------------|----------------|-----------------|------------------|---------|-------------------|--------|-------------|--------------------|----------|---------------|----------------|-------------|
| | | 0 | | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 |
| NO # of Bids | Sku | Winning bid | Triangle Radiator | Eldorado | Suburban Truck | Vehicle Maint. | Neopart Transit | Interstate Power | Prevost | Aftermarket Parts | Gillig | Area Diesel | Hydraulic Electric | Mohawk | Coffman Truck | Muncie Transit | Kirk's Auto |
| 5 | 1010004 | 181.49 | | | | | | | | 235.62 | | 181.49 | 400.00 | | 188.95 | 203.10 | |
| | Area Diesel | 230880 | - | | | | | | | 4W | | stock | 14D | | stock | 30D | |
| 3 | 1210016 | 599.00 | | 599.00 | | | | | | 801.76 | 647.06 | | | | | | |
| | Eldorado | 230867 | - | stock | | | | | | 10W | 6W | | | | | | |
| 5 | 810027 | 486.50 | | | | | 651.73 | | | 590.17 | | 495.94 | | | 486.50 | 584.50 | |
| | Coffman Truck | 230873 | - | | | | stock | | | 9W | | stock | | | stock | 30D | |
| 7 | 1010015 | 896.00 | | | | | 1,236.60 | | | 1,657.15 | | 1,124.19 | | 1,040.00 | 955.58 | 1,100.00 | 896.00 |
| | Kirk's Auto | 230881 | - | | | | stock | | | 4W | | stock | | 7D | stock | 45D | stock |
| 4 | 1010016 | 2,120.29 | | | | | | | | 2,936.97 | | 2,120.29 | | | 2,123.86 | 2,545.00 | |
| | Area Diesel | 230880 | - | | | | | | | 7W | | stock | | | stock | 21D | |
| 4 | 810049 | 103.53 | | | | | | | | 136.83 | | 104.49 | | | 103.53 | 120.75 | |
| | Coffman Truck | 230873 | - | | | | | | | 5W | | stock | | | stock | stock | |
| 4 | 810064 | 2,841.92 | | | | | | | | 5,605.44 | | 3,578.10 | | | 2,841.92 | 4,545.45 | |
| | Coffman Truck | 230873 | - | | | | | | | 7W | | stock | | | stock | 21D | |
| 7 | 810078 | 369.00 | | | | | | | 737.15 | 546.13 | | 374.19 | 369.00 | 556.84 | 374.17 | 449.95 | |
| | Hydraulic Electric | 230871 | - | | | | | 60D | | 5W | | stock | 14D | 3W | stock | 21D | |
| 5 | 810079 | 374.00 | | | | | | | | 584.23 | | 374.19 | 374.00 | | 374.17 | 449.95 | |
| | Hydraulic Electric | 230871 | - | | | | | | | 7W | | stock | 14D | | stock | 21D | |
| 5 | 810101 | 207.61 | | | | | | | | 264.49 | | 207.61 | | 209.16 | 208.52 | 243.03 | |
| | Area Diesel | 230880 | - | | | | | | | 6W | | stock | | 3W | stock | stock | |
| 5 | 810102 | 2.92 | | | | | | | | 3.79 | | 3.11 | | 3.56 | 2.92 | 3.38 | |
| | Coffman Truck | 230873 | - | | | | | | | 5W | | stock | | 30D | stock | 21D | |
| 5 | 810110 | 247.69 | | | | | | | | 506.51 | | 247.69 | | 463.37 | 333.37 | 371.02 | |
| | Area Diesel | 230880 | - | | | | | | | 5W | | stock | | 3W | stock | 21D | |

Pace

RFQ# 420294

WHITE=NO BID

| | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|--|--|-------|--|--|---|---|---|---|---|--|---|---|---|---|---|---|---|
| | | TOTAL | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | | 0 | | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 |

Green=Disqualified

| NO # of Bids | Sku | Winning bid | Triangle Radiator | Eldorado | Suburban Truck | Vehicle Maint. | Neopart Transit | Interstate Power | Prevost | Aftermarket Parts | Gillig | Area Diesel | Hydraulic Electric | Mohawk | Coffman Truck | Muncie Transit | Kirk's Auto |
|--------------|------------------------------|-------------|-------------------|---------------|----------------|----------------|-----------------|------------------|---------|-------------------|--------|---------------------------|--|-----------------|---------------|----------------|-------------|
| 5 | 1210056 | 5.63 | | | | | | | | 7.18 | | 5.69 | | 7.01 | 5.63 | 6.56 | |
| | Coffman Truck | 230873 | - | | | | | | | 7W | | stock | | 4W | stock | 21D | |
| 7 | 1010038 | 29.70 | | | | | 31.10 | | | 59.39 | | 45.99 | 30.00 | 29.70 | 45.01 | 53.52 | |
| | Hydraulic Electric | 230871 | - | | | | stock | | | stock | | stock | 14D | unapproved part | stock | 21D | |
| 1 | 810129 | 378.39 | | 378.39 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Eldorado | 230867 | - | 6W | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | 1110002 | 41.51 | | 41.51 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Eldorado | 230867 | - | 2W | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 8 | 1210070 | 46.35 | | | | 52.48 | | 50.75 | 66.08 | | | 58.18 | 46.35 | 53.37 | 46.57 | 57.50 | |
| | Hydraulic Electric | 230871 | - | | | stock | | 60D | stock | | | stock | 14D | 4W | stock | 21D | |
| 6 | 810141 | 23.25 | | | | | | | 76.52 | | | 59.99 | 33.00 | 23.25 | 59.00 | 69.00 | |
| | Coffman Truck | 230873 | - | | | | | | | 3W | | part verification pending | incorrect item received pending resolution | unapproved part | stock | 21D | |
| 4 | 1210078 | 340.75 | | 567.68 | | | | | | 340.75 | 350.00 | | | | | 344.25 | |
| | Aftermarket Parts | 230876 | - | no lead given | | | | | | stock | 8W | | | | | 5 min, need 4 | |
| 1 | 1210083 | 122.10 | | 122.10 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Eldorado | 230867 | - | 4W | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 1 | 810215 | 21.55 | | 21.55 | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| | Eldorado | 230867 | - | 4W | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
| 5 | 810227 | 919.42 | | | | | | | | 1,458.50 | | 919.42 | 920.00 | | 1,111.14 | 1,325.25 | |
| | Area Diesel | 230880 | - | | | | | | | 5W | | stock | stock | | stock | 21D | |
| 4 | 1010060 | 2,158.12 | | | | | | | | 2,843.81 | | 2,158.12 | | | 2,159.00 | 2,537.95 | |
| | Availability - Coffman Truck | 230873 | - | | | | | | | 7W | | no lead given | | | stock | 21D | |
| | | 1010061 | 899.00 | | | | 984.40 | | | 1,750.19 | | 1,143.68 | | 925.00 | 936.80 | 900.00 | 899.00 |

Pace

RFQ# 420294

WHITE=NO BID

Green=Disqualified

| | TOTAL | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|---------------------|--------|-------------|-------------------|----------|----------------|----------------|-----------------|------------------|---------|-------------------|--------|-------------|--------------------|--------|---------------|----------------|-------------|
| | 0 | | | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 | 0 |
| NO # of Bids | Sku | Winning bid | Triangle Radiator | Eldorado | Suburban Truck | Vehicle Maint. | Neopart Transit | Interstate Power | Prevost | Aftermarket Parts | Gillig | Area Diesel | Hydraulic Electric | Mohawk | Coffman Truck | Muncie Transit | Kirk's Auto |
| Kirk's Auto | 230881 | - | | | | stock | | | | 9W | | stock | | stock | stock | stock | stock |
| 5 | 810236 | 8.09 | | | | | | | | 10.16 | | 8.09 | | 12.50 | 8.44 | 8.92 | |
| Area Diesel | 230880 | - | | | | | | | | 5W | | stock | | 30D | stock | 21D | |
| 7 | 810271 | 36.43 | | | | 36.43 | | | | 99.41 | | 82.94 | 39.00 | 72.64 | 73.00 | 82.02 | |
| Vehicle Maintenance | 230869 | - | | | | stock | | | | 4W | | stock | stock | 21D | 5D | 21D | |
| 2 | 810284 | 480.31 | | | | | | | | | | | | | 480.31 | 524.87 | |
| Coffman Truck | 230873 | - | | | | | | | | | | | | | stock | 21D | |