

Pace

RFQ# 420260

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Eldorado National	Interstate Power	Coffman Truck	Kirk's Auto	TP101	Neopart Transit	Gillig	Area Diesel	Prevost	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
7	80883	1.54								16.13	16.00		20.58	16.00	18.63	1.55	1.54
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-								4W	stock		45D	stock	stock	stock	stock
6	130473	0.07				1.18	1.51						0.19	0.07	0.09	0.07	
Muncie Transit	230814	-				5D	stock						stock	stock	no lead given	stock	
5	130613	2.92				14.26	12.55							13.70	18.19	2.92	
Coffman Truck	230820	-				stock	stock							30D	stock	unapproved part	
4	81142	12.48											49.98	38.95	19.60	12.48	
Mohawk	230816												60D	35D	stock	stock	
5	81066	41.99					95.65					96.75		41.99	75.49	42.84	
Muncie Transit	230814	-					stock					stock		stock	stock	stock	
6	81156	30.00									61.20		73.00	57.00	59.40	30.00	51.50
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-									3W		stock	21D	stock	unapproved part	stock
6	81162	3.35									14.80		18.29	14.30	16.16	3.40	3.35
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-									stock		stock	21D	stock	stock	stock
5	120335	8.98		10.09		15.71		15.99						8.98	13.73		
Muncie Transit	230814	-		stock		10D		stock						30D	7W		
3	120502	87.41									95.01			87.41	116.74		
Muncie Transit	230814	-									stock			stock	5W		
3	120520	87.41									95.01			87.41	120.63		
Muncie Transit	230814										stock			stock	6W		
4	81384	5.22					5.22					5.28		6.22	7.26		
Coffman Truck	230820						stock					stock		21D	5W		
6	81407	155.90					155.90					158.48		182.75	208.65	216.88	157.00

Pace		RFQ# 420260															
WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Eldorado National	Interstate Power	Coffman Truck	Kirk's Auto	TP101	Neopart Transit	Gillig	Area Diesel	Prevost	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
Coffman Truck	230820						stock					stock		21D	21W	stock	14D
4	81499	20.42					20.42					20.81		23.99	25.92		
Coffman Truck	230820						stock					stock		stock	6W		
4	110153	7.44					7.44					7.47		8.90	9.78		
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D	7W		
1	120553	258.02					258.02										
Eldorado National	230809						stock										
3	81534	33.25					57.21							38.02	33.25		
Aftermarket Parts	230818						2W							21D	6W		
5	1210000	44.42					44.42					45.14		52.55	56.93		57.00
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D	5W		14D
7	1010003	27.20					27.25					27.22	59.75	30.05	43.20	33.76	27.20
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-					stock					stock	stock	21D	stock	21D	14D
8	1010011	814.00					939.97	814.00		1,194.48		1,111.36	1,611.22	962.95	1,789.39	1,100.00	
Kirk's Auto	230821	-					stock	stock		stock		stock	60D	21D	5W	stock	
7	1010012	1,266.00					1,828.67	1,279.00		1,422.36		1,729.36		2,044.95	2,618.76	1,266.00	
Mohawk	230816	-					stock	stock		10D		stock		21D	5W	stock	
3	1210016	647.06					700.00					647.06			813.21		
Gillig	230813	-					stock					6W			10W		
4	810027	486.94					488.47					486.94		584.75	588.88		
Area Diesel	230824	-					stock					stock		21D	stock		
6	1010013	11.40					27.65				15.68	28.10		31.10	33.14	11.40	
Neopart Transit	230823	-					stock				stock	stock		21D	stock	unapproved part	

Pace		RFQ# 420260															
WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Eldorado National	Interstate Power	Coffman Truck	Kirk's Auto	TP101	Neopart Transit	Gillig	Area Diesel	Prevost	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
4	810028	64.13			134.95						64.13			107.00	80.00		
Gillig	230813	-			4W						stock			stock	6W		
6	810030	1.53					2.38					2.49	4.40	2.64	3.00	1.53	
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock	45D	21D	stock	unapproved part	
6	810031	1.81					8.06					8.11	14.44	8.87	9.94	1.81	
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock	45D	21D	4W	unapproved part	
7	1010015	846.00					955.58	846.00		1,236.60		1,148.69		1,700.00	1,657.15	1,040.00	
Kirk's Auto	230821	-					stock	stock		stock		stock		bid 2, need 6	4W	7D	
4	1010016	2,125.69					2,128.00					2,125.69		2,545.75	2,936.97		
Area Diesel	230824	-					stock					stock		21D	7W		
3	1210020	43.00			70.15						43.50				43.00		
Aftermarket Parts	230818	-			stock						stock				stock		
3	810051	126.38			126.38									149.15	218.39		
Eldorado National	230809	-			4W									30D	4W		
3	810073	104.56					104.56							122.99	124.48		
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock							21D	7W		
6	810079	374.20					384.70			421.25		374.20		449.99	591.11		375.00
Area Diesel	230824	-					stock			stock		stock		21D	7W		14D
4	1210038	1,969.69					1,987.43					1,969.69		2,375.65	3,028.93		
Area Diesel	230824	-					5D					stock		21D	10W		
8	1010032	83.99					106.32			84.26		108.10	189.80	124.40	125.91	94.00	83.99
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-					stock			stock		stock	stock	stock	stock	unapproved part	stock
7	810098	235.69					237.14					235.69	373.94	262.15	279.35	289.88	237.00

Pace		RFQ# 420260															
WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Eldorado National	Interstate Power	Coffman Truck	Kirk's Auto	TP101	Neopart Transit	Gillig	Area Diesel	Prevost	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
Area Diesel	230824	-					stock					stock	45D	stock	6W	stock	14D
5	810102	2.92					2.92					3.04		3.38	3.85	3.83	
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D	5W	stock	
5	810110	247.69					333.37					247.69		371.17	536.90	469.31	
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					no lead given		30D	5W	2W	
1	1210055	1.87			1.87												
Eldorado National	230809	-			stock												
6	1010038	30.00					45.01					45.69		53.99	60.12	56.70	30.00
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-					stock					stock		21D	stock	unapproved part	stock
4	810130	372.66					372.66					375.69		438.28	570.81		
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D	5W		
5	1010042	225.00					327.30					331.69		689.92	495.26		225.00
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-					stock					stock		21D	10W		14D
6	810141	23.25					59.00					59.69		69.00	78.00	23.25	33.00
Availability - Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D	3W	unapproved part	14D
3	810143	9.22					9.22					10.46		10.35			
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D			
5	810154	7.97					7.97					8.04		9.28	9.59	9.76	
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D	8W	21D	
6	810155	241.64					241.64					286.69		281.99	308.83	318.82	253.00
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D	stock	28D	14D
3	810168	29.54			29.54						48.00				56.04		
Eldorado National	230809	-			4W							stock			stock		

Pace

RFQ# 420260

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL															
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Eldorado National	Interstate Power	Coffman Truck	Kirk's Auto	TP101	Neopart Transit	Gillig	Area Diesel	Prevost	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
1	810169	29.54			29.54												
Eldorado National	230809	-			4W												
1	810170	6.51			6.51												
Eldorado National	230809	-			4W												
1	810171	2.99			2.99												
Eldorado National	230809	-			2W												
5	810173	17.13					20.56					20.69		22.60	25.47	17.13	
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D	stock	unapproved part	
5	810184	59.00					59.75					60.12		69.21	75.79		59.00
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-					stock					stock		21D	4W		14D
4	810204	244.00					244.00					249.04		286.62	506.82		
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					stock		21D	5W		
6	810208	0.18					1.37					1.32		1.46	1.54	0.18	1.40
Area Diesel	230824	-					stock					stock		21D	5W	unapproved part	stock
1	810215	21.50			21.50												
Eldorado National	230809	-			4W												
3	1210098	1.81			7.99				8.89						1.81		
Aftermarket Parts	230818	-			4W				3W						8W		
2	1210100	7.00			7.00				7.21								
Eldorado National	230809	-			2W				3W								
4	1010060	2,159.00					2,159.00					2,169.69		2,540.40	2,843.81		
Coffman Truck	230820	-					stock					no lead on b/o		21D	7W		
7	1010061	920.00					951.92	920.00		984.40		1,131.82		990.11	1,771.02	925.00	

Pace

RFQ# 420260

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																	
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Eldorado National	Interstate Power	Coffman Truck	Kirk's Auto	TP101	Neopart Transit	Gillig	Area Diesel	Prevost	Muncie Transit	Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk	Hydraulic Electric
Kirk's Auto	230821	-					stock	stock		10D		stock		21D	9W	stock	
5	810276	1,375.00					1,424.00					1,834.69		1,982.22	2,796.50		1,375.00
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-					stock					stock		21D	6W		14D
5	810277	34.96	37.37								45.75			34.96	45.64	37.25	
Muncie Transit	230814	-	stock								4W			30D	7W	unapproved part	
-	810284	-															
		-															
4	810293	70.37					97.21					98.30		114.72	70.37		
Aftermarket Parts	230818	-					stock					stock		21D	stock		
4	1210129	28.00					34.56							40.77	47.77		28.00
Hydraulic Electric	230819	-					stock							stock	stock		14D
1	810296	15.71													15.71		
Aftermarket Parts	230818	-													2W		
1	810295	13.66													13.66		
Aftermarket Parts	230818	-													stock		