Pace RFQ 420256 Due: 6/30/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
NN A AN AN S A N N U S S I U S D D S E— U I — — — __—
Number of Bids, Winning Bid  Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Chicago Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Winning Bidder & PO SKU Brake & Diesel Automotive Partsand Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufactu Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number Supply Co.  Service Devices Sound Parts Systems ring Parts Program
8 41236 138.63 175.63 433.67 150.15 138.63 139.00 138.80 143.58 205.86
Mohawk 1 Stock
Manufacturing NORTHWEST HAS 0 Balance 2-4
230785 ON HAND 7 Days 4 Weeks Weeks Stock 21 Days 3-4 Weeks | 5 Weeks | 45 Days
7 40108 2.90 3.10 4.09 2.95 2.90 2.93 3.57 3.05
Muncie 230786 - Stock Stock July 28th | 21 Days Stock Stock Stock
3 30357 48.95 111.34 48.95 49.02
NFI Parts 230788 LOW STOCK - Stock 60 Days Stock
6 290616 113.89 113.89 116.00 132.18 114.96 128.85 148.70
5 Stock
Balance 21
Gillig 230780 Stock Stock Days 2-3 Weeks | Stock 60 Days
8 40106 2.05 15.77 6.75 2.05 2.20 6.56 6.57 9.17 13.50
Mohawk 2 Stock
Manufacturing Balance 45
230785 - 7 Days Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock Days Stock
7 40932 0.50 4.29 0.50 1.47 1.52 1.62 2.30 1.72
Mohawk
Manufacturing
230785 Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock
3 60735 615.55 615.55 1,988.00 2,994.14
ElDorado 230779 - Stock 60 Days 9 Weeks
4 20701 334.75 334.75 500.00 372.00 615.38
ElDorado 230779 - Stock 6 Weeks 60 Days 15 Weeks
11 40798 93.89 93.91 121.18 115.00 120.00 93.89 118.18 100.25 102.82 105.15 143.80 106.54
2 Stock 5 Stock
Balance 2-4 Balance 5
Midwest Bus 230783 - 1 Week 7 Days Stock Weeks 14 Days |July 13th [ Stock Stock Weeks 45 Days Stock
5 290653 16.00 17.50 16.00 20.65 18.53 23.25
HECS 230781 Stock Stock 21 Days Stock 45 Days
2 30356 154.76 154.76 194.85
0ON HAND QTY. 10 Pc Min
NFI Parts 230788 3 105 Days Stock
5 290289 8.76 8.76 10.89 9.91 10.13 10.57
2 Stock
Balance 45
HECS 230781 Stock 21 Days 2-3 Weeks | Stock Days
8 290614 5.05 5.05 26.63 5.52 49.99 7.25 20.40 12.86 | 29.95
Autex Automotive
Devices 230775 1 Day Stock Stock 90 Days Stock Stock Stock Stock
8 41213 97.88 100.00 102.37 121.55 | DQ 135.64 230.55 99.97 133.09 97.88
Not an 12 Stock
Suburban Truck Parts approved Balance 45
230789 - Stock Stock 7 Days OEM 21 Days Stock Stock Days Stock
10 41035 0.99 7.76 18.28 5.11 3.44 0.99 4.10 6.25 1.55 7.70 7.09
Mohawk 17 Stock 16 Stock
Manufacturing Balance 1-2 Balance 30
230785 7 Days Stock Weeks 7 Days Stock Days Stock Stock Stock Stock
6 41217 81.61 161.95 93.00 87.41 94.30 81.61 149.40
3 Stock
Balance 21
NFI Parts 230788 2-3 Weeks 6 Weeks Stock Days Stock 60 Days




Pace RFQ 420256 Due: 6/30/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
NN A AN AN S A N N U S S I U S D D S E— U I — — — __—
Number of Bids, Winning Bid  Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Chicago Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Winning Bidder & PO SKU Brake & Diesel Automotive Partsand Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufactu Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number Supply Co.  Service Devices Sound Parts Systems ring Parts Program
12 41227 13.03 13.03 59.62 25.75 39.79 21.12 14.25 26.72 41.60 31.59 34.10 34.23 23.75
5 Stock
Balance 7
CBM 230776 Stock Days Stock Stock 7 Days Stock Stock Stock 5 Weeks | Stock Stock Stock
9 40079 8.50 36.13 12.99 8.50 12.87 8.55 12.75 13.85 14.26 16.66
1 Stock
Balance 45
HECS 230781 - 7 Days Stock 10 Days 7 Days Stock Stock 2-3 Weeks | Stock Days
8 41205 0.66 0.92 0.66 3.25 0.85 0.74 0.75 1.09 0.83
Must
purchase in
multiples of | Must be Must
20 -5 Stock |ordered in order in
Balance 21 [multiples of quantity of
Midwest Bus 230783 |QTY. 25 - 7 Days 7 Days Stock Days 20 Stock Stock 45 Days 20 Stock
7 40162 0.32 1.59 0.32 0.99 0.97 0.99 1.23 1.33
Must be Must
Mohawk ordered in 6 Stock order in
Manufacturing multiples of Balance 45 quantity of
230785 QTY. 30 - 7 Days Stock 21 Days 20 Stock Stock Days 20 Stock
8 40090 0.53 0.95 0.68 0.75 0.54 0.54 0.53 0.67 0.89
4 Stock
Balance 21
NFI Parts 230788 7 Days Stock Stock Days Stock Stock Stock Stock
7 41132 48.52 105.86 48.52 98.72 86.77 102.05 109.56 98.50
Mohawk
Manufacturing
230785 - 7 Days Stock 60 Days Stock Stock 60 Days Stock
4 151976 960.30 1,396.51 1,050.00 960.30 965.79
Muncie 230786 - Stock 6 Weeks 30 Days 6 Weeks
5 10411 106.14 130.30 108.25 109.20 106.14 115.92
Neopart 230787 Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock
6 41266 969.26 1,271.95 1,175.37 969.75 1,139.56 969.26 1,048.40
NFI Parts 230788 - 4 Weeks Stock Stock 2-3 Weeks | 5 Weeks Stock
1 60772 18.85 18.85
ElDorado 230779 - Stock
9 41272 31.75 39.01 43.15 36.07 37.95 36.07 375 35.99 38.48 36.06
4 Stock
Balance 5
Neopart 230787 - 7 Days 2 Weeks 2-3 Weeks July 27th | 30 Days Stock Weeks 45 Days Stock
9 41273 31.75 39.41 43.15 36.07 37.95 36.07 31.75 32.47 38.48 36.03
Neopart 230787 - 7 Days 4 Weeks 2-3 Weeks July 24th | 30 Days Stock Stock 60 Days Stock
5 290673 890.00 1,100.00 890.00 978.65 1,026.46 | 1,172.84
Gillig 230780 - 4 Weeks 4 Weeks 21 Days Stock 90 Days
1 290675 59.35 59.35
ElDorado 230779 - 2 Weeks
3 10416 367.15 367.15 443.45 407.18
ElDorado 230779 - 6 Weeks 90 Days 7 Weeks




Pace RFQ 420256 Due: 6/30/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
N I NN S A S S N D S U S U I U I R U [ — S, S R
Number of Bids, Winning Bid  Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Chicago Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Winning Bidder & PO SKU Brake & Diesel Automotive Partsand Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufactu Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number Supply Co.  Service Devices Sound Parts Systems ring Parts Program
5 41280 92.87 105.96 99.10 131.00 92.87 186.53
Muncie 230786 - Stock 14 Days Stock Stock 7 Weeks
1 60792 188.18 188.18
ElDorado 230779 - Stock
6 152032 126.99 280.75 140.00 155.00 126.99 129.74 182.97
Muncie 230786 - Stock 2-4 Weeks 21 Days Stock Stock 45 Days
1 30483 119.31 119.31
ElDorado 230779 - Stock
1 110004 119.31 119.31
ElDorado 230779 - 2-4 Weeks
6 410000 99.75 134.95 130.00 101.25 104.99 99.75 155.32
8 Pcluly
28th, 4 Pc
Aug 17th
Balance 8
NFI Parts 230788 - 4 Weeks 4-6 Weeks Stock Stock Weeks 45 Days
8 410003 158.01 200.50 323.95 165.00 181.09 158.01 158.08 175.35 235.00
3 Stock
Balance 21
Muncie 230786 7 Days 4 Weeks 4-6 Weeks Days 21 Days 3-4 Weeks | 6 Weeks | 45 Days
7 410010 128.80 206.73 155.00 132.00 DQ 128.80 155.93 135.99 298.42
Not an
approved
Muncie 230786 - 7 Days Stock Stock OEM Stock Stock Stock Stock
3 1510008 12.85 13.60 13.50 12.85
17 Stock
Balance 10
NFI Parts 230788 - Stock 14 Days Weeks
1 110006 237.55 237.55
ElDorado 230779 - Stock
4 610009 1.76 6.97 3.10 4.25 1.76
NFI Parts 230788 - 2-4 Weeks 4 Weeks 30 Days Stock
7 210003 232.99 349.89 410.35 250.00 232.99 244.82 292.35 291.45
Muncie 230786 - 10 Days Stock 2-4 Weeks Stock 8-10 Weeks| 13 Weeks | 90 Days
1 610020 259.15 259.15
ElDorado 230779 - Stock
3 110014 106.15 134.95 106.15 114.08
32 Pc Min
NFI Parts 230788 QTY. 10 - Stock Buy 60 Days Stock
5 310008 91.90 120.99 97.80 94.55 91.90 95.73
15 Stock
Balance 30
Neopart 230787 - Stock 2-4 Weeks Days 3-4 Weeks | Stock
1 310009 110.60 110.60
NFI Parts 230788 - Stock




Pace RFQ 420256 Due: 6/30/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
NN A AN AN S A N N U S S I U S D D S E— U I — — — __—
Number of Bids, Winning Bid  Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Chicago Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Winning Bidder & PO SKU Brake & Diesel Automotive Partsand Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufactu Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number Supply Co.  Service Devices Sound Parts Systems ring Parts Program
9 610026 114.00 172.83 143.20 291.61 114.00 135.77 DQ 172.27 168.00 114.95 115.00
Not an
approved
HECS 230781 - Stock 60 Days Stock 14 Days Stock OEM Stock 3-4 Weeks | 10 Weeks Stock
6 610031 27.36 34.05 42.08 27.36 34.68 32.68 33.20
6 Stock
Coffman Truck Sales Balance 21
230779 - Stock Stock Stock Days Stock
1 610036 3,801.55 3,801.55
ElDorado 230779 - Stock
7 410036 376.45 475.26 405.00 390.71 383.52 376.45 403.91 479.69
3 Stock
Balance 6
Neopart 230787 - 7 Days 6 Weeks July 21st | 21 Days 3-4 Weeks |Weeks 60 Days
4 410053 48.97 48.97 55.03 54.89 96.96
Chicago Parts and
Sound 230777 - Stock Stock 30 Days 4 Weeks
3 410055 112.00 115.96 112.00 131.68
Kirk's Automotive
230782 - Stock Stock 30 Days
1 410070 76.07 76.07
NORTHWEST HAS 0
ElDorado 230779 ON HAND 2 Weeks
2 610070 42.74 53.95 42.74
WEST HAS 0 ON
ElDorado 230779 HAND - Stock 9 Weeks
4 610072 34.45 34.45 34.67 DQ 38.96 44.43
Not an
Area Diesel Sevice approved
230774 - Stock Stock OEM 30 Days Stock
1 1510146 84.52 84.52
ElDorado 230779 - 2 Weeks
1 1510151 166.27 166.27
ElDorado 230779 - 2 Weeks
1 1510152 48.55 48.55
NORTHWEST HAS 0
ElDorado 230779 ON HAND - 2-4 Weeks
5 2510070 4.44 4.76 4.44 4.47 4.86 6.55
Midwest Bus 230783 - 2 Weeks 10 Days 7-10 Days | 14 Weeks | 45 Days
1 610083 778.02 778.02
ElDorado 230779 - 2-4 Weeks
9 410080 278.41 381.44 280.00 278.41 289.55 [ DQ 279.45 287.69 280.23 362.76 356.72
Not an 9 Stock
approved Balance 5
Gillig 230780 - 7 Days Stock Stock 14 Days |OEM 21 Days Stock Weeks 60 Days Stock
1 110038 1.99 1.99
ElDorado 230779 - 1-2 Weeks




Pace RFQ 420256 Due: 6/30/2020

TOTAL
White = No Bid
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Number of Bids, Winning Bid  Acme Truck Area Autex CBM Chicago Coffman ElDorado General Gillig HECS Interstat Kirk's Lift-U  Midwest Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome Suburban  Transit Vehicle
Winning Bidder & PO SKU Brake & Diesel Automotive Partsand Truck Sales Truck e Power Automotive  Parts Bus Manufactu Truck Truck Parts Parts 101 Maintenance
Number Supply Co.  Service Devices Sound Parts Systems ring Parts Program
4 2510084 6.80 6.94 6.86 6.80 8.31
Neopart 230787 - 2 Weeks 10 Days 7-10 Days | Stock
1 110040 321.92 321.92
ElDorado 230779 - 4-6 Weeks
1 1510174 143.88 143.88
ElDorado 230779 - 4 Weeks
6 610098 2.16 4.81 3.85 2.30 2.16 2.79 2.56
Muncie 230786 - 2 Weeks Stock Aug 3rd Stock Stock 75 Days
1 1510209 8.59 8.59
ElDorado 230779 - 2 Weeks
1 2910042 44.99 44.99
1 Stock
Balance 5
NFI Parts 230788 - Weeks
1 110058 267.04 267.04
NFI Parts 230788 - 20 Weeks
1 410105 28.46 28.46
ElDorado 230779 - 4 Weeks
1 410106 115.09 115.09
NFI Parts 230788 - 9 Weeks
1 410107 127.71 127.71
NFI Parts 230788 - 9 Weeks
1 110059 227.46 227.46
up to 20
NFI Parts 230788 - Weeks
1 2510161 24.33 24.33
NFI Parts 230788 - 6 Weeks




