
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power

Eldorado 

National

Vehicle 

Maintenance

Coffman 

Truck

Hydraulic 

Electric

Suburban 

Truck

Kirk's Auto Neopart 

Transit

Prevost Area Diesel Gillig Aftermarket 

Parts

Mohawk Muncie 

Transit

TP101

                                    1 81055 132.29                 132.29 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  2W 

                                    6 81083 5.21                           8.28            7.75             8.72              11.28                   5.21             9.69 

Hydraulic Electric 230744 -                  stock  14D  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part  3W 

                                    9 110136 69.58                      81.29        107.90                 69.69           69.58           88.34         129.35            112.00               126.00           79.79 

Suburban Truck 230754 -                  10D  stock  stock  stock  stock  60D  7W  4W  4W 

                                    6 81066 41.99                      95.15           96.73           74.46              77.50                 42.84           41.99 

Muncie Transit 230748  stock  stock  2W  Stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 110058 2.86                              5.34                   2.86             5.90 

Mohawk 230750 -                  stock  stock  21D 

                                    8 110093 26.43                      35.00                 27.78           26.43           38.28           58.02              28.96                 53.14           39.09 

Suburban Truck 230754 -                  10D  stock  stock  stock  45D  4W  4W  30D 

                                    3 81335 16.90                      16.90              26.57           19.40 

Interstate Power 230752 -                  5D  4W  21D 

                                    7 81343 8.58                                 8.58           22.44           27.96           23.00              30.82                 10.52           25.15 

Vehicle Maintenance 230741 -                  stock  stock  45D  stock  4W 

 unapproved 

part  21D 

                                    6 81345 135.00                  139.91        135.00         142.99            167.47               135.94         166.66 

Hydraulic Electric 230744 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                    4 81377 2.75                           2.75             2.90                3.69             3.33 

Coffman Truck 230753  stock  stock  5W  21D 

                                    4 81378 18.59                     75.55              36.64                 18.59           22.42 

Mohawk 230750  2W  stock  stock  30D 

                                    5 81422 1.55                           1.90             2.15                2.55                   1.55             2.25 

Pace RFQ# 420235



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power

Eldorado 

National

Vehicle 

Maintenance

Coffman 

Truck

Hydraulic 

Electric

Suburban 

Truck

Kirk's Auto Neopart 

Transit

Prevost Area Diesel Gillig Aftermarket 

Parts

Mohawk Muncie 

Transit

TP101

Pace RFQ# 420235

Coffman Truck 230753  stock  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part  21D 

                                    2 81432 2,535.17          2,903.35        2,535.17 

Aftermarket Parts 230746  4W  6W 

                                    4 81455 4.28                           4.28             4.78                5.80             5.02 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  5W  stock 

                                    4 120539 43.70                      43.70           44.66              57.66           51.51 

Coffman Truck 230753  stock  stock  5W  21D 

                                    4 120540 47.35                      47.35           47.94              59.38           55.15 

Coffman Truck 230753  stock  stock  5W  21D 

                                    4 81499 20.42                      20.42           20.85              26.23           23.99 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  6W  stock 

                                    5 81503 11.50                      19.05           19.36              22.87                 11.50           22.45 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part  21D 

                                    5 81516 8.33                           8.33             8.71              10.31                 10.61             9.34 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock  3W  stock 

                                    2 1410000 669.55                 669.55            914.94 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  4W  12W 

                                    4 810014 9.08                           9.08             9.08              10.50           10.10 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock  21D 

                                    1 1010005 279.18                 279.18 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  4W 

                                    1 1010006 20.95                     20.95 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  1W 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power

Eldorado 

National

Vehicle 

Maintenance

Coffman 

Truck

Hydraulic 

Electric

Suburban 

Truck

Kirk's Auto Neopart 

Transit

Prevost Area Diesel Gillig Aftermarket 

Parts

Mohawk Muncie 

Transit

TP101

Pace RFQ# 420235

                                    3 1210011 78.34                   151.15              78.34         170.00 

Aftermarket Parts 230746 -                  4W  stock  4w 

                                    4 810026 878.72                  878.72         908.74        1,101.64     1,048.00 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  4W 

 1 ONLY, 

need 3 

                                    4 810027 488.69                  496.90         488.69            590.17         584.84 

Area Diesel 230757 -                  stock  stock  9W  21D 

                                    4 810028 64.13                   134.95           64.13              81.01         107.00 

Gillig 230749 -                  4W  stock  7W  stock 

                                    6 1010015 955.58                  955.58     1,236.60     1,163.69        1,657.15           1,060.00     1,700.00 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock  4W  2W  stock 

                                    4 1010016 2,128.00           2,128.00     2,130.29        2,936.97     2,545.95 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  7W  21D 

                                    7 810048 15.49                      15.49          18.00           19.86           16.14              26.75                 28.60           24.24 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  2W  stock 

                                    4 810049 104.13                  104.13         104.69            138.87         121.00 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  5W  stock 

                                    2 810050 122.44                 122.44            217.38 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  4W  7W 

                                    2 810051 126.38                 126.38            220.17 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  4W  4W 

                                    5 810071 642.23                  642.23     1,176.00         685.69        1,067.49         748.08 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock  7W  21D 

                                    5 810073 104.56                  104.56         116.22         106.21            124.48         123.00 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power

Eldorado 

National

Vehicle 

Maintenance

Coffman 

Truck

Hydraulic 

Electric

Suburban 

Truck

Kirk's Auto Neopart 

Transit

Prevost Area Diesel Gillig Aftermarket 

Parts

Mohawk Muncie 

Transit

TP101

Pace RFQ# 420235

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock  7W  stock 

                                    8 810078 375.00                  378.00        375.00         409.75         737.15         389.69            546.13               576.84         449.95 

Hydraulic Electric 230744 -                  stock  14D  stock  60D  stock  5W  2W  21D 

                                    1 1010027 41.29                     41.29 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  1W 

                                    8 1010032 84.26                    106.32          90.00           84.26         189.80         108.09            125.91                 94.00         124.40 

Neopart Transit 230743 -                  stock  stock  stock  45D  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                    4 810127 49.99                      49.99           50.69              66.42           55.55 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  5W  21D 

                                    6 810141 23.25                      59.00          33.00           59.69              79.35                 23.25           69.00 

Hydraulic Electric 230744 -                  10D 14D  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part  21D 

                                    4 1210078 340.75                 567.68         350.00            340.75         344.50 

Aftermarket Parts 230746 -                  6W  8W  4W 

 5 min, 

need 1 

                                    4 1010044 185.35                  185.35         187.69            576.94         219.19 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  5W  60D 

                                    2 810166 48.55                     48.55        380.00 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  2W  14D 

                                    1 1210082 1.39                          1.39 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  1W 

                                    1 1210083 122.10                 122.10 

Eldorado National 230740 -                  4W 

                                    4 810176 380.65                  380.65         390.69            605.35         455.55 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  7W  21D 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power

Eldorado 

National

Vehicle 

Maintenance

Coffman 

Truck

Hydraulic 

Electric

Suburban 

Truck

Kirk's Auto Neopart 

Transit

Prevost Area Diesel Gillig Aftermarket 

Parts

Mohawk Muncie 

Transit

TP101

Pace RFQ# 420235

                                    5 810180 5.94                           5.94             6.29                7.89                   7.60             6.95 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock  3W  stock 

                                    4 810181 2.31                           2.31             2.44                3.14             2.60 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  6W  21D 

                                    7 810192 1,050.00           1,328.94    1,099.00     1,050.00     1,269.69        1,691.82           1,674.47     1,480.80 

Neopart Transit 230743 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  6W  3W  stock 

                                    5 810196 57.46                      57.46           58.41              76.34                 93.08           63.89 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  4W  3W  21D 

                                    4 810220 391.58                  391.58         395.69            596.41         458.00 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  5W  21D 

                                    6 810225 540.00                  646.06        540.00         570.00         623.69            815.45         718.78 

Hydraulic Electric 230744 -                  stock  stock  stock  stock  7W  21D 

                                    4 1010060 2,159.00           2,159.00     2,169.69        2,853.19     2,540.40 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  7W  21D 

                                    6 1010061 939.99                  939.99         984.40     1,144.69        1,792.36               940.00         990.11 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock  9W  stock  21D 

                                    4 810286 24.41                      24.41         125.49              31.81           28.34 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  stock  stock  21D 

                                    4 1210126 739.60                  739.60        800.00         839.69         900.00 

Coffman Truck 230753 -                  stock  14D 

 no lead 

time given  21D 

                                    2 1210128 118.65                 161.27         118.65 

TP101 230751 -                  6W  4W 

                                    4 810292 269.69                  279.47         269.69            334.39         311.00 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Interstate 

Power

Eldorado 

National

Vehicle 

Maintenance

Coffman 

Truck

Hydraulic 

Electric

Suburban 

Truck

Kirk's Auto Neopart 

Transit

Prevost Area Diesel Gillig Aftermarket 

Parts

Mohawk Muncie 

Transit

TP101

Pace RFQ# 420235

Availability - Coffman 

Truck 230753 -                  stock 

 no lead 

time given  6W  21D 


