
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance

Eldorado 

National

Interstate 

Power

P&G Keene Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

CBM Aftermarket 

Parts

Neopart 

Transit

Coffman 

Truck

Area Diesel Prevost Gillig Muncie 

Transit

Mohawk Hydraulic 

Electric

                                    1 1010046 147.15                  147.15 

Eldorado 230683 -                 6W 

                                    1 1010071 54.71                      54.71 

Eldorado 230683 -                 6W 

                                    5 81092 49.35                    190.86             153.42         131.40         147.02                49.35 

Mohawk 230692 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 81055 132.29                  132.29 

Eldorado 230683  stock 

                                    1 110135 32.35                      32.35 

Eldorado 230683 -                 stock 

                                    3 110100 2.50                               2.87             2.50                  3.30 

Gillig 230691 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                    9 110136 63.25                    113.44           81.29           88.34           63.25             113.50           73.88         129.35           85.39             130.50 

Aftermarket Parts 230687 -                 stock  10D  stock  stock  7W 5D  45D  21D  3W 

                                    7 81298 51.10                      51.10               53.55           58.42               79.76           61.28           67.97                53.68 

CBM 230694 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    3 120509 19.72                      19.72           34.95           25.53 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 stock  45D  21D 

                                    1 130782 86.35                      86.35 

Eldorado 230683  stock 

                                    7 81390 225.00                  274.00         225.00             556.33         355.81             419.00         262.62             689.25 

Kirk's Auto 230685  stock stock  5W  stock  stock  21D  3W 

                                    6 81409 28.10                          45.33           35.55               35.95           39.30                33.80             28.10 

Hydraulic Electric 230693  stock  stock  stock  21D  stock  stock 

                                    7 81441 37.40                          53.94           42.17               42.79           53.71           49.25                55.38             37.40 

Pace RFQ# 420203



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance

Eldorado 

National

Interstate 

Power

P&G Keene Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

CBM Aftermarket 

Parts

Neopart 

Transit

Coffman 

Truck

Area Diesel Prevost Gillig Muncie 

Transit

Mohawk Hydraulic 

Electric

Pace RFQ# 420203

Hydraulic Electric 230693  stock  stock  stock  45D  21D  4W  2W 

                                    4 81454 118.39                      151.75         118.39             119.22         133.66 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 5W  stock  stock  21D 

                                    5 120540 47.35                          59.73           47.35               47.94           55.15             47.50 

Coffman Truck 230689  5W  stock  stock  21D  stock 

                                    6 120541 45.21                          57.02           45.21               45.76           52.65                57.70             47.00 

Coffman Truck 230689  5W  stock  stock  21D  3W  stock 

                                    4 110150 20.22                          25.73           20.22               20.47           22.30 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 5W  stock  stock  21D 

                                    5 81518 5.46                               6.42             5.46                 5.73             6.07               8.99 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 7W  stock  stock  21D  2W 

                                    1 120553 226.75                  226.75 

Eldorado 230683 -                 4W 

                                    6 81533 11.19                      41.57               27.64           41.33               41.78           11.40                11.19 

Mohawk 230692 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 81534 33.34                      57.21               33.34           33.65           38.02 

Aftermarket Parts 230687 -                 1W  6W  3W  21D 

                                    2 810000 37.75                      37.75          1,125.00 

Eldorado 230683 -                 stock  stock 

                                    7 1010001 8.86                        10.11             8.86               20.39             9.14             9.23             9.81          1,285.86 

Suburban Truck 230686 -                 stock  stock  8W  45D  stock  30D  stock 

                                    5 810010 346.24                  409.00         560.00         541.14             346.24         633.20 

Kirk's Auto 230685 -                 stock  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part  21D 

                                    6 1010011 824.58                   1,815.58     1,252.80         824.58         1,099.99     1,611.22         963.00 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 5W  10D  stock  stock  60D  21D 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance

Eldorado 

National

Interstate 

Power

P&G Keene Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

CBM Aftermarket 

Parts

Neopart 

Transit

Coffman 

Truck

Area Diesel Prevost Gillig Muncie 

Transit

Mohawk Hydraulic 

Electric

Pace RFQ# 420203

                                    5 1010012 1,422.36                2,649.93     1,422.36     1,828.67         1,753.37     2,045.00 

Neopart Transit 230688 -                 5W  10D  stock  stock  21D 

                                    3 810026 878.73                   1,107.83         900.25             878.73 

Area Diesel 230690 -                 4W  stock  stock 

                                    4 810027 496.95                      592.11         496.95             496.98         585.00 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 stock  stock  stock  21D 

                                    6 1010013 11.40                          33.33           15.68           27.95               25.00           30.60                11.40 

Neopart Transit 230688 -                 stock  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part  21D 

 unapproved 

part 

                                    4 810045 359.85                      505.43         359.85             364.37         418.25 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 stock  stock  stock  30D 

                                    5 810046 375.42                      571.48         375.42             380.89         695.42         438.79 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 7W  stock  stock  60D  stock 

                                    3 810049 104.13                      139.73         104.13  105..05         121.05 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 5W  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 1210030 287.21                      385.23         287.21             290.47         334.98             325.04           320.00 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 8W  stock  stock  stock  stock  2W 

                                    5 1010024 54.14                          72.44           54.14               54.94           63.45                71.42 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 7W  stock  stock  stock  3W 

                                    4 810079 375.00           605..35         384.70             389.69         450.00           375.00 

Hydraulic Electric 230693 -                 7W  stock  stock  30D  2W 

                                    5 1210038 1,938.30                3,064.56     2,008.58         1,938.30     2,314.29          3,069.39 

Area Diesel 230690 -                 10W  stock  stock  21D  3W 

                                    1 1210051 886.70                  886.70 

Eldorado 230683 -                 8W 

                                    6 810098 237.14                      279.35         237.14             238.36         373.94         262.25             284.88 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance

Eldorado 

National

Interstate 

Power

P&G Keene Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

CBM Aftermarket 

Parts

Neopart 

Transit

Coffman 

Truck

Area Diesel Prevost Gillig Muncie 

Transit

Mohawk Hydraulic 

Electric

Pace RFQ# 420203

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 6W  stock  stock  60D  stock  3W 

                                    5 810110 247.69                      596.55         333.37             247.69         372.00             492.37 

Area Diesel 230690 -                 5W  stock  stock  30D  4W 

                                    6 810141 23.25                          81.36           59.00               59.96           69.25                23.25             33.00 

Hydraulic Electric 230693 -                 3W  stock  stock  21D 

 unapproved 

part  2W 

                                    5 810154 7.97                               9.70             7.97                 8.04             9.28                10.51 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  4W 

                                    3 810169 23.17                      25.49               23.17             34.00 

Aftermarket Parts 230687 -                 6W  19W  2W 

                                    1 810170 6.51                          6.51 

Eldorado 230683 -                 1W 

                                    5 810216 4.11                                 4.11                  5.67             4.30                 4.33             4.75 

Vehicle Maintenance 230682 -                 stock  5W  stock  stock  21D 

                                    3 810220 391.58                      599.92         391.58         458.79 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 5W  stock  30D 

                                    3 1010060 2,159.00                2,861.05     2,159.00     2,545.99 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 7W  10D  30D 

                                    5 1010061 940.00                   1,803.22         984.40         956.95         990.25             940.00 

Mohawk 230692 -                 9W  stock  stock  30D  stock 

                                    4 810239 3.56                               4.63             3.69                 3.56             3.93 

Area Diesel 230690 -                 5W  stock  stock  30D 

                                    5 1210117 114.84                      269.79         215.05             207.69         229.45             114.84 

Mohawk 230692 -                 4W  stock  stock  30D  stock 

                                    5 810286 24.41                          32.20           24.41               24.69           28.39                33.44 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 5W  stock  stock  21D  4W 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance

Eldorado 

National

Interstate 

Power

P&G Keene Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

CBM Aftermarket 

Parts

Neopart 

Transit

Coffman 

Truck

Area Diesel Prevost Gillig Muncie 

Transit

Mohawk Hydraulic 

Electric

Pace RFQ# 420203

                                    4 810287 1.51                               1.91             1.51                 1.61             1.75 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 4W  stock  stock  30D 

                                    3 810285 54.28                      54.28               54.78           60.75 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 stock  stock  30D 

                                    4 810288 746.12                      908.51         746.12             846.96     3,234.48 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 7W  stock 

 no lead time 

given  30D 

                                    3 810289 181.33                      220.80         181.33         206.98 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 8W  10D  30D 

                                    2 1210123 8.20                            34.69             8.20 
Availability - 

Aftermarket Parts 230687 -                

 12 stock-bal 

5 weeks  65D 

                                    1 120124 20.78                          20.78 

Aftermarket Parts 230687 -                 7W 


