
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance

Rome 

Truck Parts

Eldorado 

National

Interstate 

Poweer

I/O 

Controls

P&G Keene Kirk's Auto Prevost Neopart 

Transit

Aftermarket 

Parts

Coffman 

Truck

Battery 

Service 

Corp.

Gillig Muncie 

Transit

Battery 

Systems, 

Inc.

Mohawk

                                    4 71089 0.04                          0.33                  0.18             1.69                     0.04 

Mohawk 230692 -                 stock  stock  30D  stock 

                                    4 71733 77.80                      90.85                77.80           90.88           79.10 

Aftermarket Parts 230687 -                 stock  stock  4W  30D 

                                    1 72125 70.15                    70.15 

Eldorado 230683 -                 4W 

                                    4 72121 62.19                    91.75                70.68           62.19           63.02 

Gillig 230691  3W  5W  4W  30D 

                                    5 71105 0.07                          1.16             0.08                  0.26             0.17                     0.07 

Mohawk 230692 -                 10D  stock  stock  60D  stock 

                                    5 71441 6.38                      26.95                  7.92             6.99             6.38                     7.28 

Muncie 230698 -                 stock  stock  stock  30D  15D 

                                    5 70220 7.95                      32.35                24.52           16.74           11.41                     7.95 

Mohawk 230692 -                 stock stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 71102 0.38                          2.63                  0.66             3.50             6.95                     0.38 

Mohawk 230692 -                 10D  stock  stock  21D  stock 

                                    6 72143 10.43                    21.55           13.28           10.81                10.43           11.50           10.93 

Aftermarket Parts 230687 -                 6W  60D  7W  stock  stock  45D 

                                    1 72131 33.20                    33.20 

Eldorado 230683  2W 

                                    1 72137 97.15                    97.15 

Eldorado 230683  2W 

                                    4 71100 0.07                          0.90             0.36                  0.07                     0.07 

Aftermarket Parts 230687  10D  stock  stock  stock 

                                    6 72135 57.42                    97.15           72.05           59.38                57.42           57.63           61.10 

Pace RFQ# 420202



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 

Maintenance
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Eldorado 
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Interstate 

Poweer

I/O 

Controls

P&G Keene Kirk's Auto Prevost Neopart 

Transit

Aftermarket 
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Coffman 

Truck
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Gillig Muncie 

Transit

Battery 

Systems, 

Inc.

Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 420202

Aftermarket Parts 230687  6W  60D  7W  5W  8W  45D 

                                    5 72058 3.79                               4.32       107.95                  5.30           17.99                     3.79 

Vehicle Maintenance 230682 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part 

                                    6 72094 14.91                           14.91         26.95           15.05                27.64           17.95                   23.15 

Vehicle Maintenance 230682  stock  4W  stock  stock  stock  2W 

                                    3 70596 135.00                199.97         167.97         135.00 

Battery Systems 230699  stock  3W  stock 

                                    3 71087 0.07                               0.15             2.95                     0.07 

 Mohawk 230692 -                 stock  21D  3W 

                                    3 70725 0.13                               0.30             0.13                     0.13 

Muncie 230698 -                 stock  stock  stock 

                                    4 72148 89.04                  292.42              138.40         118.22                   89.04 

Mohawk 230692 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    5 72156 21.63                      26.45           21.79                21.63           23.05           22.46 

Aftermarket Parts 230687 -                 60D  stock  stock  6W  45D 

                                    1 72163 431.95                431.95 

Eldorado 230683 -                 2W 

                                    3 72164 1,050.00           1,150.14           1,417.13     1,050.00 

Gillig 230691 -                 8W  14W  8W 

                                    1 72177 29.02                    29.02 

Eldorado 230683 -                 2W 

                                    4 72184 4.57                         7.20         11.83                  4.57             5.48 

Aftermarket Parts 230687 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 72204 18.85                    18.85 

Eldorado 230683 -                 stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Vehicle 
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Eldorado 
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I/O 
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P&G Keene Kirk's Auto Prevost Neopart 
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Aftermarket 
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Gillig Muncie 

Transit

Battery 

Systems, 
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Pace RFQ# 420202

                                    4 72216 149.22                291.55         210.00              150.90         149.22 

Gillig 230691 -                 6W  120D  stock  stock 

                                    1 72254 2.25                        2.25 

Eldorado 230683 -                 2W 

                                    5 72255 11.58                     15.64         16.15                15.54           12.92                   11.58 

Mohawk 230692 -                 stock  stock  stock  30D  stock 

                                    2 72270 5.61                          5.61                     5.75 

Muncie 230698 -                 stock  stock 

                                    2 72301 240.00                  254.00         240.00 

Battery Systems 230699 -                 3W  stock 

                                    1 72311 118.75                118.75 

Eldorado 230683 -                 4W 

                                    7 72388 36.75                    63.00           78.80           63.73                52.37           39.00           64.95                   36.75 

Mohawk 230692 -                 4W  60D  7W  stock  stock  60D  stock 

                                    1 710004 21.55                    21.55 

Eldorado 230683 -                 2W 

                                    5 710007 14.76                           17.83           20.02                22.94           14.76                   26.05 

Muncie 230698 -                 stock  60D  stock  stock  3W 

                                    1 710021 43.15                    43.15 

Eldorado 230683 -                 2W 

                                    6 710043 256.04                  256.04       321.00         341.93         285.00         289.57                315.26 

P&G Keene 230695 -                 stock  stock  60D  4W  30D  2W 

                                    6 710046 29.68                           29.68         37.75           31.47                34.73           29.95                   36.36 

Vehicle Maintenance 230682 -                 stock  1W  75D  9W  30D  2W 

                                    4 710099 34.14                      34.14              121.51           73.37                   56.41 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids
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Prevost 230696 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                    1 710130 82.44                    82.44 

Eldorado 230683 -                 4W 

                                    1 710150 26.95                    26.95 

Eldorado 230683 -                 4W 

                                    1 710186 54.39                    54.39 

Eldorado 230683 -                 4W 

                                    1 710206 146.02                146.02 

Eldorado 230683 -                 4W 

                                    1 710223 150.93                150.93 

Eldorado 230683 -                 4W 

                                    2 710236 16.17                      16.17           18.33 

Coffman Truck 230689 -                 stock  21D 

                                    - -                


