

		TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake & Supply Co.	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM	Coffman Truck Sales	Eldorado	General Truck Parts	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
5	290415	477.42								478.00							527.99	477.42	539.68	590.00				
Neopart 230673	WEST HAS 0 ON HAND									Stock							21 Days	2-3 Weeks	Stock	45 Days				
1	30163	12.51															12.51							
Muncie 230672		-															Stock							
7	10192	8.56								8.56			16.80			8.94	8.56		9.96	10.80		9.88		
Gillig 230668		-								Stock						Stock	Stock		Stock	Stock		Stock		
6	290616	113.89								113.89	117.90						132.00	114.96	130.36	148.70				
Gillig 230668										Stock	Stock						Stock	Stock	Stock	45 Days				
3	30375	33.75														63.05	33.75		50.35					
Muncie 230672		-														Stock	Stock		Stock					
7	10194	10.96								11.75			21.99			10.96	11.06		12.41	13.93		12.75		
Mohawk 230671										Stock			Stock			Stock	Stock		Stock	Stock		Stock		
7	40932	0.50					4.29									0.50	1.50	1.52	1.64	2.30		1.72		
Mohawk 230671		-					Stock									Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock		Stock		
3	20701	334.75						334.75									375.17		629.86					
Eldorado 230667		-						2 Weeks									56 Days		15 Weeks					
7	10170	0.88					2.17									0.88	1.72	1.50	1.70	1.95		1.86		
Mohawk 230671		-					7 Days									Stock	Stock	Must be ordered in multiples of 4 Stock	Stock	Stock		Stock		
1	151952	43.15						43.15																
Eldorado 230667								2 Weeks																
5	20646	44.00								52.25						44.00	65.65		46.80	67.17				
Mohawk 230671										Stock						Stock	Stock		Stock	Stock				
9	40798	100.25					121.18	125.00		120.00						117.18	100.25	102.82	105.15	143.80		106.54		
Muncie 230672							7 Days	Stock		2-4 Weeks						June 15th	Stock	Stock	5 Stock Balance 5 Weeks	45 Days		Stock		
6	10193	14.37								14.37						15.30	15.10		16.93	19.03		17.39		
Gillig 230668										Stock						Stock	Stock		Stock	Stock		Stock		
6	290537	154.99								154.99	155.75						192.73	158.60	167.83	207.20				
Gillig 230668		-								Stock	14 Days						5 Stock Balance 28 Days	3-4 Weeks	5 Stock Balance 3 Weeks	60 Days				
4	290643	5.61														5.89	6.18				15.50		5.61	
Vehicle Maintenance Program 230676																Stock	10 Stock Only				Stock		Stock	
4	290647	90.39						134.95									103.93		90.39	149.95				
NFI Parts 230674								Stock									Stock		6 Weeks		2 Weeks			
10	41227	13.75					59.62			25.75			51.51			13.75	26.80	41.60	32.09	34.10		49.85		23.75
Mohawk 230671							5 Stock Balance 7 Days			Stock			Stock			Stock	Stock	Stock	5 Weeks	Stock		Stock		Stock
3	250477	33.80															59.35		38.49				33.80	
Transit Parts 101		-															Stock		Stock				10 Days	

Pace RFQ 420200 Due: 6/02/2020

White = No Bid	TOTAL																									
Green = Disqualified																										
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake & Supply Co.	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM	Coffman Truck Sales	Eldorado	General Truck Parts	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program		
6	41205	0.75					0.96									3.24	0.86	0.75	0.85	1.09						
Neopart 230673		-					7 Days									Stock	21 Days	Stock	Stock	45 Days						
6	60739	12.19					37.11						31.47			12.19	43.23		22.69						13.00	
Mohawk 230671		-					Stock					Stock				Stock	Stock		5 Weeks					Stock		
7	10366	70.08					362.90			72.99						70.38	73.50		70.08	124.70			115.21			
NFI Parts 230674		-					7 Days			Stock						Stock	Stock		Stock	Stock		Stock				
6	40118	0.28					0.91									0.28	0.55	0.59	0.59	0.66						
Mohawk 230671		-					7 Days									Stock	Stock	2-3 Weeks	Stock	20 Stock Balance 30 Days						
8	40852	97.60				97.60	164.70			112.99						112.87	126.79	143.02	112.47				154.16			
CBM 230665		-				Stock	7 Days			Stock						Stock	1 Stock Balance 21 Days	2-3 Weeks	Stock			Stock				
7	40373	1.75					2.62									1.75	2.30	2.07	2.62	2.65			2.31			
Mohawk 230671		-					7 Days									Stock	Stock	Stock	8 Weeks	Stock		Stock				
7	40596	0.47					2.35									0.47	0.54	1.44	1.56	2.09			2.01			
Mohawk 230671		-					7 Days									Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock	19 Stock Balance 45 Days		Stock				
6	41019	0.99					3.08									0.99	1.96	2.16	2.09	2.74						
Mohawk 230671		-					Stock									Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock						
1	60741	1.92						1.92																		
Eldorado 230667		-						2 Weeks																		
1	60743	5.40						5.40																		
Eldorado 230667		-						2 Weeks																		
1	60742	3.19						3.19																		
Eldorado 230667		-						2 Weeks																		
1	151960	5.89						5.89																		
Eldorado 230667		-						Stock																		
7	41240	80.36					110.58			89.29						89.50	80.36	88.40	85.06	111.62						
Muncie 230672		-					7 Days			Stock						June 24th	Stock	3-4 Weeks	Stock	60 Days						
6	151975	929.98						1,576.75		952.22					1,125.00		929.98		937.10	1,156.25						
Muncie 230672		-					Stock			6 Weeks					4 Weeks		30 Days		1 Stock Balance 6 Weeks	60 Days						
1	290664	2.65						2.65																		
Eldorado 230667		-						Stock																		
4	30421	111.68						161.95		111.68								114.80		116.24						
Gillig 230668		-						Stock		2 Weeks								Stock		Stock						
4	290666	25.25						26.95										25.25		25.35				34.50		
Muncie 230672		-						Stock										30 Days		6 Weeks			2 Weeks			
1	30150	9.67						9.67																		
Eldorado 230667		-						2 Weeks																		
7	41266	969.75					1,189.79	1,271.95		1,200.00						1,317.00	969.75	1,158.56	1,135.88							
Muncie 230672		-					7-10 Days	2 Weeks		Stock						June 28th	Stock	2-3 Weeks	5 Weeks							

		TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake & Supply Co.	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM	Coffman Truck Sales	Eldorado	General Truck Parts	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
1	60770	59.35						59.35																
Eldorado 230667								Stock																
1	152006	16.15						16.15																
Eldorado 230667								Stock																
1	60772	18.85						18.85																
Eldorado 230667								Stock																
5	290673	890.00						1,100.00		890.00							1,015.15		1,044.20	1,172.84				
Gillig 230668								4 Weeks		4-6 Weeks							21 Days		1 Stock Balance 6 Weeks	90 Days				
5	290674	171.11						377.95		171.11							196.55		211.70	196.63				
Gillig 230668								4 Weeks		Stock							21 Days		Stock	Stock				
1	290675	59.35						59.35																
Eldorado 230667								4 Weeks																
4	250715	53.73								63.25							64.15	53.73	62.85					
Neopart 230673										2-4 Weeks							21 Days	3-4 Weeks	Stock					
4	290679	52.75								52.99	52.75								57.96	72.34				
HECS 230669										Stock	14 Days								Stock	60 Days				
1	41281	21.55						21.55																
Eldorado 230667								2 Weeks																
1	41283	37.66						37.66																
Eldorado 230667								2 Weeks																
6	41288	92.50					117.30	248.35		92.50								97.35	94.41	103.30				
Gillig 230668							7 Days	2 Weeks		Stock								Not an approved OEM	Stock	2-3 Weeks	Stock			
1	152031	0.53						0.53																
Eldorado 230667								1 Week																
1	290684	9.67						9.67																
Eldorado 230667								2 Weeks																
5	20727	193.15						349.66		220.00							197.35		193.15	215.75				
NFI Parts 230674								2 Weeks		6-8 Weeks							50 Days		10 Weeks	75 Days				
1	10424	12.85						12.85																
Eldorado 230667								2 Weeks																
2	41295	19.22								19.22										19.90				
Gillig 230668										Stock										Stock				
7	290696	8.75			8.75	10.40		37.75											23.25	10.80	18.11	15.33		
Autex Automotive Devices 230664					1 Day	Stock		Stock										Not an approved OEM	Stock	3-4 Weeks	Stock	Stock		
2	290697	15.00																	15.00		18.56			
Muncie 230672																			Stock	Stock				
4	290701	163.00						248.35											163.40	163.00	205.56			
Eldorado 230667	LOW STOCK							Stock											105 Days		25 Weeks	135 Days		



		TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake & Supply Co.	Area Diesel Service	Autex Automotive Devices	CBM	Coffman Truck Sales	Eldorado	General Truck Parts	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift -U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance Program
1	110023	39.08						39.08																
Eldorado 230667		-						2-4 Weeks																
1	2910015	16.36						16.36																
Eldorado 230667		-						2-4 Weeks																
4	610058	44.52					66.71									107.09	106.70		44.52					
NFI Parts 230674		-					Stock									Aug. 30th	2 Stock Balance 30 Days		Stock					
1	1510109	268.30																	268.30					
NFI Parts 230674		-																	Stock					
1	110026	53.00						53.00																
Eldorado 230667		-						2-4 Weeks																
1	110027	1.06						1.06																
Eldorado 230667		-						1 Week																
1	1510112	18.77						18.77																
Eldorado 230667		-						2 Weeks																
4	610080	132.32						132.32								204.77	154.89		173.97					
Coffman Truck Sales 230666		-					Stock									Stock	21 Days		Stock					
4	2510073	97.78								107.83					97.78		99.15		111.60					
Midwest Bus 230670		-								4 Weeks					14 Days		60 Days		Stock					
1	110038	3.25						3.25																
Eldorado 230667		-						2 Weeks																
1	110039	0.75						0.75																
Eldorado 230667		-						2 Weeks																
6	410090	870.66					1,079.38										892.00	870.66	897.05	1,083.30				
Neopart 230673		-					7 Days			885.00								21 Days	3-4 Weeks	6 Weeks	45 Days			
1	1510212	298.00						298.00																
Eldorado 230667		-						4-6 Weeks																
1	610108	994.96																	994.96					
NFI Parts 230674		-																	2-3 Weeks					
3	610122	1.41						1.41									1.67		1.65					
Coffman Truck Sales 230666		-					Stock										21 Days		Stock					
1	210028	24.55																	24.55					
NFI Parts 230674		-																	Stock					
1	210029	19.99																	19.99					
NFI Parts 230674		-																	5 Weeks					