
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning 

bid

Triangle 

Radiator

Interstate 

Power

Vehicle 

Maintenance

I/O 

Controls

Kirk's Auto Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Coffman 

Truck

Aftermarket 

Parts

MW Bus Suburban 

Truck Parts

Gillig LLC CBM Battery 

Service 

Corp.

Hydraulic 

Electric

Prevost Battery 

Systems

Muncie 

Transit

Mohawk Eldorado 

National

                                   4 72139 314.46              357.34        314.46           403.87 343.10       

Coffman Truck 230628 -               Stock  Stock  stock stock

                                   4 71733 77.80                      77.80          90.88         90.16 78.99         

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               stock  5W  stock 28D

                                   5 70220 7.95                         25.70          16.74 11.50                         7.95         32.35 

Mohawk 230638 -               stock  2W stock  stock  6W 

                                   4 72057 3.55                              3.75                3.55            7.25              11.90 

Aftermarket Parts 230630  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   6 72143 10.35                 10.81              10.45          10.35         13.28 10.95                 21.55 

Gillig LLC 230633 -               7W  stock  stock  60D 21D  6W 

                                   5 81092 49.35                190.86           155.20       131.40 147.07                    49.35 

Mohawk 230638 -               5D  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                   5 130473 0.07                       1.18                0.09           0.19 0.07                           0.07 

Muncie Transit 230637 -               3D  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                   2 71540 58.59         61.67                 58.59 

Eldorado National 230639 -              stock  stock 

                                   7 130613 2.92                     14.26          12.55              18.66         10.00          16.78 13.70                         2.92 

Midwest Bus 230631 -               stock  stock  stock  stock  stock stock

 unapproved 

part 

                                   5 71976 1.68                       5.66                1.68           2.13 1.75                           2.68 

Aftermarket Parts 230630  3D  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                   6 72095 188.93             225.43        188.93           215.21        195.00       268.83 213.74       

P&G Keene 230627 stock  stock  stock  stock  60D 30D

                                   3 70020 10.00                  89.78         10.00         84.75 

Hydraulic Electric 230634  4W  2W  60D 

                                   2 71357 11.30                      11.30         15.07 

Eldorado National 230639

 unapproved 

part  stock 

                                   7 130611 172.00              256.67        225.86           293.55       172.00       200.00 246.40                  240.66 

Midwest Bus 230631 -               stock  stock  7W  7D  14D 30D  3W 

                                   3 81142 12.48                      19.84         49.98              12.48 

Mohawk 230638  stock  60D  stock 

                                   2 110135 32.35                  73.88         32.35 

Eldorado National 230639  5D  stock 

                                   5 72135 57.50                 59.38              57.50          57.63         72.05 61.10         

Pace RFQ# 420183



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified
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Triangle 
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Power

Vehicle 
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I/O 
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Aftermarket 
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Gillig LLC CBM Battery 
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Mohawk Eldorado 

National

Pace RFQ# 420183

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               7W  3W  6W  60D  42D 

                                   5 74777 1.38                      3.25                3.66            5.58 4.42                           1.38 

Mohawk 230638 -               stock  stock  stock stock  stock 

                                   5 72058 3.83                              4.32                5.45          17.99                 3.83       107.95 

Vehicle Maintenance 230625 -               stock  stock  stock 

 unapproved 

part  6W 

                                   6 71431 8.70                    18.61              13.99          18.25         21.49 19.20                         8.70 

Mohawk 230638 -               7W  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                   1 71486 16.15                 16.15 

Eldorado National 230639 -               stock 

                                   4 72055 118.75                 160.44       163.05 134.50             118.75 

Eldorado National 230639 -               stock  60D 37D  stock 

                                   3 110100 2.87                           2.87           9.95                 3.60 

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               stock  14D  stock 

                                   6 110136 63.25                         69.46         88.34           116.53          63.25 86.36                 95.00 

Suburban Truck Parts 230632 -               stock 

 no lead 

time given  7W  stock 30D  stock 

                                   3 71432 5.24                              5.95                7.05                 5.24 

Vehicle Maintenance 230625 -               stock  5W 

 unapproved 

part 

                                   4 71880 32.30                 32.53              32.30         37.55 33.91         

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               7W  stock  60D  42D 

                                   2 70019 4.66                   176.14           4.66 

Prevost 230635 -               4W  stock 

                                   6 81156 0.60                         67.08            1.16           1.10           1.46 57.07                         0.60 

Mohawk 230638 -               stock  stock  14D  stock stock  stock 

                                   5 71593 133.53                 244.67        166.00       263.42 283.83                  133.53 

Mohawk 230638 -               stock  stock  75D 

 min 4, 

need 1  stock 

                                   2 81285 1,094.41           1,094.41    1,295.95 

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               7W  stock 

                                   4 120335 8.98                     15.71         14.50          10.09 8.98           

Muncie Transit 230637 -               10D  stock  stock 30D

                                   1 72145 8.59                      8.59 

Eldorado National 230639 -               stock 

                                   5 72162 29.15                      60.02         56.25 29.15                      33.02         32.35 

Muncie Transit 230637 -               6W  60D  stock  3W  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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                                   1 72163 431.95             431.95 

Eldorado National 230639 -               stock 

                                   4 72164 900.00          1,150.14        1,385.84    1,050.00       900.00 

Hydraulic Electric 230634 -               8W  stock  6W  14D 

                                   4 72167 36.56                 36.56              38.84          39.99 39.52         

Neopart Transit 230626 -               stock  8W  6W stock

                                   7 100223 71.06                 75.61          92.27           112.95         73.00       159.16 107.95                    71.06 

Hydraulic Electric 230634 -               stock  stock  stock  14D  60D stock

 unapproved 

part 

                                   3 72184 4.57                           4.57 5.48                   11.83 

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               stock stock  stock 

                                   7 72202 26.62                         26.62              33.11          27.38          40.28         29.93 27.42                      30.52 

Vehicle Maintenance 230625 -               stock  8W  stock  4W  75D 30D  21D 

                                   5 81371 199.00             199.00        278.00           369.67 318.18                  296.29 

Availability - P&G 

Keene 230627 -              

no lead 

time given  stock  9W 45D

 unapproved 

part 

                                   1 120526 395.00             395.00 

Triangle Radiator 230624 -               3D 

                                   4 72216 150.90                 150.90        155.50       210.00       291.55 

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               2W  stock  stock  stock 

                                   1 72239 26.95                 26.95 

Eldorado National 230639 -               stock 

                                   1 72249 1.74                      1.74 

Eldorado National 230639 -               stock 

                                   4 72255 11.58                      18.14 12.92                      11.58         16.15 

Mohawk 230638 -               stock  stock  stock  4W 

                                   3 81454 118.39              118.39           152.43 134.63       

Coffman Truck 230628 -               Stock  5W stock

                                   3 81455 4.33                       4.33                5.98 5.08           

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  5W  stock 

                                   4 120542 44.41                  44.41              62.18         57.00 54.00         

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  11W  stock  21D 

                                   2 72301 240.00              255.97 240.00     

Battery Systems 230636 -               2W 7D

                                   5 120548 1.74                              1.75            2.26                3.21 2.52                           1.74 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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Vehicle Maintenance 230625 -               stock  stock  stock 21D

 unapproved 

part 

                                   3 81497 1,906.19        1,906.19        3,231.99 2,228.82    

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  5W 60D

                                   4 72382 292.70                 292.70        294.12 293.80             421.15 

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               8W  6W 90D  5W 

                                   4 81533 11.19                  41.55              27.97 14.17                      11.19 

Mohawk 230638 -               stock  stock stock  stock 

                                    - 710003 -               NLA 

NLA -              

                                   6 710046 29.68                      35.35          29.68         31.47 29.95                      35.36         37.75 

Suburban Truck Parts 230632 -               9W  stock  75D 30D  3W  stock 

                                   6 1010003 27.25                  27.25              48.96         37.00         59.75 30.11                      32.86 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  stock  14D  stock 21D  stock 

                                   3 1210016 647.06                 889.45        647.06    1,090.75 

Gillig LLC 230633 -               10W  8W  stock 

                                   3 810026 900.25              900.25        1,120.42 1,072.72    

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  4W 21D

                                   3 810027 496.95              496.95           598.69 585.85       

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  9W 21D

                                   4 810028 64.13                      82.02          64.13 107.00             134.95 

Gillig LLC 230633 -               14W  stock stock  stock 

                                   5 810030 1.53                       2.38                3.03           4.40 2.64                           1.53 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  stock  stock 21D

 unapproved 

part 

                                   4 810031 1.81                       7.98                9.99 8.87                           1.81 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  4W 21D

 unapproved 

part 

                                   5 1010015 851.32          1,236.60        851.32        1,657.15 1,700.00            1,060.00 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  stock  4W stock  3W 

                                   3 1010016 2,128.00        2,128.00        2,936.97 2,550.00    

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  7W 30D

                                   1 710061 93.59                      93.59 

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               stock 

                                   7 810048 15.49                 19.86          15.49              25.83         23.25         20.00 24.42                      23.10 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  stock  5W  stock  stock 21D  3W 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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Sku Winning 

bid

Triangle 

Radiator

Interstate 

Power

Vehicle 

Maintenance

I/O 

Controls

Kirk's Auto Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Coffman 

Truck

Aftermarket 

Parts

MW Bus Suburban 

Truck Parts

Gillig LLC CBM Battery 

Service 

Corp.

Hydraulic 

Electric

Prevost Battery 

Systems

Muncie 

Transit

Mohawk Eldorado 

National

Pace RFQ# 420183

                                   4 1210030 287.21              287.21           394.01 355.52                  345.25 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  8W 21D  stock 

                                   9 1210033 23.83                  26.44                 23.83         27.00          24.44              30.33          27.83         42.07 28.12                      24.20 

Vehicle Maintenance 230625 -               14D  stock 

 no lead 

time given  5D  5W  stock  60D 30D  3W 

                                   6 810070 865.00          1,176.00        875.65        1,078.41       865.00 1,020.20            1,155.31 

Hydraulic Electric 230634 -               stock  stock  7W  14D 21D  2W 

                                   4 810073 104.00              105.12           124.48       104.00 123.23       

Hydraulic Electric 230634 -               stock  7W  14D 21D

                                   3 810076 106.06              106.06           147.98 125.35       

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  stock 21D

                                   3 810084 740.67              740.67        1,287.13 817.72       

Coffman Truck 230628 -               7D  6W 21D

                                   1 710141 21.55                 21.55 

Eldorado National 230639 -               stock 

                                   6 810093 21.75                         22.94          30.34              41.93         32.55         21.75 34.99         

Hydraulic Electric 230634 -               stock  stock  7W  5W  14D 30D

                                   5 810098 237.14              237.14           279.35       373.94 262.99                  289.88 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  stock  45D stock  stock 

                                   4 810102 2.92                       2.92                3.98 3.38                           3.63 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  5W 21D  stock 

                                   5 1210054 87.00                125.22           158.83         87.00 139.33                  149.35 

Hydraulic Electric 230634 -               stock  3W  stock 21D  3W 

                                   4 810110 248.00              248.00           671.12 375.75                  492.37 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  5W 30D  3W 

                                   4 810112 4.31                       4.31                5.47 4.82                           6.99 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  6W 21D

 no lead time 

given 

                                   4 810123 53.22                  53.22              70.33         82.94 61.95         

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  stock  60D stock

                                   4 810125 42.00                  90.46           107.97 106.07                    42.00 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  stock 21D

 unapproved 

part 

                                   3 810130 376.60              376.60           578.20 438.50       

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  5W 21D

                                   5 710166 227.72              227.72           293.80       392.54 257.42                  300.44 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 
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Pace RFQ# 420183

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  stock  stock stock  3W 

                                   6 1210070 46.25                  46.57              67.97         46.25         50.75 57.50                      55.97 

Availability - Coffman 

Truck 230628 -               stock  6W  21D  45D 21D  3W 

                                   4 1210071 185.64              185.64           245.36 216.10                  244.93 

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  5W 21D  4W 

                                   4 1210078 340.75                 340.75        350.00 344.50             424.49 

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               7W  8W 63D  stock 

                                   3 810163 61.92                  61.92              78.54 73.30         

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  4W 21D

                                   2 810167 50.24                  50.24         63.96 

Gillig LLC 230633 -               4W  6W 

                                    - 1010046 -              

-              

                                   4 810179 43.00                  45.04              52.95         43.00 53.36         

Hydraulic Electric 230634 -               stock  4W  stock 21D

                                   2 810183 1,099.61        1,099.61 1,280.10    

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock 21D

                                   4 810184 59.00                  59.63              76.69         59.00 69.25         

Hydraulic Electric 230634 -               stock  4W  stock 21D

                                   1 710223 150.93             150.93 

Eldorado National 230639 -               stock 

                                   3 710236 16.17                  16.17              22.93 19.05         

Coffman Truck 230628 -               stock  5W 21D

                                   1 1210097 26.71                      26.71 

Aftermarket Parts 230630 -               5W 

                                   1 810215 21.70                 21.70 

Eldorado National 230639 -               4W 

                                   1 710247 246.00             246.00 

Eldorado National 230639 -               6W 

                                   4 810227 920.00           1,119.33        1,476.29       920.00 1,329.11    

Hydraulic Electric 230634 -               stock  5W  14D 21D

                                   4 810230 3.00                       3.00 3.63              5.38          3.48           

Coffman Truck 230628 -              stock 5W 45D 21D



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified
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Triangle 
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Mohawk Eldorado 

National

Pace RFQ# 420183

                                   3 1010060 2,159.00        2,159.00 2,868.95       2,550.10    

Coffman Truck 230628 -              stock 7W 21D

                                   5 1010061 940.00          1,119.33        961.99 1,836.61               990.50            940.00 

Mohawk 230638 -              stock stock 9W 21D stock

                                   3 810241 3.09                       3.09 4.11              3.40           

Coffman Truck 230628 -              stock 6W 21D

                                   1 710278 491.03       491.03     

Eldorado National 230639 -              6W

                                    - 1010071 -              

-              

                                   3 810258 8.76                       8.76 12.27            10.15         

Coffman Truck 230628 -              stock 5W 21D

                                   1 1210120 158.47       158.47     

Eldorado National 230639 -              6W

                                   4 810278 7.74                       7.74 10.70            8.60                        10.15 

Coffman Truck 230628 -              stock 7W stock stock

                                   1 710310 452.22                 452.22 

Eldorado National 230639 -              13W

                                   1 710311 452.22                 452.22 

Eldorado National 230639 -              13W

                                   4 810283 188.75              188.75 239.40          205.00     220.90       

Coffman Truck 230628 -              stock 5W 14D 21D

                                   3 70730 0.18            0.69              0.30                          0.18 

Mohawk 230638 -              stock 45D stock

                                    - 710030 -              

-              

                                    - -              

-              

                                    - -              

-              

                                    - -              

-              

                                    - -              


