
Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

5 290415 477.42                   486.67          528.25          477.42        543.56        590.00 

Neopart 230618  Stock  21 Days  3-4 Weeks  Stock  45 Days 

6 41236 139.00                   145.03        140.63          139.00          139.12        143.58        205.86 

Muncie 230617 -                 

 1 Stock 

Balance 2-4 

Weeks  Stock  Stock  3-4 Weeks  5 Weeks  45 Days 

5 60734 2.64                       2.70                4.38               2.64             3.12             6.17 

Muncie 230617 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  11 Weeks  60 Days 

5 30406 124.02                   124.02        167.57          166.30        136.53        207.84 

Gillig 230611  4-5 Weeks  20 Weeks 

 3 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days 

 2 Stock 

Balance 15 

Weeks  90 Days 

7 10194 10.46                        11.75              22.11          10.46             11.06          12.71          13.93          12.75 

Mohawk 230616 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 40932 0.46                           0.46               1.50               1.52             1.65             2.30             1.72 

Mohawk 230616 QTY. 85  Stock  Stock 

 Must be 

ordered in 

multiples of 

10 Stock  Stock 

 6 Stock 

Balance 45 

days 

 Sold in 

packs of 

ten Stock 

5 290523 29.90                        38.27       29.90             32.52            30.46          33.09 

HECS 230612                     -    Stock  14 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

0 151952 -                 

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                 

3 290646 96.11                        96.11        119.03    149.95 

Muncie 230617 -                  30 Days  6 Weeks 

 2-3 

Weeks 

8 40798 93.91            93.91                     120.00        126.18          100.25          102.82        105.44        143.80        106.54 

Acme Truck Brake & 

Supply Co. 230609 1 Week  2-4 Weeks  June 2nd  Stock  Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  45 Days  Stock 

2 290601 252.25                 259.10        252.25 

NFI Parts 230619

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND  Stock  Stock 

7 10193 14.37                        14.37              29.58          15.30             15.10          17.14          19.03          17.39 

Gillig 230611  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

2 290645 57.43                        57.43          73.33  DQ 

Muncie 230617

 4 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days 

 1 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks 

 Not an 

approve

d OEM. 

7 40986 34.53                        43.05          34.53             41.41            43.75          51.59          54.14          76.86 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

1 41125 10.41                     10.41 

NFI Parts 230619  Stock 

6 290537 155.73                   155.75     155.73          196.90          161.11        167.83        207.20 

HECS 230612  Stock  Stock 

 5 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  3-4 Weeks 

 5 Stock 

Balance 3 

Weeks  45 days 

RFQ 420182 Due: 5/20/2020



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420182 Due: 5/20/2020

6 40980 1.35                           1.35               5.31               5.15             5.19             5.95             5.90 

Mohawk 230616  Stock  21 Days  2-3 Weeks  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

7 40953 8.30                           13.75             8.30             14.20            32.51          16.81          18.10          32.30 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

3 250514 11.81                        19.26          22.64         11.81 

Transit Parts 101 

230622 -                  30 Days  Stock  1 Week 

5 290289 9.91                     10.00             11.15               9.91          10.26          10.57 

Neopart 230618 -                  Stock  21 Days  3-4 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

4 290658 102.51                   102.51          120.00        117.90        131.44 

Gillig 230611  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock 

8 41216 142.00                   185.00      179.55        142.00          213.83          514.20        180.56        263.70        202.46 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock  7 Days 

 15-21 

Days  21 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 60678 53.51                  53.51             60.96          77.04 

Interstate Power 

Systems 230613 -                  Stock  30 Days  8 Weeks 

5 250630 17.47                        20.40      21.28        17.50            17.47          20.74 

Neopart 230618

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND   1-2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  8 Weeks 

8 41215 124.60          138.25                  137.69        158.00          124.60          131.08        133.12        167.20        146.15 

Muncie 230617 -                 1 Week  Stock  June 2nd  Stock  Stock  5 Weeks  45 Days  Stock 

8 60745 43.57            88.18                        86.93              95.33        103.80             75.10          72.87        108.67                43.57 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 230623 -                  Stock  2-3 Weeks  Stock  June 9th  35 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 20576 23.40                        53.78          57.45          23.40 

Prevost 230620 -                  35 Days  Stock  Stock 

8 290614 5.52               6.00                      107.00             5.52             50.38               7.44          28.57          12.86      29.95 

Mohawk 230616 -                 1 Day  Stock  Stock  90 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

2 290644 52.33                        56.99          52.33  DQ 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  21 Days 

 10 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks 

 Not an 

approve

d OEM. 

6 30361 7.55                           9.33               7.56               7.68             7.55          11.08             9.20 

NFI Parts 230619

SOUTH HAS 0 ON 

HAND - QTY. 6 -                  June 2nd  Stock 

 Must be 

ordered in 

multiples of 

8 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 40349 0.11                           0.11               0.18               0.17             0.16             0.20             0.18 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock 

 154 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

5 40632 0.13                           0.13               0.29               0.67             0.36             0.42 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 40979 10.15                     10.15             15.41            14.56          15.40          18.90          16.53 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 48 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  45 Days  Stock 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420182 Due: 5/20/2020

7 40985 35.83                        43.05          35.83             42.14            42.95          52.27          54.12          76.86 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

7 40922 18.12                        28.50          18.12             30.18            30.55          34.65          37.79          42.78 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  2-3 Weeks  Stock 

 4 Stock 

Balance 45 

Days  Stock 

8 60739 12.19            29.20            37.31                        53.53              31.31          12.19             43.63          50.28                14.51 

Mohawk 230616 -                 1 Week  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

8 40973 111.20                   195.00      169.00        231.81          168.20          247.80        111.20        111.50        215.00 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock  7 Days  June 10th  60 Days  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

6 10365 69.95                        72.57          69.95             73.57          70.00        124.70        115.21 

Mohawk 230616  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

7 40981 0.70                             2.73             0.71               1.95               2.18             0.70             2.63             3.04 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

6 40090 0.49                           0.86               0.54               0.54             0.49             0.67             0.89 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 40373 1.75                           1.75               2.30               2.22             4.13             2.65             2.31 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 41019 0.99                           0.99               1.98               2.74             2.09             2.74             2.59 

Mohawk 230616 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

8 41127 162.55                   220.00      162.55        228.70          255.75          381.54        204.63        224.10        255.39 

Midwest Bus 230615 -                  1-2 Weeks  7 Days  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

2 151964 27.81                  27.85          27.81 

NFI Parts 230619

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                  Stock  Stock 

7 41255 3.11                             3.85             3.84               3.56               3.11             3.73             4.39             3.55 

Neopart 230618 -                  Stock  June 2nd 

 Must 

purchase in 

mulitples of 

4 - 30 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

1 30411 436.40                   436.40 

Muncie 230617 -                  28 Days 

6 20707 91.39                        92.00          107.37            91.39          93.84        131.62        107.26 

Neopart 230618 -                  1-2 Weeks  30 Days  Stock  5 Weeks  60 Days  Stock 

5 20708 89.76                        92.00          107.37            89.76        131.62        107.26 

Neopart 230618 -                  1-2 Weeks  30 Days  Stock  60 days  Stock 

0 290664 -                 

-                 

3 10411 108.25                   108.25          109.25        116.92 

Gillig 230611 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 30421 111.68                   111.68          114.80        116.24 

Gillig 230611 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock 

1 290671 18.46                        18.46  DQ 

Muncie 230617 -                  Stock 

 Not an 

approve

d OEM. 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420182 Due: 5/20/2020

5 60771 71.99            126.09                      71.99          149.00        171.72          91.86 

Kirk's Automotive 

230614 -                  Stock  Stock  21 Days  5 Weeks  60 Days 

0 152006 -                 

4 152009 0.73                           0.94               0.87             0.73             0.94 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  60 Days 

4 152010 0.73                           0.88               0.87             0.73             0.94 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock 

 15 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  Stock 

7 41270 29.95                        29.95          48.30             30.45            32.27          37.56          38.81          48.37 

Gillig 230611 -                  Stock  June 2nd  Stock  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

7 41271 29.95                        29.95          48.30             30.50            32.27          37.56          38.81          48.37 

Gillig 230611 -                  Stock  June 2nd  Stock  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

6 41272 22.95                     37.95             36.07            22.95          36.43          44.40          36.03 

Neopart 230618 -                  June 16th  30 Days  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

4 290673 890.00                   890.00       1,020.22    1,070.64    1,172.84 

Gillig 230611 -                  4-6 Weeks  21 Days  Stock  90 Days 

5 290679 52.00                        53.50       52.00             63.63          58.61          72.34 

HECS 230612

NORTH SHORE HAS 

0 ON HAND -                  Stock  Stock  21 Days  Stock  60 Days 

0 41281 -                 

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                 

4 41288 92.50                        92.50  DQ             97.35            96.13        104.51 

Gillig 230611 -                  2 Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  2-3 Weeks  Stock 

0 60792 -                 

-                 

0 152031 -                 

-                 

0 290684 -                 

-                 

0 10424 -                 

-                 

1 41294 1,252.52          1,252.52 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock 

7 41332 255.39                   285.00        343.38          293.44          287.43        302.60        367.10        255.39 

Suburban Truck Parts 

230621 -                  1-2 Weeks  June 2nd  30 Days  Stock  6 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

3 290700 161.48                   163.40        161.48        205.56 

Muncie 230617 -                  30 Days  25 Weeks  120 Days 

3 290701 163.00                   163.40        163.00        205.56 

Muncie 230617 -                  60 Days  25 Weeks  120 Days 

0 30483 -                 

-                 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420182 Due: 5/20/2020

0 152081 -                 

-                 

0 110003 -                 

-                 

4 2510000 313.56                   489.91          605.58          313.56        574.26 

Neopart 230618 -                  Stock  45 Days  3-4 Weeks  Stock 

0 110004 -                 

-                 

6 410000 99.99                     130.00        101.44          101.90          99.99        155.32        131.08 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  4-6 Weeks  Stock  Stock  5 Weeks  45 Days  Stock 

6 410003 158.01                   165.00        163.09          158.01          158.08        177.20        235.00 

Muncie 230617 -                  4-6 Weeks 

 3 Stock 

Balance 

June 9th  21 Days  3-4 Weeks  6 Weeks  45 Days 

6 410006 137.10                   141.69  DQ          137.10          144.61        143.46        200.82        284.88 

Muncie 230617 -                  Stock 

Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

6 410009 101.44                   130.00        101.44          101.90        102.33        155.32        131.08 

Mohawk 230616 -                  4-6 Weeks  June 10th  21 Days  8 Weeks  45 Days  10 Stock 

5 410010 128.80                   132.94  DQ          128.80          153.09        135.99        282.29 

Muncie 230617 -                  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 2510006 67.91                        67.99             73.15          67.91 

NFI Parts 230619

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                  6 Weeks  45 Days  Stock 

2 1510008 12.85                  13.00          12.85 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  14 Days  Stock 

4 410012 189.86                   189.86  DQ          198.55          199.21        216.45 

Gillig 230611 -                  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock  Stock 

0 210002 -                 

-                 

0 110006 -                 

-                 

3 610009 1.76                             4.20             1.76            4.14 

NFI Parts 230619 -                 

 5 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  Stock  2 Weeks 

3 610018 41.44            41.44             DQ             46.05          50.46 

Coffman Truck Parts 

230610 -                  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM. 

 12 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days 

2 110014 106.15                   106.15        114.08 

NFI Parts 230619 QTY. 20 -                 

 32 Pc Min 

60 Days 

 3 Stock 

Balance 

July 6th 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420182 Due: 5/20/2020

1 210004 162.03                 162.03 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock 

7 610026 138.00          291.61                  257.70     138.00           142.00          172.56          159.51        348.13 

HECS 230612 -                 Stock  2-4 Weeks  14 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

2 2910007 36.88                        36.88          49.63 

NFI Parts 230619 QTY. 1 -                 

 11 Pc Min 

30 Days  18 Weeks 

1 1510045 34.11                     34.11 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock 

1 1510046 0.27                           0.27 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock 

5 610033 678.29          678.29             680.00    1,300.71          800.25    1,055.69 

Coffman Truck Parts 

230610

NORTHWEST HAS 

(2) CORES -                 

 200.00 Core 

Charge Stock  14 Days  30 Days 

 275.00 Core 

Charge 21 

Days 

 326.13 

Core 

Charge 5 

Weeks 

0 110023 -                 

-                 

4 610058 44.52            67.41                   107.09          107.00          44.52 

NFI Parts 230619 -                  Stock  June 10th 

 2 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  Stock 

2 2510042 12.40                 14.72            12.40 

Neopart 230618 -                  7-10 Days 

2 2510043 12.40                 14.75            12.40 

Neopart 230618 -                  7-10 Days 

0 110026 -                 

-                 

0 110027 -                 

-                 

4 610080 132.32          132.32                204.77          156.65        178.32 

Coffman Truck Parts 

230610 -                 Stock

 4 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  21 Days  Stock 

3 2510070 4.47                       6.49               4.47             4.98 

Neopart 230618

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                  Stock  7-10 Days  14 Weeks 

6 410080 278.88                   281.75  DQ          278.88          287.69        280.23        362.76        337.44 

Muncie 230617 -                  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM. 

 28 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  5 Weeks  45 Days  Stock 

0 110039 -                 

-                 

4 2510088 76.86                     250.00     238.00        227.35         76.86 

Transit Parts 101 

230622 -                  4-6 Weeks  14 Days  July 28th  10 Weeks 

5 410090 870.66                   885.00          871.53          870.66        902.04    1,083.30 

Neopart 230618 -                  6 Weeks  21 Days  3-4 weeks  6 Weeks  60 Days 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Autex 

Automotive 

Devices

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420182 Due: 5/20/2020

0 1510212 -                 

-                 

3 2510154 69.40                 79.14            69.40          81.97 

Neopart 230618 -                  2 Weeks  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 


