
Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

5 290415 450.18                   486.67          528.25          450.18        546.18        590.00 

Neopart 230588  Stock  21 Days  2-3 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

7 41236 139.00                 433.67          145.03        142.19          139.00          139.12        144.68        205.86 

Muncie 230587 -                  4 Weeks 

 1 Stock 

Balance 2-4 

Weeks  Stock  Stock  3-4 Weeks  5 Weeks  60 Days 

6 40029 1.97                           1.97               2.55               2.77             3.31             3.43             3.16 

Mohawk 230586 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 45 

Days  Stock 

6 40108 2.86                             3.10             2.89               2.86             2.93             3.57             3.12 

Muncie 230587  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 28 

Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 41131 48.52                     48.52             55.02            86.77        100.79        101.58 

Mohawk 230586

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                  May 29th 

 Bidding 6 

only at this 

price Stock  6-8 Weeks  Stock  60 Days 

6 60734 2.64                       2.74                4.30               2.64             3.24             6.17                   3.21 

Muncie 230587  Stock  Stock  Stock  11 Weeks  60 Days  Stock 

6 30406 124.02                 194.35          124.02        167.57          166.30        136.91        207.84 

Gillig 230581                     -    Stock  6 Weeks  20 Weeks  Stock  Stock  90 Days 

9 10194 10.46                        11.75       25.00              21.66          10.46             11.06          13.04          13.93          12.75                13.47 

Mohawk 230586 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 40106 1.98                           1.98               2.13               6.56             6.61             9.17          13.50 

Mohawk 230586 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 45 

Days  Stock 

6 40932 0.46                           0.46               1.50               1.52             1.66             2.30             1.72 

Mohawk 230586  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

4 60411 8.38                            13.99          43.91             17.72             8.38 

Suburban Truck Parts 

230590  Stock  May 31st  60 Days  Stock 

5 151458 164.56                 302.35          164.56          168.40        170.51        244.46 

Gillig 230581  2-4 Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 250586 144.36                   144.36    161.26      146.00          145.98        163.02 

Gillig 230581  2-3 Weeks 

 3-4 

Weeks 10 Days  7-10 Days 

 3 Stock 

Balance 4 

Weeks 

3 290646 96.11                   134.95             96.11        124.78 

Muncie 230587 -                  2 Weeks  30 Days  6 Weeks 

9 40798 93.91            93.91                   120.00          120.00        126.18          100.25          102.82        105.15        143.80        106.54 

Acme Truck Brake & 

Supply Co. 230576 1 Week  Stock  2-3 Weeks  May 28th  Stock  Stock 

 5 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks  45 Days  Stock 

5 290653 16.00                        17.60       16.00             20.05          18.63          23.25 

HECS 230582  Stock  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock 

RFQ 420178 Due: 5/14/2020



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420178 Due: 5/14/2020

7 10193 14.37                        14.37       32.00          15.30             15.10          17.35          19.03          18.02 

Gillig 230581  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 290645 57.43                     59.35             57.43          75.23 

Muncie 230587 -                  Stock  30 Days 

 1 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks 

6 290537 155.50                   155.75     155.50          196.90          161.11        167.83        207.20 

HECS 230582 -                  Stock  Stock 

 5 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  2-3 Weeks  3 Weeks  45 Days 

6 40980 1.35                           1.35               4.15               5.15             5.25             5.95             5.90 

Mohawk 230586 -                  Stock  21 Days  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

7 40867 25.20                        26.46          26.42             27.10          53.83          31.75          32.26                25.20 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 230591  Stock  Stock  Stock  9 Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock 

10 40953 8.30               18.48                   13.75              38.17             8.30             14.20            32.51          24.25          18.10          33.46                13.71 

Mohawk 230586 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock  Stock 

3 40193 0.49                           0.49               0.75             0.62 

Mohawk 230586 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 290289 8.50                             8.50       10.00             11.15               9.20          10.66          10.57 

Gillig 230581   2 Weeks  Stock  21 Days  3-4 Weeks  Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 45 

Days 

5 290531 22.85                        22.85             23.12            31.44          27.56          32.07 

Gillig 230581 -                  Stock  49 Days  6-8 Weeks  4 Weeks  60 Days 

2 290643 5.61                           5.89                   5.61 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 230591 -                  Stock 

8 41216 179.55                 180.00          185.50      179.55          213.83          514.20        181.58        263.70        204.39 

Midwest Bus 230585 -                  Stock  Stock  7 days  21 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

4 290484 2.44                           2.55               2.44               3.32             2.48 

Muncie 230587 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 290647 90.45                   134.95          104.54          90.45 

NFI Partts -                  Stock  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks 

1 290654 28.22                        28.22 

Gillig 230581 -                  2-4 Weeks 

4 290657 11.39                        11.50             12.40          11.39          14.04 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  Stock  21 Days  4 Weeks  60 Days 

9 60745 43.57            44.35       88.18                        86.93              95.00        103.80             75.10        111.84        108.67                43.57 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 230591 -                 Stock  Stock  2 Weeks  Stock  June 4th  30 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420178 Due: 5/14/2020

3 290644 53.34                     59.35             56.99          53.34 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  Stock  21 Days 

 10 Stock 

Balance 5 

Weeks 

7 41213 99.97                   110.00          105.00      122.00  DQ          199.52          230.55          99.97        133.09 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  Stock  Stock  7 Days 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  21 Days  2-3 Weeks  5 Weeks  Stock 

7 41217 81.61                   161.95             96.48          86.41             89.25          81.61        149.40        109.73 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  2-3 Weeks  4-6 Weeks  Stock 

 5 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

6 10405 121.80                 194.35          121.80        123.70          166.27        141.60        207.84 

Gillig 230581 -                  2-4 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

 5 Stock 

Balance 30 

Days  Stock  120 Days 

7 40052 24.75                        25.30          27.18             27.00          32.09          33.28          32.16                24.75 

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program 230591

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 30361 7.56                           8.98               7.56               7.68             7.56          11.08             9.20 

Muncie 230587  June 28th  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 45 

Days  Stock 

6 40349 0.11                           0.11               0.16               0.18             0.19             0.20             0.18 

Mohawk 230586 QTY. 400 -                  Stock  154 Only  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

5 40979 10.15                     10.15            14.56          15.57          18.90          16.53 

Mohawk 230586 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

7 40079 8.55                           14.11         8.90             8.55             12.75            13.85          14.60          16.66 

Mohawk 230586 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  2-3 Weeks  Stock  45 Days 

9 40922 18.12            34.55                75.55             28.50          18.12             30.86            29.10          36.02          37.79          42.78 

Mohawk 230586 -                 Stock  2-3 Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock  2-3 Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock 

5 40077 0.44                           0.44               0.95               1.07             1.06             1.14 

Mohawk 230586 -                  Stock  Stock  2-3 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

6 40185 16.95                        48.86          16.95             19.05            51.45          54.10          61.65 

Mohawk 230586 -                 

 3 Stock 

Balance 2-3 

Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 3 Stock 

Balance 26 

Weeks  Stock 

6 10001 0.37                           0.37               1.20               1.09             1.10             1.52             1.19 

Mohawk 230586 -                  Stock  14 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 40090 0.53                           0.87               0.54               0.54             0.53             0.67             0.89 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  Stock 

 24 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420178 Due: 5/14/2020

5 40856 45.52                     112.30        119.83          116.99          45.52        116.39 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  2-4 Weeks  June 11th  30 Days 

 1 Stock 

Balance 10 

Weeks  Stock 

6 41132 48.52                     48.52             98.74            85.19        104.67        109.56          98.50 

Mohawk 230586

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                  Stock  60 Days  Stock  Stock  60 Days  Stock 

4 60748 44.63                     59.35             64.00          44.63          64.67 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  Stock  60 Days  5 Weeks  Stock 

5 250689 176.83                   176.83    194.18      182.00          178.30        178.27 

Gillig 230581

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                  2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  5 Weeks 

2 30411 209.95                 209.95          441.00 

ElDorado 230580 -                  2 Weeks  30 Days 

7 20707 91.39                   172.75             92.00          107.37            91.39          94.89        131.62        107.26 

Neopart 230588 -                  2 Weeks  1-2 Weks  30 Days  Stock  5 Weeks  45 Days  Stock 

7 20708 89.76                   172.75             92.00          107.37            89.76          99.54        131.62        107.26 

Neopart 230588 -                  2 Weeks  1-2 Weeks  30 Days  Stock  5 Weeks  45 Days  Stock 

1 20709 734.35                 734.35 

ElDorado 230580  Stock 

4 30421 111.68                 161.95          111.68          114.80        116.24 

Gillig 230581 -                  Stock  Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock 

3 290666 25.25                     26.95             25.25          26.93 

Muncie 230587 -                  Stock  30 Days  6 Weeks 

1 20712 410.35                 410.35 

ElDorado 230580 -                  Stock 

5 60771 71.19            127.42                      71.19          149.00        176.12          91.86 

Kirk's Automotive 

230583 -                  Stock  Stock  21 Days  5 Weeks  45 Days 

3 250703 6.02                             6.02         6.99               6.73 

Gillig 230581 -                  1-2 Weeks  Stock  7-10 Days 

6 41272 31.75                     43.15          37.95             36.07            31.75          37.34          44.40 

Neopart 230588 -                  2-4 Weeks  June 11th  30 Days  Stock  Stock  45 Days 

7 41273 31.75                     43.15          37.95             36.00            31.75          32.29          44.40          36.03 

Neopart 230588 -                  2-4 Weeks  June 11th  30 Days  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

5 290673 890.00             1,199.00          890.00       1,020.22    1,098.44    1,172.84 

Gillig 230581 -                  4 Weeks  4-6 Weeks  21 Days 

 1 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks  90 Days 

5 290679 52.75                        53.50       52.75             63.63          59.28          72.34 

HECS 230582 -                  Stock  Stock  21 Days  Stock  45 Days 

1 41281 21.55                     21.55 

ElDorado 230580

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                  1-2 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420178 Due: 5/14/2020

5 41288 92.50                   248.35             92.50  DQ             97.35            96.13        105.75 

Gillig 230581 -                  4 Weeks  1-2 Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  2-3 Weeks  Stock 

3 60790 499.59                 776.95          499.59        738.20 

Muncie 230587 -                  2-4 Weeks  45 Days  8 Weeks 

3 60793 32.06            32.06                        37.72          41.65 

Coffman Truck Sales 

230579 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock 

1 290684 19.67                     19.67 

ElDorado 230580 -                  1-2 Weeks 

6 152032 126.99                 280.75          140.00      155.00          126.99        131.92        182.97 

Muncie 230587

SOUTH AND WEST 

HAVE 0 ON HAND -                  2 Weeks  4-6 Weeks 

 3-4 

Weeks 

 6 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  60 Days 

5 250784 205.77                   205.77      215.00          216.68        242.25        257.48 

Gillig 230581 -                  Stock  10 Days  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 290695 62.80                     91.75             62.87          62.80 

Muncie 230587 -                  4-6 Weeks  Stock  26 Weeks 

5 152074 10.39                     16.15       10.40          10.82             10.39          12.72 

Muncie 230587 -                  2 Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

4 290700 161.48                 248.75          163.40        161.48        205.56 

Muncie 230587 -                  Stock 

 2 Stock 

Balance 37 

Days  26 Weeks  120 Days 

4 290701 163.00                 248.35          163.40        163.00        205.56 

Muncie 230587 -                  Stock  60 Days  26 Weeks  120 Days 

1 30483 119.31                 119.31 

ElDorado 230580 -                 

 8-10 

Weeks 

1 110003 237.55                 237.55 

ElDorado 230580 -                  2-4 Weeks 

7 410000 101.04                 134.95          130.00        101.97          103.78        101.04        155.32        126.36 

Mohawk 230586

LOW STOCK - RIVER 

HAS 0 ON HAND -                  2-4 Weeks  4-6 Weeks  Stock  Stock  8 Weeks  45 Days  Stock 

6 410006 137.15                   141.69  DQ          137.15          143.27        143.46        200.82        287.59 

Muncie 230587 -                 

 24 Stock 

Balance 2-3 

Weeks 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

7 410009 101.97                 134.95          130.00        101.97          105.15        102.33        155.32        126.36 

Mohawk 230586 -                  2-4 Weeks  4-6 Weeks June 10th  21 Days  8 Weeks  45 Days  Stock 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420178 Due: 5/14/2020

5 410010 128.82                 363.06          132.94  DQ          128.82          153.75        135.99 

Muncie 230587

NORTHWEST HAS 

LOW STOCK -                  6-8 Weeks  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock  Stock 

2 1510007 18.23                     26.95          18.23 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  2 Weeks  7 Weeks 

3 1510008 12.95                     13.60       13.25          12.95 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  2 Weeks  Stock  Stock 

4 2510007 718.17                   718.47    752.70          722.41        718.17 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  1-2 Weeks  Stock  7-10 Days  Stock 

1 210002 323.95                 323.95 

ElDorado 230580 -                  Stock 

5 2910003 1.84                             3.10               1.84               1.86             3.24             2.28 

Muncie 230587 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 610014 11.14            13.69                     11.14             15.17          17.16          17.51                13.87 

Mohawk 230586 -                 Stock  June 11th 

 2 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  Stock  45 Days  Stock 

4 2910005 8.28                        18.50       11.50          8.99               8.28 

Muncie 230587 -                  2-4 Weeks  14 Days  7 Days  30 Days 

3 610018 41.44            41.44             DQ             46.06          51.06 

Coffman Truck Sales 

230579 -                  Stock 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock  Stock 

3 310008 94.50                   140.35             94.50          95.73 

Muncie 230587 -                  1-2 Weeks  21 Days  Stock 

3 310017 2.69                             2.99             3.09             2.69 

Suburban Truck Parts 

230590 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock 

6 410035 376.45                   405.00        389.95          383.75          376.45        470.34        479.69 

Neopart 230588 -                  4-6 Weeks  June 5th 

 1 Stock 

Balance 21 

Days  2-3 Weeks  6 Weeks  45 Days 

6 410036 376.45                   405.00        389.95          383.75          376.45        406.20        479.69 

Neopart 230588 -                  4-6 Weeks  June 5th  21 Days  2-3 Weeks 

 3 Stock 

Balance 6 

Weeks  45 Days 

1 110022 32.35                     32.35 

ElDorado 230580 -                  2 Weeks 

1 310018 9.15                           9.15 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  Stock 

1 110023 18.85                     18.85 

ElDorado 230580

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                  4-6 Weeks 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420178 Due: 5/14/2020

6 610050 19.55            19.55        DQ             27.70            44.92        124.16          41.54                19.61 

CBM 230578 -                 14 Days

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock 

 1 Stock 

Balance 3-4 

Weeks  Stock  Stock  Stock 

3 410055 113.96          113.96                 127.00          126.06 

Chicago Parts & 

Sound 230577 -                 Stock  Stock  30 Days 

3 610055 37.00            37.58                  37.00  DQ             41.33 

HECS 230582 -                 Stock  14 Days 

 Not an 

approved 

OEM.  Stock 

1 310026 1,000.00          1,000.00 

ElDorado 230580 -                  4-6 Weeks 

1 310027 500.00                 500.00 

ElDorado 230580 -                  4 Weeks 

1 110026 45.00                     45.00 

ElDorado 230580 -                  6 Weeks 

5 610064 77.77            77.77                     94.07             86.12        108.89        133.90 

Coffman Truck Sales 

230579 -                 Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

1 110033 2.89                           2.89 

NFI Parts 230589

WEST HAS 0 ON 

HAND -                  Stock 

2 1510130 35.00                     37.75       35.00 

HECS 230582 -                  2 Weeks  10 Days 

5 1510139 10.11                     11.83       10.75        10.44             10.11          13.84 

Muncie 230587 -                  2 Weeks  14 Days  7 Days  30 Days  5 Weeks 

2 310038 402.08                 410.00        402.08 

NFI Parts 230589

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                  6-8 Weeks  10 Weeks 

6 610080 99.80            132.32                   128.00        204.77          104.80        182.89          99.80 

Did Not Award.

DID NOT AWARD - 

NEED TO CONFIRM 

OEM PART 

NUMBER. -                 Stock  Stock 

 4 Stock 

Balance 

May 28th  30 Days  Stock  Stock 

2 2510068 36.88                        36.88      41.06 

Lift-U Parts 230584

NORTH SHORE HAS 

0 ON HAND -                  2 Weeks  Stock 

2 2510069 0.49                       0.49               2.11 

Lift-U Parts 230584

NORTH SHORE HAS 

0 ON HAND -                  Stock  7-10 Days 

6 2510070 4.39                             4.76         6.99          4.39               4.47             5.16             6.55 

Lift-U Parts 230584

LOW STOCK - 

NORTHWEST HAS 0 

ON HAND -                  2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days  14 Weeks  45 Days 



Pace

TOTAL

White = No Bid

Green = Disqualified

Number of Bids, 

Winning Bidder & PO 

Number

SKU

Winning Bid Acme Truck 

Brake & 

Supply Co.

Area 

Diesel 

Service

Chicago 

Parts & 

Sound

CBM Coffman 

Truck Sales

ElDorado General 

Truck 

Parts

Gillig HECS Interstate 

Power 

Systems

Kirk's 

Automotive

Lift -U 

Parts

Midwest 

Bus

Mohawk Muncie Neopart NFI Parts Prevost Rome 

Truck 

Parts

Suburban 

Truck Parts

Transit 

Parts 101

Vehicle 

Maintenance 

Program

RFQ 420178 Due: 5/14/2020

5 2510071 32.09                        34.59      33.89        32.09            32.09          35.20 

Midwest Bus 230585 -                  2 Weeks  Stock  10 Days  7-10 Days 

 3 Stock 

Balance 7 

Weeks 

2 2510072 36.88                        36.88      37.78 

Gillig 230581 -                  2 Weeks  Stock 

3 2510088 240.00                   250.00     240.00        274.38 

HECS 230582 -                  4-6 Weeks  45 Days  8 Weeks 

1 2910030 407.95                 407.95 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  Stock 

4 410083 89.88                        91.81          103.36            89.88        111.28 

Neopart 230588 -                  4 Weeks  30 Days  4-6 Weeks  7 Weeks 

6 410091 866.74                   975.00        974.88          869.50          866.74    1,054.33    1,249.90 

Neopart 230588 -                  4-6 Weeks  June 11th  30 Days  2-3 Weeks  6 Weeks  60 Days 

1 2910039 7.28                           7.28 

NFI Parts 230589 -                  Stock 

5 410092 90.55                   138.50             90.55          111.51            95.95        116.60 

Gillig 230581 -                  4 Weeks  2-4 Weeks  21 Days  4-6 Weeks  60 Days 

5 410093 90.55                   138.50             90.55          111.51            95.95        116.60 

Gillig 230581 -                  4 Weeks  2-4 Weeks  21 Days  4-6 Weeks  60 Days 

7 410095 80.25            244.18            102.03             92.50             91.68            80.25          99.77        120.50 

Neopart 230588 -                 65 Days  4 Weeks  1-2 Weeks  30 Days  2-3 Weeks  5 Weeks 

 3 Stock 

Balance 45 

Days 

3 610121 115.14          115.14                  136.30        146.04 

Coffman Truck Sales 

230579 -                 Stock  21 Days  4 Weeks 

2 410104 44.69                     44.69             45.76 

ElDorado 230580 -                  4 Weeks  21 Days 

1 410105 28.46                     28.46 

ElDorado 230580 -                  2 Weeks 


