
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart 

Transit

Rex Sales Interstate 

Power

Coffman 

Truck

CBM MW Bus Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

P&G Keene Eldorado 

National

The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Area Diesel TP 101 Vehicle 

Maintenance

Prevost Hydraulic 

Electric

Gillig Mohawk

                                  7 80883 1.19                      16.13             19.11         16.00            20.58 1.19           16.00                        1.55 

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 4W  stock  stock  45D stock stock  stock 

                                  1 81297 43.15                    43.15 

Eldorado National 230552 -                 stock 

                                  1 110135 32.35                    32.35 

Eldorado National 230552 -                 stock 

                                  5 81089 1.52                         4.12                5.92            4.80            4.29                1.52 

Mohawk 230551  stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  3 130745 13.89                   13.89             25.11         15.20 

Interstate Power 230553 -                Stock  6W  stock 

                                  2 81285 1,094.41         1,295.95        1,094.41 

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230546 -                 stock  7W 

                                  7 120335 8.98                      15.71         16.18         10.09             13.90            8.98                17.93              17.50 

Muncie Transit 230547 -                 10D  stock  stock  7W  30D  Stock  30D 

                                  8 81313 35.38                   84.21         35.38             78.87         47.07         87.72            86.00 80.00                      42.25 

CBM 230555 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  60D 2W

 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 81326 152.59              154.40           152.59       157.15            218.50 

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230546 -                 Stock  stock  30D  4W 

                                  8 100223 71.06                   75.61         93.24           113.27       107.95         97.13          159.16 73.00                      71.06 

Hydraulic Electric 230549  Stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  45D 14D

 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 81378 18.59                    46.69             32.30         22.42              18.59 

Mohawk 230551  6W  6W  30D  2W 

                                  5 81385 12.10                   12.10             17.39         14.00         12.60              14.70 

Coffman Truck 230544  stock  10W  21D  stock  3W 

                                  7 130755 28.90                   48.01         42.25             67.15         45.45 34.00         58.78                      28.90 

Hydraulic Electric 230549  Stock  stock  7W  stock 14D 2W

 unapproved 

part 

                                  6 81407 140.00               157.54           212.30       182.82       162.20 140.00                  179.90 

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 stock  21W  21D  stock 14D  2W 

                                  7 100230 58.97                   88.52         62.55           115.68         98.00         92.21          104.52              58.97 

Pace RFQ# 420165



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart 

Transit

Rex Sales Interstate 

Power

Coffman 

Truck

CBM MW Bus Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

P&G Keene Eldorado 

National

The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Area Diesel TP 101 Vehicle 

Maintenance

Prevost Hydraulic 

Electric

Gillig Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 420165

CBM 230555  stock Stock  stock  stock  stock  45D 

 unapproved 

part 

                                  2 81423 21.89                    43.15             21.89 

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230546  stock  stock 

                                  5 81422 1.55                         1.94                2.60            2.25            2.02                1.55 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  stock  21D  stock 

 unapproved 

part 

                                  5 81430 280.82               280.82           368.77       330.00       282.53            289.73 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  5W  21D 

 no lead 

time given  3W 

                                  6 81441 37.49                   42.53             37.49         49.25         44.30            53.71              55.38 

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230546 -                 stock  stock  21D  stock  45D  3W 

                                  5 120540 40.00                   47.65             60.43         55.15         49.64 40.00         

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 stock  5W  21D  stock 14D

                                  6 120541 45.49                   45.49             57.69         52.69         47.38 55.00                      57.70 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  5W  21D  stock 14D  1W 

                                  6 120542 44.41                   44.41             63.84         54.00         46.26 46.00                 1,024.36 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  11W  21D  stock  14D  2W 

                                  4 81534 33.34                    57.21             33.34         38.08 37.25         

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230546 -                 6W  6W  21D 2W

                                  3 810007 421.15               436.00        421.15       589.00 

Availability - P&G 

Keene 230545 -                 stock  6W  21D 

                                  5 1310001 675.00              862.96           815.00        1,256.39 675.00               1,024.36 

Availability - 

Interstate Power 230553 -                 Stock 

 last order 

had to be 

cancelled  stock 14D  2W 

                                  5 1010002 3.75                        6.55            7.51                3.75            5.90 5.00           

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230546 -                 stock  6W  stock  7D stock

                                  1 1010005 279.18                279.18 

Eldorado National 230552 -                 stock 

                                  1 1010006 20.95                    20.95 

Eldorado National 230552 -                 stock 

                                  7 1010011 824.58            1,252.80    1,350.00       824.58       965.00       833.91       1,611.22         1,145.00 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 10D  Stock  stock  21D  stock  Stock  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart 

Transit

Rex Sales Interstate 

Power

Coffman 

Truck

CBM MW Bus Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

P&G Keene Eldorado 

National

The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Area Diesel TP 101 Vehicle 

Maintenance

Prevost Hydraulic 

Electric

Gillig Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 420165

                                  7 1010012 1,289.86         1,422.36    1,495.00    1,737.24        1,837.99    2,048.48    1,765.23         1,289.86 

Mohawk 230551 -                 Stock  Stock  stock  5W  21D  stock  stock 

                                  5 810025 648.69               650.00       738.90        1,316.27       817.99       648.69 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 Stock  stock  5W  21D  stock 

                                  4 810026 878.73               909.77        1,133.30    1,084.84       878.73 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 stock  4W  21D  stock 

                                  4 810027 496.89               499.78           602.03       585.85       496.89 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 stock  stock  21D  stock 

                                  4 810028 64.13                  134.95             84.13       107.00 64.13         

Gillig 230475 -                 stock  stock  90D stock

                                  6 810030 1.53                         2.38                3.06            2.64            2.49              4.40                1.53 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  10W  21D  stock  Stock 

 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 810034 89.79                   89.79           113.89       104.00         90.29 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 7D  7W  21D  stock 

                                  7 1010015 851.94            1,236.60    1,300.00       853.12        1,657.15    1,700.00       851.94         1,070.00 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 Stock  Stock  stock  4W  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 1010016 2,129.69         2,174.21        2,936.97    2,550.00    2,129.69 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 stock  7W  21D  stock 

                                  3 810050 101.99                101.99           219.50       113.81 

Eldorado National 230552 -                 6W  7W  4W 

                                  3 810051 113.40                113.40           222.50       124.60 

Eldorado National 230552 -                 stock  4W  4W 

                                  5 810060 33.80                   35.55             42.81         39.30         35.69              33.80 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  stock  21D  stock 

 unapproved 

part 

                                  5 810063 90.00                 181.00           350.38       182.44       155.43 90.00         

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 stock  7W  21D  stock 14D

                                  6 810070 819.69            1,250.00       880.23        1,090.81    1,020.20       819.69         1,055.31 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 Stock  stock  7W  21D  stock  1W 

                                  4 810071 642.23               642.23        1,090.81       749.00       648.88 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart 

Transit

Rex Sales Interstate 

Power

Coffman 

Truck

CBM MW Bus Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

P&G Keene Eldorado 

National

The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Area Diesel TP 101 Vehicle 

Maintenance

Prevost Hydraulic 

Electric

Gillig Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 420165

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  7W  21D  stock 

                                  4 810073 105.12               105.12           124.48       123.23       106.21 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  7W  21D  stock 

                                  7 810078 365.00               384.70           546.13       449.95       378.24          737.15 365.00                  576.84 

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 stock  5W  21D  stock  45D 14D  1W 

                                  5 810079 384.70               384.70           612.73       449.95       386.73 385.00       

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  7W  21D  stock 14D

                                  5 1010030 92.03                   92.03           127.20       101.19         92.53            115.78 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  1 1210044 17.45                    17.45 

Eldorado National 230552 -                 5W 

                                  8 1010032 90.00                   90.89       106.32           126.18       124.50       106.88          189.80 90.00                      90.45 

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 Stock  stock  stock  stock  stock  45D 14D  stock 

                                  6 810098 237.14               237.14           279.35       262.99       238.36          373.94            312.88 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  6W  stock  stock  60D  stock 

                                  5 810110 247.69               333.37           766.99       375.75       247.69            492.37 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 stock  5W  21D  stock  3W 

                                  5 810123 53.48                   53.49             72.09         62.00         53.48            82.94 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  60D 

                                  6 810141 33.24                   59.62             83.47         69.50         62.09 44.00                      33.24 

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 stock  3W  stock  stock 14D

 unapproved 

part 

                                  4 1210078 340.75                556.55           340.75       345.45 368.75      

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230546 -                 stock  11W  60D 8W

                                  5 810154 7.78                         8.01                9.75            9.30            7.78                9.55 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 stock  stock  21D  stock  3W 

                                  6 810155 200.00         242.91           315.15       282.82       287.51 200.00                  292.70 

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 stock  stock  21D  stock 14D  3W 

                                  4 810162 57.82                   57.82             73.34         66.96         58.18 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  7W  21D  stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart 

Transit

Rex Sales Interstate 

Power

Coffman 

Truck

CBM MW Bus Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

P&G Keene Eldorado 

National

The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Area Diesel TP 101 Vehicle 

Maintenance

Prevost Hydraulic 

Electric

Gillig Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 420165

                                  6 810173 17.39                   20.56             25.77         26.62         21.40 23.00                      17.39 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  5W  21D  stock stock

 unapproved 

part 

                                  2 1210086 127.50                172.75       127.50 

TP101 230557 -                 6W  4W 

                                  4 810204 245.26               245.26           518.22       287.00       245.69 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  5W  21D  stock 

                                  4 1210091 861.69               898.35        1,093.87    1,020.20       861.69 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 stock  4W  21D  stock 

                                  3 810209 18.36                   18.36         19.99         18.36 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  21D 

 no lead 

time given 

                                  4 1010060 2,169.69         2,172.47        2,884.89    2,552.75    2,169.69 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 stock  7W  21D  stock 

                                  7 1010061 844.01               984.40    1,050.00       846.55        1,859.57       999.98       844.01            940.00 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 10D  Stock  stock  9W  21D 

 no lead 

time given  stock 

                                  4 810234 190.94               190.94           238.10       208.08       216.95 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock 

                                  4 810236 8.09                         8.11             10.28            8.92            8.09 

Area Diesel 230556 -                 stock  5W  21D  stock 

                                  5 810240 208.52               208.52           270.86       243.43       209.69            273.68 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 stock  stock  stock  stock  1W 

                                  1 1010069 512.95                   512.95 

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230546 -                 stock 

                                  6 1210119 920.00               948.69    1,222.25        1,621.83    1,350.95    1,372.26 920.00       

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 Stock  stock  6M  21D  stock 14D

                                  2 1110004 69.69                       88.59         69.69 

Muncie Transit 230547 -                 3W  30D 

                                  5 810276 1,300.00         1,424.00        2,889.72    2,100.00    1,935.00 1,300.00    

Hydraulic Electric 230549 -                 stock  6W  21D  stock 14D

                                  1 1310031 1.34                         1.34 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid Neopart 

Transit

Rex Sales Interstate 

Power

Coffman 

Truck

CBM MW Bus Kirk's Auto Suburban 

Truck

P&G Keene Eldorado 

National

The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Area Diesel TP 101 Vehicle 

Maintenance

Prevost Hydraulic 

Electric

Gillig Mohawk

Pace RFQ# 420165

Eldorado National 230552 -                 6W 

                                  4 810282 526.39               526.39           726.42       585.85       619.28 

Coffman Truck 230544 -                 7D  stock  21D 

 no lead 

time given 


