Pace RFQ# 420164

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ./ ! ! [ ' | | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Neopart 1/0 Interstate | Coffman | Midwest | Suburban P&G Prevost The Kirk's Auto| Muncie Vehicle Hydraulic | Battery | GilligLLC | Mohawk | Eldorado
Transit Controls Power Truck Bus Truck Keene Aftermarket Transit | Maintenance | Electric Systems National
NO # of Bids Parts
6 72139 314.46 357.34 314.46 450.00 408.68 345.55 360.00
Coffman Truck 230544 - Stock Stock 7D Stock 21D 2W
5 70629 0.84 1.15 0.84 0.88 1.99 0.96
The Aftermarket
Parts 230546 - Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock
1 72125 70.15 70.15
Eldorado National 230552 - a4W
5 71441 6.38 8.01 6.38 6.99 7.05 26.95
Muncie Transit 230547 5W 30D Stock Stock 4W
6 70220 7.95 28.89 20.39 11.56 16.74 7.95 32.35
Mohawk 230551 - Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock stock
6 72143 10.35 10.81 13.28 10.46 10.95 10.35 21.55
Gillig LLC 230475 - TW 60D Stock 30D Stock stock
1 72138 97.15 97.15
Eldorado National 230552 - 4W
1 72137 97.15 97.15
Eldorado National 230552 - 4W
3 71357 9.29 9.29 11.30 15.07
The Aftermarket
Parts 230546 - Stock 3w stock
5 72142 9.57 9.63 9.58 9.57 11.69 18.85
Muncie Transit 230547 W 13w 42D 6W stock




Pace RFQ# 420164

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart 1/0 Interstate | Coffman | Midwest | Suburban P&G Prevost The Kirk's Auto| Muncie Vehicle Hydraulic | Battery | GilligLLC | Mohawk | Eldorado
Transit Controls Power Truck Bus Truck Keene Aftermarket Transit | Maintenance | Electric Systems National
NO # of Bids Parts
1 71539 32.35 32.35
Eldorado National 230552 AW
6 72094 14.19 15.05 27.81 21.69 14.19 24.79 26.95
Vehicle Maintenance | 230548 45D 8w 30D Stock 3w stock
5 71442 5.65 8.06 5.65 7.25 7.05 26.95
Muncie Transit 230547 Stock 21D Stock 4w Stock
1 72120 97.15 97.15
Eldorado National 230552 - stock
4 70730 0.13 0.30 0.76 0.13 0.18
Muncie Transit 230547 60D Stock Stock 3w
6 71533 6.60 22.28 22.14 13.66 26.00 17.31 6.60
unapproved
Muncie Transit 230547 Stock Stock Stock 14D Stock part
1 72144 26.95 26.95
Eldorado National 230552 - Stock
1 72163 431.95 431.95
Eldorado National 230552 - stock
1 72182 78 By
Eldorado National 230552 - stock
4 72184 4.57 4.57 5.48 4.65 11.83
The Aftermarket
Parts 230546 - Stock Stock Stock stock
5 72194 70.00 72.29 82.68 72.25 70.00 129.55
Muncie Transit 230547 - Stock 60D IW Stock stock
4 72216 150.90 210.00 150.90 155.50 291.55
The Aftermarket
Parts 203546 - Stock Stock Stock stock




Pace

RFQ# 420164

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart 1/0 Interstate | Coffman | Midwest | Suburban P&G Prevost The Kirk's Auto| Muncie Vehicle Hydraulic | Battery | GilligLLC | Mohawk | Eldorado
Transit Controls Power Truck Bus Truck Keene Aftermarket Transit | Maintenance | Electric Systems National
NO # of Bids Parts
72240 1,105.58 1,105.58 1,634.68 1,342.22
Coffman Truck 230544 - Stock 5W 30D




Pace

RFQ# 420164

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ./ ! ! [ ' | | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Neopart 1/0 Interstate | Coffman | Midwest | Suburban P&G Prevost The Kirk's Auto| Muncie Vehicle Hydraulic | Battery | GilligLLC | Mohawk | Eldorado
Transit Controls Power Truck Bus Truck Keene Aftermarket Transit | Maintenance | Electric Systems National
NO # of Bids Parts
72295 30.98 42.60 44.25 30.98 47.99 31.22 32.35
Muncie Transit 230547 - 60D Stock 30D 21D 5W stock
72301 240.00 240.00
Battery Systems 230550 - Stock
710021 43.15 43.15
Eldorado National 230552 - stock
710030 =
710043 256.04 256.04 341.93 322.00 291.30 285.00 328.26
P&G Keene 230545 - Stock 60D Stock 30D 4w 3w
710057 39.00 45.40 53.96 51.06 39.00 56.58
Hydraulic Electric 230549 - Stock Stock 21D 14D 5W
710136 515.06 705.60 927.36 811.03 515.06 564.09
Gillig LLC 230475 - 8W Stock 60D Stock stock
710137 299.97 462.21 506.90 525.00 299.97
Eldorado National 230552 - Stock 90D 6W stock
710150 16.99 16.99 26.95
Hydraulic Electric 230549 - 14D stock
710154 2.65 2.65
Eldorado National 230552 - stock
710168 398.42 398.42 564.71 532.68 500.00 488.16 442.90
P&G Keene 230545 - Stock 60D W Stock 35D 2W
710170 2,623.67 2,623.67 | 3,816.82 3,046.50| 3,118.44 | 3,299.99 3,125.00
P&G Keene 230545 - Stock 60D ow Stock 30D 4w




Pace

RFQ# 420164

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart 1/0 Interstate | Coffman | Midwest | Suburban P&G Prevost The Kirk's Auto| Muncie Vehicle Hydraulic | Battery | GilligLLC | Mohawk | Eldorado
Transit Controls Power Truck Bus Truck Keene Aftermarket Transit | Maintenance | Electric Systems National
NO # of Bids Parts
2 | 710177 7.46 8.69 7.46
Muncie Transit 230547 - 12w 90D




Pace RFQ# 420164
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart 1/0 Interstate | Coffman | Midwest | Suburban P&G Prevost The Kirk's Auto| Muncie Vehicle Hydraulic | Battery | GilligLLC | Mohawk | Eldorado
Transit Controls Power Truck Bus Truck Keene Aftermarket Transit | Maintenance | Electric Systems National
NO # of Bids Parts
710190 99.05 99.05
Eldorado National 230552 - stock
710247 246.00 246.00
Eldorado National 230552 - a4W
710260 395.04 395.04 531.00 459.35 428.36
1/0 Controls 230543 - 3w 10w 60D 4W
710280 102.55 102.55
Eldorado National 230552 SW
710309 3,197.25 3,197.25 4,567.50 3,626.83 3,675.00 3,675.00
1/0 Controls 230543 - 8w 90D Stock 56D 4w
710310 452.22 452.22
The Aftermarket
Parts 230546 - 13W
710311 452.22 452.22
The Aftermarket
Parts 230546 - 13w




