Pace RFQ# 420141
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ! ! ! ! . | | | . | [ . | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Neopart Rex Sales Kirk's Auto | CBM USA Vehicle E3 Spark Coffman Gillig LLC Mohawk Prevost Muncie The Area Diesel | Hydraulic | Eldorado
Transit Maintenance Plugs Truck Transit Aftermarket Electric National
NO # of Bids Parts
130592 10.03 10.93 17.90 10.03 16.02 14.50
Prevost 230483 - Stock 6W 60D Stock Stock
110135 32.35 32.35
Eldorado National 230470 - Stock
120457 48.00 62.55 63.80 50.04 48.00
Hydraulic Electric 230486 - Stock 3w 30D 14D
81090 77.12 77.12 110.34 85.72 101.40 80.34
Coffman Truck 230479 Stock 6W Stock W Stock
81162 3.40 14.80 3.40 18.29 14.33 16.36 6.00
Mohawk 230478 - Stock Stock 45D Stock Stock 14D
100223 71.06 75.61 92.27 71.06 159.16 108.18 113.59 87.13 73.00
unapproved
Hydraulic Electric 230486 - Stock Stock part 60D Stock Stock Stock 14D
120502 85.30 97.50 87.41 119.41 85.30
Hydraulic Electric 230486 - Stock Stock 5W 14D
81375 86.35 86.35
Eldorado National 230470 - Stock
100230 59.87 62.55 88.06 59.87 104.52 98.38 116.39 92.19 67.00
unapproved
CBM USA 230481 - Stock Stock part 60D Stock Stock Stock 14D
100231 117.17 117.17 135.19 148.56 157.72 178.68 141.56 150.00
Neopart Transit 230469 Stock Stock 5W Stock Stock Stock 14D




Pace RFQ# 420141

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

Sku Winning bid | Neopart Rex Sales Kirk's Auto | CBM USA Vehicle E3 Spark Coffman Gillig LLC Mohawk Prevost Muncie The Area Diesel | Hydraulic | Eldorado
Transit Maintenance Plugs Truck Transit Aftermarket Electric National
NO # of Bids Parts
1 81417 21.55 21.55
Eldorado National 230470 Stock
2 81423 21.89 21.89 43.15
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 Stock Stock
6 81441 37.49 42.31 54.38 53.71 49.53 37.49 44.30
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 Stock 5W 45D 21D Stock Stock
5 81503 11.50 19.26 11.50 22.50 22.94 20.58
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock part Stock Stock Stock
6 81516 8.37 9.00 8.37 10.61 9.36 10.37 8.71
Coffman Truck 230479 Stock Stock 5W Stock Stock Stock
1 120553 226.75 226.75
Eldorado National 230470 Stock
4 81534 31.70 41.66 31.70 33.73 57.21
Muncie Transit 230474 - AW 21D 6W 3w
8| 1010011 824.58 1,252.80 1,375.00 824.58 1,130.00 1,611.12 965.96 1,860.97 835.70
Coffman Truck 230479 - 10D Stock Stock Stock 60D 21D 5W Stock
4| 810027 496.98 497.17 586.12 605.42 496.98
Area Diesel 230485 - Stock 21D 9w Stock
9| 1010013 8.00 15.68 8.00 12.00 27.65 11.40 45.41 30.71 33.71 29.10
unapproved | unapproved unapproved
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock part part Stock part 60D 21D Stock Stock
9 | 1010014 4.00 4.00 7.76 5.91 7.54 10.01 14.04 8.83 5.81 7.94
unapproved
Rex Sales 230480 - Stock Stock Stock Stock part 45D 21D Stock Stock
6| 810030 1.53 2.38 1.53 4.40 2.63 3.08 2.49
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock part Stock 21D W Stock
5| 810031 1.81 8.06 1.81 8.88 10.11 8.40




Pace RFQ# 420141
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart Rex Sales Kirk's Auto | CBM USA Vehicle E3 Spark Coffman Gillig LLC Mohawk Prevost Muncie The Area Diesel | Hydraulic | Eldorado
Transit Maintenance Plugs Truck Transit Aftermarket Electric National
NO # of Bids Parts
unapproved

Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock part 21D 4W Stock




Pace

RFQ# 420141

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ! ! ! ! . | | | . | [ . | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Neopart Rex Sales Kirk's Auto | CBM USA Vehicle E3 Spark Coffman Gillig LLC Mohawk Prevost Muncie The Area Diesel | Hydraulic | Eldorado
Transit Maintenance Plugs Truck Transit Aftermarket Electric National

NO # of Bids Parts

3| 810034 89.79 89.79 104.42 90.32
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock 21D Stock

3| 810036 34.11 34.11 39.79 60.00
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock 21D 14D

4| 810037 410.01 410.01 479.92 541.90 412.12
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock 21D 6W Stock

7 | 1010015 851.94 1,259.50 1,325.00 862.10 1,070.00 1,700.00 1,659.85 851.94

only 2,

Area Diesel 230485 - Stock Stock Stock Stock need 5 AW Stock

4| 1010016 2,129.69 2,185.65 2,405.00 2,941.77 2,129.69
Area Diesel 230485 - Stock 10D W Stock

2| 810050 101.90 222.21 101.90
Eldorado National 230470 - W AW

2| 810051 113.40 224.08 113.40
Eldorado National 230470 - AW 2W

5| 810062 148.44 235.00 194.65 499.71 148.44 225.00
Area Diesel 230485 - Stock 30D AW Stock 14D

4| 810063 OIR25 181.40 180.35 371.16 91.25

No lead time

Area Diesel 230485 - Stock 21D given Stock

4| 810073 105.12 105.12 124.55 124.48 106.21
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock Stock W Stock

8| 810078 365.00 405.00 386.73 556.84 737.15 450.00 546.13 379.69 365.00
Hydraulic Electric 230486 - Stock Stock 2W 45D 21D Stock Stock 14D

5| 810079 385.00 386.73 455.00 620.30 388.69 385.00
Hydraulic Electric 230486 - Stock 21D 7w Stock 14D

5| 1210038 1,851.97 2,008.58 3,069.39 2,350.75 3,101.04 1,851.97




Pace RFQ# 420141
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart Rex Sales Kirk's Auto | CBM USA Vehicle E3 Spark Coffman Gillig LLC Mohawk Prevost Muncie The Area Diesel | Hydraulic | Eldorado
Transit Maintenance Plugs Truck Transit Aftermarket Electric National
NO # of Bids Parts
Area Diesel ‘ 230485‘ - Stock 2W 21D ow Stock




Pace RFQ# 420141

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

Sku Winning bid | Neopart Rex Sales Kirk's Auto | CBM USA Vehicle E3 Spark Coffman Gillig LLC Mohawk Prevost Muncie The Area Diesel | Hydraulic | Eldorado
Transit Maintenance Plugs Truck Transit Aftermarket Electric National

NO # of Bids Parts

1| 1210043 4.06 4.06
Eldorado National 230470 - Stock

1| 1210051 562.21 562.21
Eldorado National 230470 - 12w

6| 810093 21.79 21.79 23.99 30.34 31.84 35.93 23.95
Vehicle Maintenance | 230467 - Stock Stock Stock 21D Stock Stock

6| 810098 238.36 238.38 289.88 373.94 265.10 279.81 238.36
Area Diesel 230485 Stock Stock 45D Stock Stock Stock

5| 810102 2.92 2.92 3.83 3.40 4.09 3.55
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock 2wW 21D 5W Stock

5| 810125 42.00 90.93 42.00 107.65 108.45 94.71

unapproved

Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock part 21D W Stock

5| 1210071 185.68 186.61 239.93 218.22 251.49 185.68
Area Diesel 230485 - Stock aw 21D 5W Stock

4| 1210078 340.75 368.75 350.00 340.75 556.55
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 - 8w 65D 10w Stock

2| 810169 9.00 9.00 25.49
Eldorado National 230470 - bid 4, need 8 2W

1| 810170 6.51 6.51
Eldorado National 230470 - 2W

5| 810184 58.00 59.75 69.95 78.56 60.92 58.00
Hydraulic Electric 230486 - Stock 21D 4w Stock 14D

4| 810187 7.75 8.04 9.05 10.15 1/
Area Diesel 230485 - Stock 21D 4w Stock

5| 810189 33.86 35.00 33.86 40.55 48.09 36.44




Pace

RFQ# 420141

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart Rex Sales Kirk's Auto | CBM USA Vehicle E3 Spark Coffman Gillig LLC Mohawk Prevost Muncie The Area Diesel | Hydraulic | Eldorado
Transit Maintenance Plugs Truck Transit Aftermarket Electric National
NO # of Bids Parts
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock part 21D Stock Stock
810204 245.69 246.54 287.95 531.51 245.69
Area Diesel 230485 - Stock 21D 5W Stock
810215 21.70 21.70
Eldorado National 230470 - Stock




Pace RFQ# 420141
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid | Neopart Rex Sales Kirk's Auto | CBM USA Vehicle E3 Spark Coffman Gillig LLC Mohawk Prevost Muncie The Area Diesel | Hydraulic | Eldorado
Transit Maintenance Plugs Truck Transit Aftermarket Electric National
NO # of Bids Parts
5| 810230 2.99 3.00 5.38 3.50 3.67 2.99
Area Diesel 230485 - Stock 60D 21D 5W Stock
4 | 1010060 2,160.95 2,172.47 2,490.55 2,917.30 2,160.95
no lead
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock 21D 7W time given
7 | 1010061 844.01 984.40 1,120.00 851.00 947.00 1,001.10 1,883.11 844.01
Area Diesel 230485 - 10D Stock Stock Stock 21D 9w Stock
5| 810240 208.52 208.52 253.68 244.06 274.16 209.69
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock 2W Stock Stock Stock




Pace RFQ# 420141
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- ! ! ! ! . | | | . | [ . | | | | |
Sku Winning bid | Neopart Rex Sales Kirk's Auto | CBM USA Vehicle E3 Spark Coffman Gillig LLC Mohawk Prevost Muncie The Area Diesel | Hydraulic | Eldorado
Transit Maintenance Plugs Truck Transit Aftermarket Electric National
NO # of Bids Parts
4| 810241 3.09 3.09 3.45 4.22 3.24
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock 21D 6W Stock
4| 1010068 445.98 1,047.90 445.98 1,677.08 1,091.56
Muncie Transit 230474 - Stock 30D Stock Stock
6| 810253 529.49 650.00 529.49 727.15 608.25 750.69 539.85
Coffman Truck 230479 - Stock Stock 3w 21D Stock Stock

1310031




