Pace RFQ# 420139

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 1/0 CBM USA | P&G Keene | Neopart | Eldorado |Kirk's Auto| Hydraulic | Prevost Battery Muncie Gillig LLC The Mohawk TP 101 Coffman
Maintenance | Controls Transit National Electric Systems Transit Aftermarket Truck
NO # of Bids Parts
4 71733 77.80 88.84 79.85 90.88 77.80
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 - Stock 30D 5W Stock
1 72125 70.15 70.15
Eldorado National 230470 - 5W
2 72006 21.20 21.20 27.95
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 - 4w 2W
4 72057 3.45 3.45 3.96 7.99 3.57
Vehicle Maintenance | 230467 Stock 30D Stock Stock
3 71178 0.04 0.04 0.11 0.04
Muncie Transit 230474 - Stock Stock Stock
5 72142 9.63 9.63 18.85 9.65 11.69 12.80
Neopart Transit 230469 - Stock 6W Stock 6W Stock
6 72135 57.53 59.38 97.15 72.05 61.10 57.63 57.53
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 - W 6W 60D 45D 6W 2W
4 71807 10.45 10.45 13.29 48.51 33.85
Muncie Transit 230474 - Stock Stock 30D 2W
1 72077 48.55 48.55
Eldorado National 230470 - Stock
5 72055 118.75 151.85 118.75 163.05 135.85 162.52
Eldorado National 230470 Stock Stock 45D 35D Stock




Pace RFQ# 420139

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 1/0 CBM USA | P&G Keene | Neopart | Eldorado |Kirk's Auto| Hydraulic | Prevost Battery Muncie Gillig LLC The Mohawk TP 101 Coffman
Maintenance | Controls Transit National Electric Systems Transit Aftermarket Truck
NO # of Bids Parts
7 72056 10.75 20.80 40.91 34.00 49.47 18.48 10.75 42.27
The Aftermarket unapproved
Parts 230477 Stock Stock 14D 21D W part Stock
5 71442 5.65 26.95 5.65 7.50 8.28 6.88
Muncie Transit 230474 2W Stock Stock Stock 4w
3 70263 8.35 8.35 12.41 10.22
Availability, The unapproved
Aftermarket Parts 230477 30D Stock part
1 72145 8.59 8.59
Eldorado National 230470 - 2W
- 72127 -
3 72162 32.35 32.35 61.73 33.02
Eldorado National 230470 4w 6W 4w
1 72163 431.95 431.95
Eldorado National 230470 - 6W
6 72184 4.58 5.95 11.83 9.10 5.52 10.43 4.58
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 - Stock Stock Stock Stock 14W Stock
1 72203 32.35 32.35
Eldorado National 230470 - 8W
1 72204 18.85 18.85
Eldorado National 230470 - Stock
4 72216 150.90 291.55 210.00 155.50 150.90
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 - Stock Stock Stock Stock
4 72225 1,425.00 1,475.00 1,425.00 2,076.34 2,239.87
Kirk's Auto 230472 - Stock Stock 30D Stock




Pace RFQ# 420139
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 1/0 CBM USA | P&G Keene | Neopart | Eldorado |Kirk's Auto| Hydraulic | Prevost Battery Muncie Gillig LLC The Mohawk TP 101 Coffman
Maintenance | Controls Transit National Electric Systems Transit Aftermarket Truck

NO # of Bids Parts

72255 11.58 16.15 13.05 18.86 11.58
Mohawk 230478 - Stock Stock Stock Stock




Pace RFQ# 420139
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . | ' ' [ | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 1/0 CBM USA | P&G Keene | Neopart | Eldorado |Kirk's Auto| Hydraulic | Prevost Battery Muncie Gillig LLC The Mohawk TP 101 Coffman
Maintenance | Controls Transit National Electric Systems Transit Aftermarket Truck
NO # of Bids Parts
72259 5.53 13.99 8.00 5.82 22.30 9.89 5.53
Mohawk 230478 - 4w 14D Stock 4w Stock Stock
72291 1.90 2.12 1.90 2.47
Muncie Transit 230474 - 60D Stock 5W
72295 28.72 32.35 42.60 28.72 45.38 32.60
Muncie Transit 230474 - AW 60D 30D Stock 5W
72301 240.00 240.00
Battery Systems 230473 - Stock
72304 0.68 0.78 0.68
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 - 2W Stock
72366 237.55 237.55
Eldorado National 230470 - 6W
72384 7.05 11.37 20.42 14.88 7.05 9.71 7.34
Gillig LLC 230475 - 2W Stock Stock Stock Stock Stock
72388 36.75 63.73 63.00 78.80 64.99 39.50 52.37 36.75
Mohawk 230478 - 7W 6W 60D 42D Stock Stock Stock
710004 21.55 21.55
Eldorado National 230470 - 4w
710030 =
710039 34.94 35.00 34.94
The Aftermarket no lead
Parts 230477 - time given Stock
710052 2,201.63 2,201.63 3,946.00 | 2,636.76 2,481.89
P&G Keene 230468 - Stock 6W Stock 60D




Pace

RFQ# 420139

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 1/0 CBM USA | P&G Keene | Neopart | Eldorado |Kirk's Auto| Hydraulic | Prevost Battery Muncie Gillig LLC The Mohawk TP 101 Coffman
Maintenance | Controls Transit National Electric Systems Transit Aftermarket Truck
NO # of Bids Parts
3 71115 31.50 31.50 45.00 44.88
Vehicle Maintenance | 230467 - Stock 14D oW




Pace RFQ# 420139

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . | ' ' [ | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle 1/0 CBM USA | P&G Keene | Neopart | Eldorado |Kirk's Auto| Hydraulic | Prevost Battery Muncie Gillig LLC The Mohawk TP 101 Coffman
Maintenance | Controls Transit National Electric Systems Transit Aftermarket Truck
NO # of Bids Parts
4 | 710116 31.50 31.50 48.84 45.00 35.53
Vehicle Maintenance | 230467 - Stock 4w 14D 5W
6 | 710120 373.70 373.70 472.00 521.24 415.50 392.97 446.47
P&G Keene 230468 - Stock Stock 60D 30D 4W Stock
1 710140 40.75 40.75
Eldorado National 230470 - AW
1 710157 33.20 33.20
Eldorado National 230470 AW
4 | 710176 38.49 110.25 38.49 145.84 100.87
Eldorado National 230470 - 8w 2W 90D 1w
3| 710180 3.65 9.34 3.65 6.54
The Aftermarket 12 min,
Parts 230477 - 2W need 6 Stock
3| 710213 1,704.08 1,718.88 3,281.65 1,704.08
Coffman Truck 230479 - 60D 5W 7D
1 71278 1,220.99 1,220.99
Eldorado National 230470 - 6W
4 | 710291 61.20 61.20 153.22 136.76 184.37
Eldorado National 230470 - 4W 90D 6W 11W
1] 710299 3,280.00 3,280.00
Eldorado National 230470 - 8w
1] 710303 281.69 281.69
The Aftermarket
Parts 230477 - 8W




