Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420123
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . J ! ! | ' . '/ | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rex Sales | Coffman | Eldorado | Hydraulic | Suburban CBM USA Neopart | GilligLLC | MW Bus | Area Diesel | Kirk's Auto | Transit Prevost The Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance Truck Electric Truck Transit Parts 101 Aftermarket Transit

NO # of Bids Parts

4 81092 49.35 131.40 156.48 49.35 147.07
Mohawk 230438 - Stock Stock Stock Stock

4| 130473 0.07 0.19 0.09 0.07 0.07
Mohawk 230438 - Stock Stock Stock Stock

4 81050 450.00 450.00 765.91 938.71 542.18
Hydraulic Electric 230441 - 14D 5w 45D 30D

4 81142 12.48 49.98 20.04 12.48 38.99
Mohawk 230438 45D Stock Stock 30D

8| 140057 19.85 46.56 19.85 38.32 55.34 44.68 45.73 21.37 37.57
CBM USA 230442 - Stock Stock Stock Stock stock stock Stock Stock

6 81061 33.36 85.70 85.24 134.48 112.50 33.36 99.19
Mohawk 230438 - Stock Stock 35D Stock Stock 21D

3| 110100 2.87 3.04 2.87 3.49
The Aftermarket
Parts 230435 - Stock Stock Stock

7| 130618 228.35 228.35 283.96 238.51 395.42 335.17 252.70 250.00
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock 5W Stock stock Stock 3w Stock

1 81285 1,295.95 1,295.95
Eldorado 230430 - Stock

5| 120335 8.98 10.09 16.18 14.17 17.96 8.98
Muncie Transit 230436 Stock Stock 7w 21D 30D




Pace RFQi# 420121 RFQ# 420123
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rex Sales | Coffman | Eldorado | Hydraulic | Suburban CBM USA Neopart | GilligLLC | MW Bus | Area Diesel | Kirk's Auto | Transit Prevost The Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance Truck Electric Truck Transit Parts 101 Aftermarket Transit
NO # of Bids Parts
4 81342 9.32 9.32 11.00 12.97 10.25
Coffman Truck 230440 Stock Stock 30D 21D
7 81352 72.34 104.30 128.70 103.76 183.99 146.81 72.34 120.72
unapproved
Area Diesel 230433 Stock Stock Stock stock W part stock
2| 100225 175.39 205.15 175.39
The Aftermarket
Parts 230435 6W 7W
5 81367 1.70 1.70 2.02 2.37 1.72 1.97
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock Stock Stock 6W 21D
3| 120535 243.32 270.36 297.02 243.32
Muncie Transit 230436 aw 11w stock
6 81503 11.50 19.26 22.73 23.98 23.07 11.50 22.50
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230440 Stock Stock 20D Stock part stock
5 81507 2.77 5.08 5.11 6.82 2.77 5.70
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock Stock 7W part 21D
3 110150 20.28 20.28 23.95 22.32
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock 21D
4 81515 7.35 7.35 8.68 9.65 8.60
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock 6W 21D
7 81533 11.19 41.55 12.89 49.05 76.10 28.31 11.19 11.50
Unapproved
Mohawk 230438 - Stock part stock Stock 13w Stock stock
3 81534 31.70 57.21 34.10 31.70
Muncie Transit 230436 - 2W 6W 21D
4| 1310001 815.00 815.00 1,074.52 1,436.03 998.63
MW Bus 230444 - 7D 30D Stock 2W
6 | 1010002 3.75 7.51 11.00 6.75 5.59 3.75 5.60




Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420123
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rex Sales | Coffman | Eldorado | Hydraulic | Suburban CBM USA Neopart | GilligLLC | MW Bus | Area Diesel | Kirk's Auto | Transit Prevost The Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance Truck Electric Truck Transit Parts 101 Aftermarket Transit

NO # of Bids Parts
The Aftermarket
Parts 230435 - Stock 14D stock stock Stock 21D




Pace RFQi# 420121 RFQ# 420123
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rex Sales | Coffman | Eldorado | Hydraulic | Suburban CBM USA Neopart | GilligLLC | MW Bus | Area Diesel | Kirk's Auto | Transit Prevost The Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance Truck Electric Truck Transit Parts 101 Aftermarket Transit
NO # of Bids Parts
1010005 279.18 279.18
Eldorado 230430 - Stock
1210011 78.88 151.15 155.61 78.88
The Aftermarket
Parts 230435 - 2W 5W stock
1010011 824.58 1,375.00 824.58 1,252.80 827.03 1,961.50 1,145.00 965.96
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock Stock 10D stock 5W Stock 21D
1010012 1,289.86 1,550.00 1,422.36 1,766.31 2,710.43 1,289.86 2,049.00
Mohawk 230438 - Stock 10D stock 5W Stock 21D
810026 889.06 909.77 889.06 1,139.85 1,092.21 1,049.00
1 only, need
Area Diesel 230433 - Stock stock 4W 30D 7
810027 496.98 499.52 496.98 610.22 597.00
Area Diesel 230433 - Stock stock oW 21D
810028 64.13 134.95 64.13 86.34 107.00
Gillig LLC 230437 - AW Stock stock 45D
810030 1.53 2.38 2.82 4.40 3.10 1.53 2.63
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock stock 10W part 21D
810031 1.81 8.06 9.52 14.44 10.17 1.81 8.88
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230440 - 7D stock stock 4w part 21D
810045 360.00 360.98 360.00 363.20 518.91 420.00
Neopart Transit 230443 - Stock Stock stock stock 21D




Pace

RFQ# 420121

RFQ# 420123

WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
-/ . ¢! [/ ! ' | ./ '/ | | | [ | | . | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rex Sales | Coffman | Eldorado | Hydraulic | Suburban CBM USA Neopart | GilligLLC | MW Bus | Area Diesel | Kirk's Auto | Transit Prevost The Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance Truck Electric Truck Transit Parts 101 Aftermarket Transit
NO # of Bids Parts
6| 810046 369.72 378.58 369.72 380.91 695.42 578.20 440.00
Neopart Transit 230443 - Stock Stock stock stock stock 21D
3| 810050 122.44 122.44 126.85 224.98
Eldorado 230430 - 4W 3w 7W
3| 810051 126.38 126.38 126.79 226.23
Eldorado 230430 - 4w 3w 4W
5| 810060 33.80 35.55 35.96 42.93 33.80 39.39
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230440 Stock stock stock part 21D
1| 1310009 63.70 63.70
Eldorado 230430 - Stock
6| 810065 9.66 44.82 45.09 80.95 57.45 9.66 49.95
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock 45D stock part 21D
7| 810078 90.45 386.73 400.00 390.69 700.29 546.13 90.45 450.05
unapproved
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock 14D stock stock 5W part 21D
5| 810084 641.69 740.38 650.00 641.69 1,320.13 818.08
Area Diesel 230433 - Stock Stock stock 6W 21D
4| 810086 71.69 72.85 71.69 104.73 85.37
Area Diesel 230433 - Stock stock stock 21D
6 | 1010032 90.00 106.32 90.00 108.08 189.80 126.46 124.96
Hydraulic Electric 230441 - Stock 14D stock 20D 6W 21D
5| 1010035 88.92 88.92 89.50 94.93 131.33 105.56
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock 25D 5W 21D
5| 1010036 88.92 88.92 89.44 154.15 131.33 105.56
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock 25D 5W 21D
6| 810110 249.00 249.00 249.49 542.63 1,072.60 476.65 378.87




Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQit 420123
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . J ! ! | ' . '/ | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rex Sales | Coffman | Eldorado | Hydraulic | Suburban CBM USA Neopart | GilligLLC | MW Bus | Area Diesel | Kirk's Auto | Transit Prevost The Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance Truck Electric Truck Transit Parts 101 Aftermarket Transit
NO # of Bids Parts
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock stock 8W 3w 21D
6| 810123 53.49 53.49 53.79 82.94 73.94 65.90 62.61
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock 20D stock 3w stock
1| 1110002 41.51 41.51
Eldorado 230430 - 4W




Pace RFQi# 420121 RFQ# 420123
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rex Sales | Coffman | Eldorado | Hydraulic | Suburban CBM USA Neopart | GilligLLC | MW Bus | Area Diesel | Kirk's Auto | Transit Prevost The Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance Truck Electric Truck Transit Parts 101 Aftermarket Transit
NO # of Bids Parts
4| 810130 378.58 378.58 381.95 586.50 443.77
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock 5W 21D
5| 1010042 339.31 344.53 339.31 630.06 528.13 696.01
Area Diesel 230433 - Stock stock stock ow 21D
7 | 1210070 46.57 53.47 46.57 62.45 50.75 73.20 51.97 57.57
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock Stock stock stock stock 30D stock
6| 810141 33.75 59.00 44.00 60.00 85.70 33.75 69.90
unapproved
Hydraulic Electric 230441 - Stock 14D stock stock part stock




Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420123
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . J ! ! | ' . '/ | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rex Sales | Coffman | Eldorado | Hydraulic | Suburban CBM USA Neopart | GilligLLC | MW Bus | Area Diesel | Kirk's Auto | Transit Prevost The Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance Truck Electric Truck Transit Parts 101 Aftermarket Transit

NO # of Bids Parts

1| 1210074 156.55 156.55
Eldorado 230430 - ow

4| 1210078 340.75 567.68 368.75 340.75 352.03
The Aftermarket
Parts 230435 - Stock 8w now 63D

4| 810157 56.48 56.48 56.82 74.14 66.10
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock Stock 5W 21D

1| 810165 1,092.00 1,092.00
Eldorado 230430 - Stock

2| 810169 9.00 25.49 9.00
The Aftermarket
Parts 230435 - 4W stock

1| 810170 6.51 6.51
Eldorado 230430 - 2W

6| 810174 2.70 2.70 3.17 5.03 3.61 4.27 3.09
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock Stock Stock 30D 21D

4| 810176 380.00 386.73 380.00 612.73 466.00
Hydraulic Electric 230441 - Stock 14D Stock 21D

4| 810224 182.70 182.70 216.23 244.98 213.96
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock W 21D

1| 810226 25.90 25.90
Eldorado 230430 - 4w

5| 1210109 451.35 451.35 460.00 534.27 553.92 528.88
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock 14D stock 5W 21D

4| 1210121 5.25 6.74 5.25 6.93 6.98
Area Diesel 230433 - Stock stock oW 21D

6| 810280 949.33 1,379.48 949.33 1,221.72 1,212.63 995.00 974.99




Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQit 420123
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL
0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0
- . J ! ! | ' . '/ | | | | | | | | | |
Sku Winning bid Vehicle Rex Sales | Coffman | Eldorado | Hydraulic | Suburban CBM USA Neopart | GilligLLC | MW Bus | Area Diesel | Kirk's Auto | Transit Prevost The Mohawk Muncie
Maintenance Truck Electric Truck Transit Parts 101 Aftermarket Transit
NO # of Bids Parts
Gillig LLC 230437 - Stock 4w 60D Stock 60D stock
121022 7.80 7.80 8.84 9.07
Coffman Truck 230440 - Stock stock 21D
810281 2.75 2.75
Gillig LLC 230437 - 1w




