
WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls

Coffman 

Truck

Eldorado 

National

Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Suburban 

Truck 

Kirk's Auto Area 

Diesel 

Battery 

Service

Prevost The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Gillig LLC Mohawk Battery 

Systems

                                    1 72125 70.15                    70.15 

Eldorado National 230430 -                  4W 

                                    6 71875 4.23                       16.15            4.23           7.31                5.38             4.63                 5.15 

Availability - Mohawk 230438 -                  Stock 

 only 1, 

need 4  60D  Stock  30D  Stock 

                                    4 71101 0.21                         0.26                0.27             0.22                 0.21 

Mohawk 230438 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

                                    6 71441 6.38                       26.95           8.69                8.22             6.38             6.99                 6.88 

Muncie Transit 230436  Stock  Stock  5W  Stock  Stock  Stock 

                                    4 71102 0.38                         1.54                0.71             0.68                 0.38 

Mohawk 230438 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

                                    6 72059 401.34                629.95       626.25           591.57        401.34        410.00            491.08 

Muncie Transit 230436 -                  4W  35D  5W  Stock  4W  4W 

                                    6 72143 10.35                    21.55           10.62         12.88              10.47           11.00           10.35 

Gillig LLC 230437 -                  Stock  7W 45D  5W  30D  Stock 

                                    6 72096 188.93                 188.93       236.95       268.83           216.41        216.17        197.33 

P&G Keene 230431 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  30D  Stock 

                                    4 71357 9.29                       15.07         15.10                9.29              11.40 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  Stock  45D  5W  2W 

                                    4 71697 5.40                       13.08              16.90           11.55                 5.40 

Muncie Transit 230436  25D  Stock  Stock  Stock 

Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420121



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls

Coffman 

Truck

Eldorado 

National

Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Suburban 

Truck 

Kirk's Auto Area 

Diesel 

Battery 

Service

Prevost The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Gillig LLC Mohawk Battery 

Systems

Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420121

                                    1 71539 32.35                    32.35 

Eldorado National 230430  4W 

                                    1 72043 7.32                         7.32 

Prevost 230434  Stock 

                                    3 71903 95.40                  156.76              95.40        126.62 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435  60D  Stock  Stock 

                                    6 70706 10.25                    26.95         27.10              25.48           16.55           14.36              10.25 

Mohawk 230438 -                  4W  Stock  Stock  30D  Stock  Stock 

                                    4 71389 13.30                    91.75           28.45           34.25              13.30 

Mohawk 230438  Stock  Stock  2W  Stock 

                                    3 72055 118.75                118.75       163.05           166.86 

Eldorado National 230430  Stock  45D  Stock 

                                    3 71442 6.88                       26.95                8.87                 6.88 

Mohawk 230438 -                  Stock  Stock  2W 

                                    4 71800 5.30                       16.95              21.89           13.35                 5.30 

Mohawk 230438 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

                                    4 70211 4.56                       37.75              11.68           18.70                 4.56 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock 

 unapproved 

part 

                                    5 71533 6.60                       22.28              23.06           13.70           17.31                 6.60 

Mohawk 230438 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

                                    4 71434 56.65                  116.00         83.97        133.59           56.65 

Battery Systems 230439 -                  Stock  3D  30D  Stock 

                                    6 72109 620.84            1,083.82       620.84   1,433.63        1,289.37     1,217.75     1,200.00 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls

Coffman 

Truck

Eldorado 

National

Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Suburban 

Truck 

Kirk's Auto Area 

Diesel 

Battery 

Service

Prevost The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Gillig LLC Mohawk Battery 

Systems

Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420121

Eldorado National 230430 -                  8W  4W  85D  10W  90D  4W 

                                    1 72144 26.95                    26.95 

Eldorado National 230430 -                  Stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls

Coffman 

Truck

Eldorado 

National

Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Suburban 

Truck 

Kirk's Auto Area 

Diesel 

Battery 

Service

Prevost The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Gillig LLC Mohawk Battery 

Systems

Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420121

                                    6 72148 89.04                  292.42       192.64           143.56        159.45        122.37              89.04 

Mohawk 230438 -                  Stock  110D  Stock  50D  Stock  Stock 

                                    5 72156 21.66                      21.79         26.45              21.66           22.72           23.22 

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  Stock  45D  Stock  45D  6W 

                                    3 72171 18.85                    18.85         29.36              39.10 

Eldorado National 203430 -                  Stock  45D  10W 

                                    1 72185 9.67                         9.67 

Eldorado National 230430 -                  Stock 

                                    4 72216 150.90                291.55       210.00           150.90        155.50 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

                                    5 72238 1,417.45         1,736.50   1,417.45        2,229.87     1,886.50     1,578.64 

Eldorado National 230430 -                  8W  4W  14W  60D  8W 

                                    1 72239 26.95                    26.95 

Eldorado National 230430 -                  4W 

                                    4 72291 1.90                          2.19            1.91           2.12             1.90 

Muncie Transit 230436 -                  Stock  Stock  65D  Stock 

                                    5 72296 31.22                    32.35         42.60              46.58           31.23              31.22 

Mohawk 230438 -                  Stock  40D  Stock  30D  4W 

                                    2 72301 240.00                264.00         240.00 

Battery Systems 230439 -                  2W  Stock 

                                    6 72384 7.05                       11.37         20.42              10.01           15.22             7.05                 7.18 

Gillig LLC 230437 -                  4W  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock  Stock 

                                    7 72388 36.75                    63.00           63.73         78.80              52.37           64.99           39.99              36.75 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls

Coffman 

Truck

Eldorado 

National

Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Suburban 

Truck 

Kirk's Auto Area 

Diesel 

Battery 

Service

Prevost The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Gillig LLC Mohawk Battery 

Systems

Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420121

Mohawk 230438 -                  4W  7W  Stock  Stock  42D  Stock  Stock 

                                    1 710006 18.59                         18.59 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  Stock 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls

Coffman 

Truck

Eldorado 

National

Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Suburban 

Truck 

Kirk's Auto Area 

Diesel 

Battery 

Service

Prevost The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Gillig LLC Mohawk Battery 

Systems

Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420121

                                    1 710013 6.97                         6.97 

Eldorado National 230430 -                  Stock 

                                     - 710030 -                 

-                 

                                    1 710032 157.81                    157.81 

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  Stock 

                                    7 710046 29.68                    37.75         29.68         31.47              36.03           29.98           43.75              33.70 

Suburban Truck Parts 230432  Stock  Stock  65D  9W  30D  4W 

 no lead time 

given 

                                    2 710115 44.88                    48.84              44.88 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  4W  9W 

                                    6 710120 373.70                 373.70       472.59       521.24           451.66        409.40        392.97 

P&G Keene 230431 -                  Stock  Stock  50D  Stock  30D  Stock 

                                    5 710166 227.72                 228.91       227.72       392.54           300.51            290.70 

Area Diesel 230433 -                  Stock  Stock  25D  5W  5W 

                                    5 710168 442.90                505.00       564.71           539.51        491.68        442.90 

Gillig LLC 230437 -                  Stock  15D  7W  35D  4W 

                                    6 710170 2,623.67          2,623.67    3,070.44   3,816.82        3,577.73     3,323.23     3,125.00 

P&G Keene 230431 -                  Stock  Stock  20D  10W  30D  4W 

                                    2 710177 7.61                              8.69             7.61 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  15W 

 min 12, 

need 2 

                                    3 710180 3.74                         9.34                6.54             3.74 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  4W  12W 

 12 min, 

need 10 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls

Coffman 

Truck

Eldorado 

National

Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Suburban 

Truck 

Kirk's Auto Area 

Diesel 

Battery 

Service

Prevost The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Gillig LLC Mohawk Battery 

Systems

Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420121

                                    1 710186 65.21                    65.21 

Eldorado National 230430 -                  4W 

                                    3 710193 33.99                  165.31              33.99           60.81 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  Stock  7W  Stock 

                                    4 710213 2,204.08          2,204.08        3,186.71     2,548.00         2,843.81 

Muncie Transit 230436 -                 

 no lead 

time given  5W  45D  5W 

                                    1 710215 170.90                    170.90 

The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  7W 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls

Coffman 

Truck

Eldorado 

National

Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Suburban 

Truck 

Kirk's Auto Area 

Diesel 

Battery 

Service

Prevost The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Gillig LLC Mohawk Battery 

Systems

Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420121

                                    6 710218 460.05                642.86       515.00           460.05        576.21        463.50            510.00 
The Aftermarket 

Parts 230435 -                  24W  Stock  Stock  21D  4W  3W 

                                    3 710260 395.04               395.04           545.16        450.00 

I/O Controls 230428 -                  8W  10W  4W 

                                    1 710275 0.25                         0.25 

Eldorado National 230430 -                  1W 

                                     - 710303 -                 

-                 



WHITE=NO BID TOTAL

0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

Green=Disqualified

NO # of Bids

Sku Winning bid I/O 

Controls

Coffman 

Truck

Eldorado 

National

Neopart 

Transit

P&G Keene Suburban 

Truck 

Kirk's Auto Area 

Diesel 

Battery 

Service

Prevost The 

Aftermarket 

Parts

Muncie 

Transit

Gillig LLC Mohawk Battery 

Systems

Pace RFQ# 420121 RFQ# 420121

                                    1 710308 11.72                    11.72 

Eldorado National 230430 -                  4W 


