
IFB No: Bid Opening Time Bid Opening Date

Bidder Name(s)

Line Qty Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

1 36 no bid no bid 1463616.00 1,463,616.00$    no bid no bid

2 33 no bid no bid 1966734.00 1,966,734.00$    no bid no bid

3 36 813371.04 813,371.04$       no bid no bid no bid no bid

4 33 873823.83 873,823.83$       no bid no bid no bid no bid

5 36 no bid no bid 2542140.00 2,542,140.00$    2700000 2,700,000.00$   

6 33 no bid no bid 2330295.00 2,330,295.00$    2310000 2,310,000.00$   

7 -$                    -$                    -$                   

8 -$                    -$                    -$                   

9 -$                    -$                    -$                   

10 -$                    -$                    -$                   

1,687,194.87$    8,302,785.00$    5,010,000.00$   Total Bid Amount

Interstate Power Systems Cummins, Inc. Chandler Services, Inc.

Group A - Sku 0810242 - New Engine ISL

Group B - Sku 1310002 - New Trans B300R

Group B - Sku 1310017 - New Trans B400R

Group C - Removal - 30ft

Group C - Removal - 40ft

Item Description

Group A - Sku 0810016 - New Engine ISB6

Bid Tabulation

419724 2:00 PM

Bid Solicitation Date

5/28/2020

NOTE:  Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening 
and reading of bids.  Award information announcing the lowest responsive and 
responsible bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page 
after determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).  
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