

	Pace		RFQ# 424843																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	P&G	Interstate Power	Cummins	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Triangle Radiator	Muncie	A&A Auto	Coffman	Neopart	Crossline Supply	CBM	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Eldorado	Mohawk
3	70629	0.85											]				1.18		1.17	0.85
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-															stk		4w	unapproved part
2	160392	6.93													6.93		14.67			
Gillig	237655	-													stk		stk			
5	60734	3.05				4.31			3.55					24.05	3.05	6.10				
Gillig	237655	-				stk			30d					10w	stk	stk				
6	72079	405.00	406.39												405.00	406.39	548.87		447.03	517.48
Gillig	237655		stk												stk	stk	stk		4w	4w
4	40932	1.21							2.69			2.26					3.55			1.21
Mohawk	237663	-						stk				3w					stk			stk
6	151458	234.13							245.11			354.82		363.70	234.13		314.14		244.55	
Gillig	237655	-						stk				6w		2w	stk		stk		8w	
4	290523	31.46							39.37			31.46			37.36		43.17			
Neopart	237652	-						stk				6w			stk		stk			
5	200522	25.85							25.99			62.02		35.42			70.89			25.85
Mohawk	237663	-						stk				4w		2w			5w			stk
5	40109	1.30							4.58			3.73			4.38		1.44			1.30
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-						stk				3w			stk		stk			unapproved part
7	130581	68.59		83.13							68.59			128.26	82.91		102.02	70.43		75.09
Coffman	237651			stock							stk			10w	stk		7w	2w		stk
6	290028	27.52							28.59			38.32				45.30	32.07		27.52	27.76
Eldorado	237659								21d			4w				stk	stk		8w	stk
5	151457	234.13							241.75			354.82			234.13		314.14		240.82	
Gillig	237655								stk			6w			stk		6w		10w	
9	40953	14.40				14.70			15.98		39.89	37.28		14.40	14.75	17.16	27.99			35.71
CBM	237654					stk			stk		stk	3w		stk	stk	stk	stk			stk
2	290289	15.50							38.28								15.50			

	Pace		RFQ# 424843																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	P&G	Interstate Power	Cummins	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Triangle Radiator	Muncie	A&A Auto	Coffman	Neopart	Crossline Supply	CBM	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Eldorado	Mohawk
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-							21d								stk			
11	81262	6.86		8.41		7.77	7.55		7.46	6.86	8.70	11.94			16.65	11.00	14.23			8.80
A&A Auto	237650			2w		stk	stk		stk	1w	stk	4w			stk	stk	stk			stk
1	110135	55.27																	55.27	
Eldorado	237659																		10w	
10	120488	21.20		22.54		21.79	22.12		22.92	21.20	24.10					32.00	30.91	23.67		22.13
A&A Auto	237650	-		stk		stk	stk		stk	1w	stk					stk	33w	2w		unapproved part
4	210611	265.25							606.36			507.72					265.25			419.02
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-							21d			3w					stk			unapproved part
9	200863	10.42		11.72		10.48	10.58		12.39	10.42	11.56	16.65					18.35			22.57
A&A Auto	237650	-		2w		stk	stk		30d	1w	stk	4w					10w			4w
4	220342	188.84							250.00								262.99	188.84	280.65	
Midwest Transit	237658	-							21d								27w	14w	stk	
6	40165	11.91							13.99			11.94			11.91	14.80	16.19			48.95
Gillig	237655	-							45d			3w			stk	stk	5w			4w
7	40052	29.23				29.23			42.09	61.00					50.82	42.90	58.44			42.49
Vehicle Maintenance	237648	-				stk			stk	2w					stk	stk	14w			unapproved part
5	110085	16.68			151.11				179.97		149.88						33.88			16.68
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-			stk				30d		stk						4w			unapproved part
3	160615	132.74							132.74						136.73		166.96			
Muncie	237649	-							30d						stk		stk			
5	40079	20.11							24.76			20.94			20.25		28.39			20.11
Mohawk	237663	-							stk			3w			stk		stk			stk
4	41205	1.12							1.36			1.12					1.87			1.39
Neopart	237652	-							30d			3w					5w			unapproved part
5	70706	8.18							47.31						27.01		43.35		41.76	8.18
Gillig	237655	-							stk						stk		stk		stk	unapproved part

	Pace		RFQ# 424843																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	P&G	Interstate Power	Cummins	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Triangle Radiator	Muncie	A&A Auto	Coffman	Neopart	Crossline Supply	CBM	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Eldorado	Mohawk
	8	110136	98.87	118.45		98.88			127.78	98.87							208.75	114.38	158.70	110.25
A&A Auto		237650	-	2w		syk			30d	2w							16w	2w	12w	unapproved part
	4	71442	7.28						8.83								12.99		12.37	7.28
Muncie		237649	-						stk								7w		5w	unapproved part
	4	200506	1.01		3.99						3.91						5.82			1.01
Coffman		237651	-		stk						stk						stk			unapproved part
	5	10001	0.35						1.46			1.22			1.59		1.63			0.35
Mohawk		237663	-						stk			3w			stk		stk			stk
	5	40162	0.60						1.51			1.31			1.64		1.68			0.60
Mohawk		237663	-						stk			3w			stk		4w			stk
	5	40090	1.02						2.02			1.02			1.35		1.29			1.28
Neopart		237652	-						stk			3w			stk		stk			stk
	4	80623	51.76						51.91						51.76		77.63			53.76
Gillig		237655	-						stk						stk		8w			unapproved part
	6	40134	37.05						111.08	94.39				37.05	76.72		105.66			106.70
CBM		237654	-						stk	2w				stk	stk		18w			stk
	5	200751	199.03						233.82			212.31			225.04		296.83	199.03		
Midwest Transit		237658	-						30d			4w			8w		5w	4w		
	4	60748	40.78						62.62								73.44		40.78	123.10
Eldorado		237659	-						stk								stk		5w	4w
	4	72167	35.27						49.49			44.55			35.27		51.32			
Gillig		237655	-						75d			10w			12w		13w			
	1	30411	393.75																393.75	
Eldorado		237659	-																stk	
	4	151975	1,378.77						1,381.75			2,136.58					1,605.42		1,378.77	
Eldorado		237659	-						45d			6w					7w		8w	
	3	200919	25.00						26.39								30.96		25.00	

	Pace		RFQ# 424843																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	P&G	Interstate Power	Cummins	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Triangle Radiator	Muncie	A&A Auto	Coffman	Neopart	Crossline Supply	CBM	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Eldorado	Mohawk
Eldorado	237659	-							30d								32w		4w	
3	72181	1,021.77													1,075.00		1,492.39		1,021.77	
Eldorado	237659	-													8w		17w		14w	
4	211036	844.14							964.37			844.14					915.23			1,100.60
Neopart	237652	-							21d			4w					10w			4w
1	60755	44.32																	44.32	
Eldorado	237659	-																	stk	
5	81376	2.19			2.22				2.72		2.19						3.25			3.59
Coffman	237651	-			stk				30d		stk						5w			4w
6	41273	42.60					47.75		52.92			42.60					59.68		53.39	53.74
Neopart	237652	-					stk		30d			6w					8w		3w	unapproved part
5	290673	1,487.00							1,642.42			1,525.95			1,599.45		1,880.81		1,487.00	
Eldorado	237659	-							30d			4w			8w		7w		6w	
1	10417	300.53																	300.53	
Eldorado	237659	-																	12w	
1	10420	5.07																	5.07	
Eldorado	237659	-																	stk	
3	81431	1,259.00									1,272.58		1,259.00				1,775.23			
Crossline Supply	237653	-									stk		stk				9w			
1	60792	308.33																	308.33	
Eldorado	237659	-																	8w	
4	72255	10.00							59.47								56.66		38.66	10.00
Eldorado	237659	-							165d								stk		10w	unapproved part
6	81441	34.35			96.69						94.98		93.00				141.18		105.91	34.35
Crossline Supply	237653	-			stk						stk		stk				1w		4w	unapproved part
2	180833	142.24													142.24		182.17			
Gillig	237655	-													12w		20w			

	Pace		RFQ# 424843																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	P&G	Interstate Power	Cummins	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Triangle Radiator	Muncie	A&A Auto	Coffman	Neopart	Crossline Supply	CBM	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Eldorado	Mohawk
3	72301	379.00														379.00	697.48		414.00	
Kirks	237656	-														stk	9w		4w	
8	81519	56.17				133.35			97.66		113.19			84.98		81.00	56.17	114.98		124.48
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-				stk			stk		stk			stk		stk	stk	2w		stk
3	170716	1,291.01							1,373.43						1,309.03				1,291.01	
Eldorado	237659	-							30d						8w				8w	
4	220419	3.80							4.15								3.80	4.28	3.93	
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-							67d								stk	6w	4w	
3	290701	211.05							216.06								263.38		211.05	
Eldorado	237659	-							stk								4w		stk	
5	410000	190.72							213.71			197.04					244.68		190.72	209.80
Eldorado	237659	-							30d			6w					10w		8w	6w
6	410001	1,200.00				1,493.10	1,561.22					1,200.00					1,311.36		1,449.08	1,738.90
Neopart	237652	-				stk	stk					3w					stk		4w	unapproved part
6	410002	1,182.78				1,493.10	1,561.22					1,200.00					1,311.36		1,449.08	1,182.78
Neopart	237652	-				stk	stk					3w					stk		4w	unapproved part
8	410006	122.74					327.33		259.14			214.97			215.00	169.00	281.52		274.49	122.74
Kirks	237656	-					stk		stk			3w			stk	stk	stk		4w	unapproved part
5	110005	433.75					487.71		545.85			433.75			435.70		568.23			
Neopart	237652	-					stk		90d			3w			stk		20w			
7	1210003	25.75				32.92			31.81		26.34			51.34			42.42	25.87		25.75
Mohawk	237663	-				stk			30d		stk			10w			stk	2w		stk
2	810007	372.66															723.14		372.66	
Eldorado	237659	-															stk		6w	
5	610018	17.65			70.85				84.23		70.20						103.44			17.65
Coffman	237651	-			stk				30d		stk						stk			unapproved part
6	1010011	990.00			2,013.18				2,369.18		1,977.48					990.00	2,939.44			1,211.93

	Pace		RFQ# 424843																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	P&G	Interstate Power	Cummins	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Triangle Radiator	Muncie	A&A Auto	Coffman	Neopart	Crossline Supply	CBM	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Eldorado	Mohawk
Kirks	237656	-			stk				30d		stk					stk	9w			unapproved part
	1010012	1,225.00														1,225.00	5,226.23			1,460.32
Kirks	237656	-														stk	9w			unapproved part
5	2110021	612.22							687.87			612.22			636.58		654.55			770.67
Neopart	237652	-							21d			3w			6w		stk			unapproved part
2	1010016	3,293.50									3,293.50						5,535.85			
Coffman	237651	-									stk						9w			
4	2110027	3.54							5.17			4.11					4.91			3.54
Mohawk	237663	-							MOQ 50, need 10			4w					11w			stk
4	610033	470.60									1,064.65	470.60				598.75	987.72			
Neopart	237652	-									stk	4w				stk	20w			
1	710072	372.66																	372.66	
Eldorado	237659	-																	6w	
2	610036	3,558.27						4,279.00											3,558.27	
Eldorado	237659	-						2w											22w	
1	210013	286.52																	286.52	
Eldorado	237659	-																	10w	
2	1510062	88.15										88.15					158.28			
Neopart	237652	-										4w					6w			
2	810064	7,145.26									7,145.26						8,756.99			
Coffman	237651	-									stk						9w			
1	410070	136.15																	136.15	
Eldorado	237659	-																	10w	
3	2010041	3,659.00									3,897.09		3,659.00				5,775.49			
Crossline Supply	237653	-									90d		stk				9w			
5	1210039	1.83			1.86				2.22		1.83						2.72			2.32
Coffman	237651	-			stk				30d		stk						stk			3w

RFQ# 424843

[illegible]

	Pace		RFQ# 424843																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	P&G	Interstate Power	Cummins	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Triangle Radiator	Muncie	A&A Auto	Coffman	Neopart	Crossline Supply	CBM	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Eldorado	Mohawk
Eldorado	237659	-																	10w	
2	1210078	1,091.85															1,091.85		1,104.29	
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-															stk		12w	
4	2510070	5.02										5.02			5.10		6.31		5.36	
Neopart	237652	-										3w			stk		stk		8w	
4	1210087	98.55			100.33				118.37		98.55						145.98			
Coffman	237651	-			stk				30d		stk						9w			
3	2010058	33.25							55.52								66.15			33.25
Muncie	237649	-							stk								stk			unapproved part
3	710213	2,449.00									3,469.00		2,449.00				5,658.12			
Crossline Supply	237653	-									stk		stk				12w			
3	610097	250.00													250.00	250.00	383.84			
Kirks - tie breaker awardee	237656	-													stk	stk	stk			
1	610102	1,461.54																	1,461.54	
Eldorado	237659	-																	12w	
3	710244	172.95							178.18						179.04		172.95			
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-							75d						10w		24w			
5	2110028	1,999.04							2,667.29			2,356.85			2,475.00		2,531.10			1,999.04
Neopart	237652	-							21d			4w			stk		stk			unapproved part
1	710247	613.67																	613.67	
Eldorado	237659	-																	10w	
1	610109	108.65																	108.65	
Eldorado	237659	-																	stk	
4	710281	23.62							67.44						69.15		98.50		23.62	
Eldorado	237659	-							30d						stk		stk		stk	
5	1210119	1,889.25			1,926.03				2,333.53		1,889.25		1,899.00				2,626.19			
Coffman	237651	-			stk				30d		stk		stk				9w			

	Pace		RFQ# 424843																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	P&G	Interstate Power	Cummins	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Triangle Radiator	Muncie	A&A Auto	Coffman	Neopart	Crossline Supply	CBM	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Eldorado	Mohawk
1	1710083	789.31															789.31			
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-															7w			
2	410103	33.33															33.33		34.22	
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-															5w		4w	
4	2110155	3,655.75							4,004.43			3,655.75					4,032.00			4,808.73
Neopart	237652	-							60d			4w					48w			4w
5	2110157	2,721.49							3,060.27			2,721.49			3,176.54		3,081.27			3,658.98
Neopart	237652	-							21d			4w			12w		stk			3w
3	170105	35.60							35.60						35.72		43.20			
Muncie	237649	-							stk						stk		stk			
3	1210132	671.50							974.26						736.44		671.50			
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-							stk						stk		stk			
5	1010076	138.04			140.39				165.78		138.04						192.38			184.65
Coffman	237651	-			stk				stk		stk						9w			30d
6	410128	759.67				761.25			823.23			759.67				760.41	1,093.51			841.20
Neopart	237652	-				3w			30d			4w				stk	5w			4w
2	710404	196.14													197.25		196.14			
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-													4w		7w			
5	810389	449.00			476.14				733.51		467.80		449.00				678.21			
Crossline Supply	237653	-			stk				30d		stk		stk				9w			
3	2110239	426.02							459.91								690.69	426.02		
Midwest Transit	237658	-							60d								21w	16w		
2	2110254	70.63							80.98			70.63								
Neopart	237652	-							60d			4w								
2	810412	4,406.81									4,406.81						6,903.27			
Coffman	237651	-									stk						9w			
7	1210161	56.11				73.59			70.11		58.87						92.13	57.81	56.11	57.13

	Pace		RFQ# 424843																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids																				
	Sku	Winning bid	P&G	Interstate Power	Cummins	Vehicle Maintenance	Suburban Truck	Triangle Radiator	Muncie	A&A Auto	Coffman	Neopart	Crossline Supply	CBM	Gillig	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Eldorado	Mohawk
Eldorado	237659	-				stk			stk		stk						9w	2w	6w	stk
3	2110278	464.97							499.22								624.99	464.97		
Midwest Transit	237658	-							60d								22w	10w		
1	1210167	1,170.49															1,170.49			
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-															stk			
3	810460	5,397.00			8,306.69						5,397.00						7,500.54			
Coffman	237651	-			122d						150d						9w			
1	1710174	800.00																	800.00	
Eldorado	237659	-																	10w	
1	1810115	6,896.40															6,896.40			
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-															7w			
3	610213	578.09							578.09						585.00		607.76			
Muncie	237649	-							stk						stk		10w			
1	1810127	107.20															107.20			
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-															16w			
2	2110315	6,171.80															8,518.26	6,171.80		
Midwest Transit	237658	-															6w	11w		
3	2110317	157.72							169.31						157.72		213.32			
Gillig	237655	-							75d						stk		27w			
2	810544	8.65														8.65	55.03			
Kirks	237656	-														stk	9w			
4	1310069	2.00		3.14					2.00		2.68						5.41			
Muncie	237649	-		stk					stk		stk						stk			
4	810566	262.70			266.66				321.21		262.70						398.70			
Coffman	237651	-			stk				30d		stk						9w			
1	810567	329.99															329.99			
Aftermarket Parts	237657	-															3w			

[illegible]